
Request approval to establish a Sole Source Consultant Services Agreement with the California 
Institute for Mental Health for training, consultation, and technical assistance on mental health 
services.

SUBJECT

June 15, 2010

The Honorable Board of Supervisors
County of Los Angeles
383 Kenneth Hahn Hall of Administration
500 West Temple Street 
Los Angeles, California 90012
 
Dear Supervisors:

AUTHORIZATION FOR A SOLE SOURCE CONSULTANT SERVICES AGREEMENT WITH 
CALIFORNIA INSTITUTE FOR MENTAL HEALTH 

FOR TRAINING, CONSULTATION AND TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE 
ON MENTAL HEALTH SERVICES

(ALL SUPERVISORIAL DISTRICTS)
(3 VOTES)

IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOUR BOARD:

1. Approve and instruct the Director of Mental Health, or his designee, to prepare, sign, and execute 
a Sole Source Consultant Services Renewal Agreement (Agreement), substantially similar to 
Attachment I, with California Institute for Mental Health (CIMH).  The renewal term is for three fiscal 
years, effective July 1, 2010 through June 30, 2013.  The Total Compensation Amount (TCA) is 
$1,011,900 for Fiscal Year (FY) 2010-11, $392,400 for FY 2011-12, and $388,000 for FY 2012-13, 
respectively, fully-funded with Mental Health Services Act (MHSA) funds, Intrafund Transfers from 
the Department of Public Social Services (DPSS), Department of Children and Family Services 
(DCFS), Probation Department (Probation), and the Substance Abuse Mental Health Services 
Administration (SAMHSA).  The total TCA for three years is $1,792,300 (Attachment I, Exhibit B).

2. Delegate authority to the Director of Mental Health, or his designee, to prepare, sign, and execute 
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future Amendments to the Consultant Agreement with CIMH, and establish as a new TCA the 
aggregate of the original Agreement and all Amendments, provided that: 1) the County’s total 
payments to CIMH for each fiscal year does not exceed an increase of 20 percent from the 
applicable revised Board-approved TCA; 2) any such increase is used to provide additional services 
or to reflect program and/or policy changes; 3) your Board has appropriated sufficient funds for all 
changes; 4) approval of County Counsel and the Chief Executive Officer (CEO), or their respective 
designees, is obtained prior to any such Amendment; 5) County and CIMH may by written 
Amendment reduce services or programs without reference to the 20 percent limitation and revise 
the applicable TCA; and 6) the Director of Mental Health notifies your Board of Agreement changes 
in writing within 30 days after execution of each Amendment. 

PURPOSE/JUSTIFICATION OF RECOMMENDED ACTION

Board approval of the recommended actions is required to renew a Sole Source Consultant Services 
Agreement with CIMH which is scheduled to expire on June 30, 2010.  
 
On June 16, 2009, your Board approved DMH’s request for a 12-month contract extension with 
CIMH to conduct a competitive solicitation process for consultant services during FY 2010 -11 
(Attachment II).  After a thorough analysis of each of the projects under the Agreement, the 
Department decided not to carry out its original plan of solicitation as stated last year.

The overall reason was that DMH identified that CIMH was the only agency that met the specific 
qualification requirements necessary to provide all services, as every project was developed by 
CIMH.  It was subsequently determined that no other agency would be as able to effectively respond 
to a Request for Proposal for such specialized services.

The term renewal will enable the Department of Mental Health (DMH) to continue engaging CIMH for 
the provision of critical training and consultation services on issues related to the planning and 
refinement of DMH’s MHSA programs, as well as technical assistance on mental health and 
substance abuse-related issues.  

Additionally, it will support the Department’s continued collaboration with DPSS, DCFS and 
Probation in serving individuals participating in community-based programs under: 1) California Work 
Opportunity and Responsibility to Kids (CalWORKs); 2) Functional Family Therapy Training and 
Consultation Services; 3) Substance Abuse Mental Health Services Administration; 4) Katie A. 
Settlement Agreement Foster Care Children; and 5) Enhanced Specialized Foster Care Children.

Implementation of Strategic Plan Goals

The recommended actions support the County’s Strategic Plan Goal 1, Operational Effectiveness, 
Goal 2, Children, Family and Adult Well-Being, and Goal 4, Health and Mental Health. 

FISCAL IMPACT/FINANCING

There is no net County cost. 
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The TCA for FYs 2010-13 is $1,792,300, which will be fully-funded by MHSA funds, Intrafund 
Transfers from DCFS, DPSS, and Probation, and SAMHSA federal block grant.  The FY 2010-11 
TCA of $1,011,900 is included in DMH’s 2010-11 Proposed Budget (Attachment I, Exhibit B).

FACTS AND PROVISIONS/LEGAL REQUIREMENTS

CIMH is a private, non-profit agency established by the California Mental Health Director’s 
Association (CMHDA) in 1993 to promote excellence in California’s public mental health services 
system.  As one of the most recognized leaders in California, and the only agency in California with a 
Statewide role in supporting the public mental health system through technical assistance, research, 
policy development, and evidence-based practices (EBPs), CIMH addresses the needs of the 
mentally ill and provides leadership and support to County, State, and national organizations.  It 
emphasizes to academic/research institutes and foundations to document, address, and reduce or 
eliminate disparities within the public mental health system.  Through its efforts and various 
collaborations, CIMH has been successful in implementing its vision of wellness, resiliency, recovery, 
and full community integration of services for adults, children, and families dealing with mental health 
and substance abuse-related issues.  

CIMH is the one mental health agency that has an established Center for Multicultural Development 
designed to improve access and services within the community mental health system for ethnically 
and culturally diverse communities, and a Co-Occurring Disorders (COD) Technical Assistance 
Center established to provide education and training services to agencies serving individuals with co-
occurring mental health and substance abuse disorders.

Board approval of the recommended actions will allow CIMH to continue providing   consultant 
services for the following seven (7) projects:  

I.     CalWORKs

CIMH has assisted DMH in evaluating the CalWORKs mental health service system since 2003. 
Their work has proceeded in three stages: 1) commencement of a series of annual studies 
examining clinical and CalWORKs outcomes, as well as exploration of underlying factors behind 
relatively low completion and employment rates; 2) development of a series of recommendations to 
DMH and DPSS on effective methods of system transformation; and 3)creation of an evaluation 
plan, which includes instruments and a reporting system for the new service design. The upcoming 
renewal contract will allow the implemention of this evaluation system, where anticipated services to 
be performed are not new but rather a continuation of the existing project.

II.     Functional Family Therapy (FFT) Training and Consultation

CIMH has established relationships with practice developers and has extensive experience 
successfully assisting counties in  California in implementing EBPs for improving outcomes for 
children and families.  The relationship between CIMH and the FFT National Training Center 
emphasizes on-going staff development, interagency linking, and program expansion.  Due to their 
unique position with assisting California counties, CIMH is able to offer the necessary on-going 
training consultation and quality assurance at a much more cost effective rate than if it were 
procured by individual counties.  To date, CIMH has completed trainings for FFT Phase I and Phase 
II.  The renewal will enable CIMH to continue the FFT Phase III implementation which is necessary 
to ensure on-going support for model adherence and self-sufficiency.  Phase III requirements are 
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renewed annually, and the base of oversight and consultation is considered necessary by the FFT 
National Training Center for a site to be considered model adherent.  

III.     MHSA Consultant Services

CIMH provides expert technical assistance through training, research and policy development.  Their 
unique qualifications and widespread recognition in legislative arenas has enabled them to become 
the SDMH primary training entity in complex Statewide projects, such as the implementation of 
Managed Care and the Mental Health Services Act.  CIMH continues to be instrumental in 
implementing a continuously evolving vision of a community-based mental health system to ensure 
the accessibility of quality mental health services for individuals and their families.  Their focus is 
helping organizations like DMH, to bridge the gap between research and implementation of local 
systems of care, as well as supporting the development and study of effective EBPs.

IV.     Katie A. Trauma Focused Cognitive Behavioral Treatment (TF-CBT) and Core Practice Model

As a result of helping counties develop system of care services, CIMH launched a strategic initiative 
to promote the adoption of EBPs by county-operated mental health plans, probation departments, 
and child welfare agencies throughout California.  CIMH developed the Community Development 
Team (CDT) training, a unique technical assistance model designed to promote the sustainable 
model-adherent implementation of EBPs by public sector mental health, juvenile justice and child 
welfare agencies, and private providers.  The CDT model is the subject of a recently awarded 
research grant from the National Institute of Mental Health (NIMH).  CIMH has established 
relationships with practice developers and has successfully assisted counties implement EBPs with 
their child welfare populations.  To this endeavor, CIMH is uniquely qualified to provide the 
consultation, training and technical assistance needed to improve mental health programs and 
services.

V.     SAMHSA Co-Occurring Disorders Technical Assistance Center

In FY 2008-09, SDMH awarded DMH a one-time SAMHSA allocation of $327,000 for the 
development of a Statewide Co-Occurring Disorders (COD) Technical Assistance Center, 
designating CIMH to be its contractor.  On March 30, 2010, your Board approved a FY 2009-10 Sole 
Source Amendment with CIMH for the project, authorizing SAMHSA funding in the amount of 
$163,500.  CIMH has begun developing a Statewide website containing COD resource information 
and a member services directory to share treatment strategies.  

The renewal will enable CIMH to continue the development project.  CIMH will conduct Statewide 
regional trainings on integrated and specialized COD services, and compile data on evidence-based 
and promising practices for serving people with co-occurring disorders.
 
The COD Technical Assistance Center will provide education and training services to agencies 
serving those with co-occurring mental health and substance abuse disorders.  The goal is to bring 
recovery and wellness to COD clients by enabling and educating all levels of provider organizations, 
including managers/administrators, supervisors, direct services providers, consumers and family 
members.

VI.     SAMHSA Co-Occurring Joint Action Council (COJAC)
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Since Spring 2005, CIMH has been involved with SAMHSA in implementing the co-occurring 
disorders (COD) State Action Plan for California.  CIMH is a member of the Co-Occurring Joint 
Action Council (COJAC), a forum which solicits input and works towards facilitating forward-
movement of the State Action Plan.  During FY 2005-06, DMH accepted the SAMHSA federal block 
grant award from SDMH in the amount of $20,000, an annual allocation that allows CIMH to serve on 
the COJAC.  CIMH supports the COJAC by organizing council meetings, following up on action 
items with individual council members, and reporting on action items to the full council.  The 
Agreement renewal will enable CIMH to continue to provide on-going data, best practices, and 
guidance to COJAC in identifying and establishing Statewide COD funding.

VII.     Long Beach Child and Adolescent - Functional Family Therapy

As a highly outcome-oriented and specialized mental health approach, the standard training protocol 
for FFT requires weekly supervision/consultation as well as monthly consultation meetings with 
CIMH trainers. 

During FY 2007-08, the Long Beach Child and Adolescent Program (Program) engaged in FFT team 
training with CIMH, and has since completed its Phase I training that allows the Program to deliver 
FFT services.  The proposed training agenda for FY 2010-13 will cover the CIMH services related to 
completing the next two phases of training, as well as the training of new staff.  Additional services 
from CIMH are necessary for the clinic to continue providing valuable EBPs to children and families 
of those who are seriously emotionally disturbed.  This concurrently prevents the misuse of costly 
staff time already committed during the first phase of training. 

The Agreement has been approved as to form by County Counsel.  The CEO has reviewed the 
proposed actions.  The Statement of Work (Attachment I, Exhibit A) contained in the Agreement 
details specific training and technical assistance requirements from CIMH.

The required Sole Source Contract Checklist, which identifies and justifies the need for a Sole 
Source contract renewal, has been approved by the CEO (Attachment III).

CONTRACTING PROCESS

In accordance with your Board’s contracting policy requirements for Sole Source contracts, DMH 
notified your Board on March 31, 2010 of its intent to enter into a Sole Source Renewal Agreement 
with CIMH (Attachment IV). 

Upon your Board’s approval, DMH will renew the Consultant Services Agreement with CIMH for a 
term of three years, effective July 1, 2010 through June 30, 2013.

IMPACT ON CURRENT SERVICES (OR PROJECTS)

This contract renewal with CIMH ensures uninterrupted provision of quality consultant services to 
DMH and its contract providers serving the mentally ill population of the Los Angeles County.  The 
synergy of training, consultation, and technical assistance is expected to significantly enhance the 
Department’s mental health services provision to the clients being served.
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Respectfully submitted,

MARVIN J. SOUTHARD, D.S.W.

Director

MJS:MM:RK

Enclosures

c: Chief Executive Officer
 County Counsel
 Executive Officer, Board of Supervisors
 Chairperson, Mental Health Commission
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