


ORDINANCE NO.

An ordinance amending Title 30 — Residential Code of the Los Angeles County

Code, by adopting the 2013 California Residential Code by reference, with certain

changes and modifications.

The Board of Supervisors of the County of Los Angeles ordains as follows:

SECTION 1. Chapters 2 through 10, Chapter 44, and Appendix H, which

incorporate by reference and modify portions of the 2010 California Residential Code,

are .hereby repealed.

SECTION 2. Chapter 1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R100 ADOPTION BY REFERENCE

Except as hereinafter changed or modified, Sections 102 through 119 of

Chapter 1, Section 1207 of Chapter 12, Chapters 34, 67, 69, 98, 99, and Appendix J of

Title 26 of the Los Angeles County Code are adopted by reference and incorporated

into this Title 30 as if fully set forth below, and shall be known as Sections 102 through

119 of Chapter 1, Section 1207 of Chapter 12, Chapters 34, 67, 69, 98, 99, and

Appendix J of Title 30 of the Los Angeles County Code.

Except as hereinafter changed or modified, Chapters 2 through 10, Chapter 44,

and Appendix H of that certain code known and designated as the ~8a-82013 California

Residential Code as published by the California Building Standards Commission are

adopted by reference and incorporated into this Title 30 as if fully. set forth below, and

HOA.1009141.1



shall be known as Chapters 2 through 10, Chapter 44, and Appendix H of Title 30 of

the Los Angeles County Code.

A copy of the ~8a-92013 California Residential Code shall be at all times

maintained by the Building Official for use and examination by the public.

SECTION 3. Section R301.1.3.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R301.1.3.2 Woodframe structures ̂ r°~+o.. +~,., +,.,,,_~+,,...o~.

The bBuilding eOfficial shall require construction documents to be approved and

stamped by a California licensed architect or engineer for all dwellings of woodframe

construction more than two stories and basement in height located in Seismic Design

Category A, B, or C. Notwithstanding other sections, the law establishing these

provisions is found in Business and Professions Code sections 5537 and 6737.1.

The Building Official shall require construction documents to be approved and

stamped by a California licensed architect or engineer for all dwellings of woodframe

construction more than one story in height or with a basement located in Seismic

Design Category Do D~, or D2.

SECTION 4. Section R301.1.4 is hereby added to read as follows:

R301.1.4 Seismic design provisions for buildings constructed on

or into slopes steeper than one unit vertical in three units horizontal (33.3 percent

slo e .

The design and construction of new buildings and additions to existing buildings

when constructed on or into slopes steeper than one unit vertical in three units

HOA.1009141.1 2



horizontal (33.3 percent slope) shall comply with Section 1613.7 of the

Los Angeles County Building Code.

SECTION 5. Section R301.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R301.2 Climatic and geographic design criteria.

Buildings shall be constructed in accordance with the provisions of this sCode as

limited by the provisions of this Section.

Consult with the Building Official regarding additional

criteria in Table R301.2(1).

SECTION 6. Section R301.2.2.2.5 is hereby amended to read as follows:.

R301.2.2.2.5 Irregular buildings.

1. When exterior shear wall lines or braced wall panels are not in one plane

vertically from the foundation to the uppermost story in which they are required.

HOA.1009141.1 3



2. When a section of floor or roof is not laterally supported by shear walls or

braced wall lines on all edges.

Exception: Portions of floors that do not support shear walls or braced wall

panels above, or roofs, shall be permitted to extend no more than 6 feet (1829 mm)

beyond a shear wall or braced wall line.

3. When the end of a braced wall panel occurs over an opening in the wall

below and ends at a horizontal distance greater than 1 foot (305 mm) from the edge of

the opening. This provision is applicable to shear walls and braced wall, panels offset in

plane and to braced wall panels offset out of plane as permitted by the exception to Item

1 above.

HOA.1009141.1



•

--=

.~.:.~e...,.:..: e - - -

4. When an opening in a floor or roof exceeds the lesser of 12 feet

(3658 mm) or 50 percent of the least floor or roof dimension.

5. When portions of a floor level are vertically offset.

:.:._.._,:::,~ ::~.,.,. ~,.e.: ~ .ter,:._ — — .::..a.~:_.__ ~,.~a,.~-!

HOA.1009141.1 rJ



SECTION 7. Section R301.2.2.3.8 is hereby added to read as follows:

R301.2.2.3.8 Anchorage of mechanical, electrical, or plumbing

components and equipment.

Mechanical, electrical, or plumbing components and equipment shall be

anchored to the structure. Anchorage of the components and equipment shall be

designed to resist loads in accordance with the Los Angeles County Building Code and

ASCE 7, except where the component is positively attached to the structure and flexible

connections are provided between the component and associated ductwork, piping, and

conduit; and either:

1. The component weighs 400 Ib (1,780 N) or less and has a center of mass

located 4 ft (1.22 m) or less above the supporting structure; or

2. The component weighs 20 Ib (89N) or less or, in the. case of a distributed

system, 5 Ib/ft (73 N/m) or less.

SECTION 8. Table R302.1(2) is hereby amended by deleting Footnote a,

as follows:

'3'348~.~ ft3U2.1 2
~X~Ef3t~3R'WALt[}'I!~£LL~t~~SAAi[AAC~E'SSti7~t!'~~ILITfNGSi~'fTH ' T?IGRE~fi~ETst1`l;4L

E7CERIOR WALL EL:El~EHT
A9INI1NiJ14E

F1RE~tE8k4TAM~E AAI7FIG
F~EA~A+1tIM Fi€!~

~EPARATIQN! [3~TAttC~

Fire-r~~s~~a~c~ c~t~!
i hour—t~;sfcii i~ :c~rd~n~e ~uith.AS'i`ltt ~ ~~e

t~~tls 119~c t7i~2ti3 wtitpcuurr frc~~az t~se+~utsis~e

~€~c r~ ~: ~~ ~~t r~ rya t~ muss 3 ~ ~~-

T'i,~i,
~ire-~,.; ~~n.ar~z~i thcnrronth~u~,~t~r•~ae ~f~t[

.i[c~n,
I''~u~ tso •.' i . ~ciStffiIC~ YE[I~C1 {} httul'S .~ fG~~-

~}( fil
~.;."~•~~~titiY&'~. Tai';°t ~ ~ f C.l;.

€l41k~5 W~~~,+
~R~:[Yl1llit~ ~t ~ttWCS - ~ ~i~Y"

~.'1.)Y13~~~? ~V'l~~i ~Y'd;CfC3F1 ~~~'Ai:~ ~ ~ ~.~.CS~'~

R.Y3tiS TL'KjU7XE~. ~ ~~L`~"

HOA.1009141.1 6



SECTION 9. Section R322.2.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R322.2.2 Enclosed area below design flood elevation.

Enclosed areas for attached and detached buildings and structures, including

crawl spaces, that are below the design flood elevation shall:

SECTION 10. Section R327.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.1.1 Scope.

This eChapter applies to building materials, systems and or assemblies used in

the exterior design and construction of new buildings and to additions alterations or

repairs made to existing buildings, erected, constructed, located, or moved within a

Wildland-Urban Interface Fire Area as defined in Section R327.2.

SECTION 11. Section R327.1.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.1.3 Application.

New buildings, and any additions, alterations, or repairs made to existing

buildings located in or moved within any Fire Hazard Severity Zone or any Wildland-

Urban Interface Fire Area designated by the Los Angeles County Fire

HOA.1009141.1 7



Department constructed -after the application date shall comply with the provisions of

this sChapter.

Exceptions:

SECTION 12. Section R327.1.3.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.1.3.1 Application date and where required.

New buildings for which an application for a building permit is submitted on or

after July 1, 2008, and any additions, alterations, or repairs made to existing buildings

for which an application for a building permit is submitted on or after January 1, 2014,

located in any Fire Hazard Severity Zone or Wildland Interface Fire Area shall comply

with all Sections of this 6Chapter, including all of the following areas:

Exceptions:

1. Buildings located in any Fire Hazard Severity Zone within State

Responsibility Areas, for which an application for a building permit is submitted on or

after January 1, 2008, shall comply with all sSections of this eChapter.

2. bBuildings located in any Fire Hazard Severity Zone within State

Responsibility Areas or any Wildland Interface Fire Area designated by cities and other

local agencies for which an application for a building permit is submitted on or after

HOA.1009141.1



December 1, 2005 but prior to July 1, 2008, shall only comply with the following

sSections of this sChapter:

SECTION 13. Section R327.1.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.1.4 Inspection and certification.

1. Building permit issuance. The ~a-~bBuilding eOfficial shall, prior to

construction, provide the owner or applicant a certification that the building as proposed

to be built complies with all applicable state and local building standards, including

those for materials and construction methods for wildfire exposure as described in this

Chapter. Issuance of a building permit by the ~esaa- Building eOfficial for the proposed

building shall be considered as complying with this sSection.

2. Building permit final. The ~ecaa- Building eOfficial shall, upon completion

of construction, provide the owner or applicant with a copy of the final inspection report

that demonstrates the building was constructed in compliance with all applicable state

and local building standards, including those for materials. and construction methods for

wildfire exposure as described in this Chapter. I"ssuance of a certificate of occupancy

by the bBuilding eOfficial for the proposed building shall be considered as

complying with this sSection.

SECTION 14. Section R327.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

HOA.1009141.1 9



SECTION R327.2

DEFINITIONS

FIRE PROTECTION PLAN is a document prepared for a specific project or

development proposed for a Wildland-Urban Interface Fire Area. It describes ways to

minimize and mitigate potential for loss from wildfire exposure. The fire protection plan

shall be in accordance with this sChapter and the ~ti~i#e~r~+aLos Angeles County Fire

Code, Title 32, Chapter 49. When required by the enforcing agency for the purposes of

granting modifications, a fire protection plan shall be submitted.

FIRE HAZARD SEVERITY ZONES are geographical areas designated pursuant

to California Public Resources Code Sections 4201 through 4204 and classified as Very

High, High, or Moderate in State Responsibility Areas or as Local Agency Very High

Fire Hazard Severity Zones designated pursuant to California Government Code

sections 51175 through 51189. See ~ti~#e~iaLos Angeles County Fire Code1 ̂~*

~6Chapter 49.

HEAVY TIMBER. A type of construction classification specified in Section 602 of

the Gali#er-~iaLos Angeles County Building Code. For use in this EChapter, heavy

timber shall be sawn lumber or glue laminated wood with the smallest minimum nominal

HOA.1009141.1



dimension of 4 inches (102 mm). Heavy Timber walls or floors shall be sawn or glue-

laminated planks splined, tongue-and-grove, or set close together and well spiked.

WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE FIRE AREA is a geographical area identified

by the state as a "Fire Hazard Severity Zone" in accordance with the Public Resources

Code sections 4201 through 4204 and Government Code sections 51175 through

51189, or other areas designated by the e~#e~e+r~g-~ Los Angeles County Fire

Department to be at a significant risk from wildfires.

SECTION 15. Section R327.3.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.3.2 Qualification by testing.

Material and material assemblies tested in accordance with the requirements of

Section ~A3l~R327.3 shall be accepted for use when the results and conditions of those

tests are met. Product evaluation testing of material and material assemblies shall be

approved or listed by the State Fire Marshal, the Building Official or identified in a

current report issued by an approved agency.

SECTION 16. Section R327.3.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.3.3 Approved agency.

Product evaluation testing shall be performed by an approved agency as defined

in Section 1702 of the ~e~+aLos Angeles County Building Code. The scope of

accreditation for the approved agency shall include building product compliance with

sCode.

SECTION 17. Section R327.3.5.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

HOA.1009141.1 11



R327.3.5.2 Weathering.

~ ~ 
_ 1 _ i - ~~~ a i~ ~ ~~~~~~f i~~~:l~~~l~~~~l~~\A;~'~'~~~~~~

<V~11~1~~I~[~i~1~1~~.4,;i-TV

shall meet the fire test performance requirements of this sChapter after being subjected

to the weathering conditions contained in the following standards, as applicable to the

materials and the conditions of use.

SECTION 18. Section R327.3.5.2.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.3.5.2.1 Fire-retardant-treated wood.

Fire-retardant-treated wood shall be tested in accordance with ASTM D2898,

"Standard Practice for Accelerated Weathering of Fire-Retardant Treated Wood for Fire

Testing (Method A)" and the requirements of sSection 2303.2.

SECTION 19. Section R327.3.5.2.2 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

.• --

SECTION 20. Section R327.3.6 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.3.6 Alternates for materials, design, tests and methods of

construction.

The ~n{~r~~~ry °ry°̂ ^~~Building Official is permitted to modify the provisions of this

eChapter for site-specific conditions in accordance with Chapter 1, Section

~-a- ?4104.2.7. When required by the ~ Building Official for the

HOA.1009141.1 ~ 2



purposes of granting modifications, a fire protection plan shall be submitted in

accordance with the ~:~4i#e~iaLos Angeles County Fire Code, Chapter 49.

SECTION 21. Section R327.4.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.4.3 Alternative methods for determining Ignition-resistant

material.

2. ~ Fire-retardant-treated wood. Fire-retardant-treated wood identified for

exterior use that complies with the requirements of Section 2303.2 of the

~ti~i#e~+aLos Angeles Countx Building Code.

SECTION 22. Section R327.5.2. is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.5.2 Roof coverings.

Roof coverings shall be Class A as specified in Section R902.1. Where the roof

profile allows a space between the roof covering and roof decking, the spaces shall be

constructed to prevent the intrusion of flames and embers, be firestopped with approved

materials or have one layer of minimum 72 pounds (32.4 kg) mineral-surfaced non_

perforated cap sheet complying with ASTM D 3909 installed over the combustible

decking. Wood shingles and wood shakes are prohibited in any Fire Hazard Severity

Zones regardless of classification.

HOA.1009141.1 ~ 3



SECTION 23.

R327.6.1

Section R327.6.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

General.

Where provided, ventilation openings for enclosed attics, enclosed eave soffit

spaces, enclosed rafter spaces formed where ceilings are applied directly to the

underside of roof rafters, and underfloor ventilation shall be in accordance with

Section 1203 of the ~:~~Los Angeles County Building Code and sSections

R327.6.1 through R327.6.3 of this Section to resist building ignition from the intrusion

of burning embers and flame through the ventilation opening.

SECTION 24. Section R327.6.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.6.3 Ventilation openings on the underside of eaves and

cornices.

Exceptions:

1. The °`~fnrnir~~v ~nonn~iguilding Official may accept or approve special eave

and cornice vents that resist the intrusion of flame and burning embers.

2. Vents complying with the requirements of Section R327.6.2 may be

installed on the underside of eaves and cornices in accordance with either one of the

following conditions:

2.1. The attic space being ventilated is fully protected by an

automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 of the

~:~~iiaLos Angeles County Building Code or,

HOA.1009141.1 14



SECTION 25. Section R327.10.3.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.10.3.2 When required by the ~ ,}eras-y~Buildinq Official,

detached accessory structures within 50 feet of an applicable building shall comply with

the requirements of this sSection.

SECTION 26. Section R327.10.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.10.4 Requirements.

When required by the anfnrninrr ~non,.,,guilding Official, accessory structures

shall be constructed of noncombustible or ignition-resistant materials.

SECTION 27. Section R401.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R401.1 Application.

Wood foundations in Seismic Design Category Do, D~, or D2 shall h° ~°c~̂ °̂~ ~^

- - :.~.~~j: ~ • - • - - ~

Exception: In non-occupied, single-story, detached storage sheds and similar

uses other than carport or garage, provided the gross floor area does not exceed 200

square feet, the plate height does not exceed 12 feet in height above the grade plane at

any point, and the maximum roof projection does not exceed 24 inches.

SECTION 28. Section R403.1.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R403.1.2 Continuous footing in Seismic Design Categories Do, D~

and D2.

The braced wall panels at exterior walls of buildings located in Seismic Design

Categories Do, D~ and D2 shall be supported by continuous footings. All required

HOA.1009141.1 15



-}-shall a~-s~be supported by continuous footings.

SECTION 29. Section R403.1.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R403.1.3 Seismic reinforcing.

Exception: In detached one-and two-family dwellings located in Seismic Design

Category. A, B, or C which are three stories or less in height and constructed

with stud bearing walls, isolated plain concrete footings, supporting columns or

pedestals are permitted.

SECTION 30. Section R403.1.5 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R403.1.5 Slope.

The top surface of footings shall be level. The bottom surface of footings shall be

permitted to have a slope not exceeding one unit vertical in 10 units horizontal

(10-percent slope). Footings shall be stepped where it is necessary to change the

elevation of the top surface of the footing or where the surface of the ground slopes

more than one unit vertical in 10 units horizontal (10-percent slope).

For structures located in Seismic Design Categories Do, ~~, or Dz, stepped

footings shall be reinforced with two No. 4 reinforcing bars located at the top and bottom

of the footings as shown in Figure R403.1.5.

SECTION 31. Figure R403.1.5 is hereby added to read as follows:

HOA.1009141.1 ~ 6



RECQMMEND: a > b
b~2~~„

., nnini ~ un ncinrr~nni.in gARr~,

TTOM)

FIGU~ R~Q3.1.5
STEPI?ED ~~'OI~TINC=

(TYP.

aRADE

SECTION 32. Section R404.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R404.2 Wood foundation walls.

Wood foundation walls shall be constructed in accordance with the provisions of

Sections R404.2.1 through R404.2.6 and with the details shown in Figures R403.1(2)

and R403.1(3). Wood foundation walls shall not be used for structures located in

Seismic Design Category Do D~, or D2.

SECTION 33. Section R501.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R501.1 Application.

The provision of this eChapter shall control the design and construction of the

floors for all buildings including the floors of attic spaces used to house mechanical or

plumbing fixtures and equipment. Mechanical or plumbing fixtures and equipment shall

be attached or anchored to the structure in accordance with Section R301.2.2.3.8.

SECTION 34. Section R503.2.4 is hereby added to read as follows:

HOA.1009141.1 ~ 7



R503.2.4 Openings in horizontal diaphragms.

Openings in horizontal diaphragms with a dimension perpendicular to the joist

that is greater than 4 feet (1.2 m) shall be constructed in accordance with Figure

R503.2.4.

~~ ~~~~:

' ,: ~ ~~' ~"` c~~ ~~r~r}

DOUBLE JOISTS, TYP. ~`~ }., = ~ ,~, ,-l~ , p , ̀s r -~ .
,~r jr , - r ~r '~

~~~ ~~ ~~ P~ y r ~~

~P / 1y ' '~ t
~~'~ ~~ ~~~ y. ~~~ ~ p ~1~J 3

'I `~ J' .w~v f /~ l ~/ oyr'.s

~' ~.,- f ~. ~" d ~ 1 X fir dr fyt,- ~ =r'

~E t, r~ ~~~t ~~~ ~ fpm+' ~~^^ ~~~'~` 
~~y

`' ~ r

ht'~Ti+E. T1~ ~tIQA.~r~ ~ as 4` lk~.. ~~ T{~7' 9.)
4~Jf tt~Fi6~G`C~ktt1s14~1t~r't~1 ~~

t,~1'~."~f~~t ,xti,~2`~~ I ~1~~ar Ifs,,

Notes:

a. Blockings shall be provided beyond headers.

b. Metal ties not less than 0.058 inch [1.47 mm (16 galvanized gage)] by 1.5

inches (38 mm) wide with eight 16d common nails on each side of the header joist

intersection. The metal ties shall have a minimum yield of 33,000 psi (227 MPa).

HOA.1009141.1



...:., ,

c. Openings in diaphragms shall be further limited in accordance with

Section R301.2.2.2.5.

FIGURE R503.2.4

OPENING IN HORIZONTAL DIAPHRAGMS

SECTION 35. Section R602.3.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R602.3.2 Top plate.

Exception: In-other than Seismic Design Category Do D~ or D,, aR single top

plate may be installed in stud walls, provided the plate is adequately tied at joints,

corners and intersecting walls by a minimum 3-inch-by-6-inch by a 0.036-inch-thick (76

mm by 152 mm by 0.914 mm) galvanized steel plate that is nailed to each wall or

segment of wall by six 8d nails on each side, provided the rafters or joists are centered

over the studs with a tolerance of no more than 1 inch (25 mm). The top plate may be

omitted over lintels that are adequately tied to adjacent wall sections with steel plates or

equivalent as previously described.

SECTION 36. Table R602.3(1) is hereby amended to read as follows:

TABLE R602.3(1)

FASTENER SCHEDULE FOR STRUCTURAL MEMBERS

HOA.1009141.1 19



TABLE X2602.3(1#
F7kSTENER SCFIEDtlLE FOR STRUCTURAL MEMBERS

ITEM OESGRN+7IDN OF 81d1LDIW[t ElFAAEtilB
~ftr18ER 'TYRE OF

FA9T~NER`'~a ~+/1CING~FA$TENE~

Rood

1 Blac~eing b~.we,~n joie~s ~ setters to top plate, tc~c nail 3-8d (~'f2" x 4.113'7 —

2 Ceiling,~ui~s 1a plate', tae isail 3-Sd {2'!Z° x 0.113' —

3 ~eiliag jafsts not affect fa peratlel ratl~; laps uv~pazfii-
~ions, face nail 3-YQd —

~4 CoDartie torahs, facenail or 1 l4" x ~4 gag ridge strap 3-104(3"x 0.128" —

S Rafter or mof t€~s to plate, the l
S-1Cx1 baanails (!'/~"x 0,135"
~ 3-itkt eammcm nails.

(~" x (F.I4B"~

2 tyre sails cu►~me side a~xt 1 toe nsi~ an
n~asite aide of'each ratter ~rius~

G Raafrat~staritige,vatteyorhipraticis:tuenaetf~ecasil
41&[ ~3'!~"x 0135
3-Y6c1~3'!â xU.135~ —

xrr
9 Bnilt-ap sq~lx-face nail 1Rid (3°x 0.128 y 7:4° oc.

S iAbnt6ing studs at intetitrg cva91 ctarners, facae nw'I 1i6d (3'l~' x0.135"} 12° oc.

9 Built up hemmer. two pieces with I="spacer ]bd (3 /a"x;1.f3~y IG°' n c. along e.~h edge

10 t~nn[~nue€I lr~l~, taro piers lbd {3'/~" x ~R.t35"~ ~6"' ~.c. al~g e~h edge

11 {:ontinu~e hea~~ in stud, tsac uaii 48c1(2'i2° x ~:113'~ ..--

12 Ilonbie studs, facetuait 10d (3°x 0.128 24"ac.

13 E?au6Iel~upplakes, Eaa~ nail I#IsE (3"xUt?S~ 24"oc.

14 €)a~l~fe tc~? Flames, minimum 24-inch atfs~t c~F' ead joint,
f~naiiniappe~J a~a.

B-lbd (3'1~° x D.135'~ —

13 5nleplefGiojoistaxlsiocking~~cenail iSd(3'/2"x~.135'~ lfi"o,c.

16 Soleplate iajoi~t ~ btockin~ at hcacsd wall paacls 3-l~tx! ~3I2°x 0.135' 16" ac.

i? Scud to sole plate, hie nail
3-&1 ~2'Ty" x 0.113'

or
—

i8 Top or sale date to stud, nffil 2-16e1(3'J~"x 0,135' -.-

19 ~P P~ ,GPs ai c~rne~as a wl rrYecsecflons, f nail 2-71kt (3"x 0.128' —

2U 1"lxace taeaeh stud anki plate. face nail
2-8d {2yz" x [F 11~'~

~ ~p~ 1'/,"
—
—

a~ ~r~s~n;,~,~c~~~,r~~►t ~~~grQq _

2~ 1"x 8"sheathing to e~fi 6eaz3ng, face Wait
z-sa c21r~° ~ ai.~13~

~ ~~$ ~~f4.
—
.._.

2~ Wic~tbsn 1'^x 8"st~cafhingto e~h bearing, face nail. q ~~ 1~~~» —

Floor

24 7aist fro sill r~r girder, Coe nail 3-$d ~(Z'/~° x OI.11.3'~ —

~5 Rim jp'sst to toga plate, toe nail. (roof ie~tim~s als~a) &i ~Z'!2° x U:113"~ b" o e.

26 Rim joist ~ blocking to sil! plat, tae nail 8d (2 ~3° x 4.1I3'~ 6" ~:c.

27 1"x b" aubflvor or Zees to e~hyaist, f~nail 2 ~Isp~s 1~/a" —

28 2" snbfloor t~ joist or girder, blin4l. aad face nail 2-lbd {3'f~" x D,1~5'ry —

29 2" Planks ~an1~ & 6eam - t1na~ & mof) 2-1fid {3'/2° x 0.135' at r, bearing

3iti Builta~p ginlers and Leams, 2-finch Iwnher layers IOd (3"x O.I28 ~
ATail eadtlayer~ f+oll6ws: 32"o.c. at
top aa~9 ba~t~m end staggra+ed.
Two nails at eaci~ and ~tcach splice..

31 I~esiS~`~P ~PI~►~I~sts cN raf~erx 3-lld{3'!~" x 0,t35~ Atcuc6 joistar ratit~r

(crnrtinurdj

HOA.1009141.1 2~



TABLE R602.3(1y—cor►tinued
FASTENER SCHEDULE FQR STRUGTtJRAL MEMBERS

SPACtNCi dF FdSTENERS
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF BUILOINCi MATERIALS DESCRiRTtON OF FASTEI+IERa"~• Edges Intermediate supportsG°

(9nch~ap (inc6~)

Wood s#uatural panels, subflaar, roof awl ~terior wall al~eething to framing an8 particleboard watt sheathing to framing

32 3 1
/s" _ ~a,•

6d cnmman {2" x 0.113' nail {subflaor wait}' 6 12
$

8d common {2 /̀Z" x 0.131' nail (roofj~

33 'q/~" -1" 8d common nail {2'/Z° x U,131'ry 6 12g

34 1r/~" - lr/~"
lOd camxnon (3" x O.i48"} naii or 6 12
Sd (2 /2" x 0.131' deformed nail

t3th~ wail aheaihing°

35 '!Z" at~ucbual cellulpsic 11Ia" galvanized roofinS nail, ~>~~"crown or 1" cmwn 3 6
fib~boarci sheathing staple 16 ga, 1 /,,"long.

36 '~!~" shuctcu~al cellulosic ~3~4~ galvanized roofing nail, "/,~"crown or 1"crown 3 6
fiberboard sheathing staple 16 ga., 1'/z"long

37~ '!a" gypsum sheathing°
1'12" galvanized roofing nail; staple galvanized, 7 7
1'/Z" Iong;1'14 scasews, Type W or S

38 ~- 5Ja" SYpsum sheaWingd
15/," galvanized moFmg nail; staple galvanized,
1 /g"Long; 1 /~ Type W 5

7 7
screws, or

Wood airtHC#ural panels, combination subflaor underieymsnt to framing

39 ~/4"and less ~ deformed {2" x 6.17A'~ nail or ~ ~ 2
sa ~a~on t~ ~2~ X o.~~i~ry ~a

44 / "-1"
8d common {2'/2^ x 0.131 "j nail or 6 12~
$d deformed t2'~Z•, x t}.12i}`~ mail

Al 1'/$" -1~/~"
1Qd carmm~n (3" x 0.1'48' nail or 6 12
Sd deformed {2'~Z•, x 4.120' nail

Far 3T: 1 i~h = 25,4 mm, l foot = 3g4.8 mm, l mile per hour = 0.447 ml~; l 7Csi = 6.893 IuIPa.

a. Al[ nails are smooth-common, box or deformed shanks except where otherwi~ stated. Nails used for flaming and sheffihing connections shell have minimum
average bending yield strengths as shown: 80 ksi foe Shan& diameter of 0.192 ineh (2(M common nail), 9D ksi for shank diarttaters Jaeger than 0142 ineh but
not larger than 0:1.'7'7 inch, and 100 ksi far shank diameUeca of D.14^~ i~h or less.

b. Staples sre 16 gage wire a~tc) have a minimum a/I6-inch on diameter crown wedth.
c. Nails shall be sped at noY mores than 6 inches on ccsenter ak all supports wheae spans aye 48 inches or gc+cater.

d. Foar-fooE bg 8-foot or 4foot by 9-foat panels shall be applied vertically.
e. Spacipg of f~stteneis nut i~luded in tlris table shall be bascxt on Tatale R6Q2.3(2).
f. For i+egions fraying basic wind sped of 110 rnph nr greater, &! defaRned. (2'/~' x Q.120j nails shell be used for attaching pIywaod arai wood shuckucal panel

roc£ sheethin$ to framing within mioimam 48 irteh t3istance from gable end wells, if mean roof height is mo~+e than 25 feet, up to 35 feet mauimum.

g. For regions having basic wind. speed of 100 mph ~ less, moils for attaching woad structural panel rao£ sheathing to gable end wall framing shall be spaced 6
inches on center. When basic wind spced is piaster ihar~ 1 ~ mph, nails for attaching pmyel roof sheathing to intermediate supports shall be Rpaced 6 inches on
center far minimwn 48-inch. distance fmm cid$es, eaves and gable end walls; and ~4 inc~jes an canter to gable emd wall flaming.

h. Gypsum sheathing shall conform to ASTi4f C 1396 ayxi stall be installed in accordance with (3A 253. Fiberba~rd sheathing Mall ennfam to ASTM C 2ttS.

r. Spacing of fasien~s on fltwr sheathing panel ~ctges allies to passel edges supported by frbming members curl required blockang attd at all floor perimeters
only. Spacing of fasteners on roof sheadring panel edges applies #o panel edges su~nrtad by fiamiag members and wired blocking. Blacking of mat or
floor eheatheng panel edges pecgendicalar to the framing mem6e►s need not be provic~d eaccept as required by other provisionx of this code. Flour perimeter
shall be su~o~ted by framing members or solid hlocldng.

j. Where a rafter is faste~tecl to an adjarxt►t parallel ceiling joist in accordance with this sclw~tnle, provide t+vo We nails on ana side of the rafter acai toe nails
fi~ocn the eeiting joist in top plate in a+c¢atdence with this set~lule.'fhe tce nail on N~ opposite side of the rafter snail oat be regni~ed.

k Use of staples in braced wail panels shall be prohibited in Seismic Design Cateaory Do,,,Q~,_g~j22,.

SECTION 37. Table R602.3(2) is hereby amended to read as follows:

TABLE R602.3(2)

ALTERNATE ATTACHMENTS TO TABLE R602.3(1)

HOA.1009141.1 2 ~



b. Staples shall have a minimum crown width of 7/16-inch on diameter

except as noted. Use of staples in roof, floor, subfloor, and braced wall panels shall be

prohibited in Seismic Design Category Do D~, or D2.

HOA.1009141.1 22



SECTION 38. Table- R602.10.3(3) is hereby amended to read as follows:

TABLE R602.10.3(3)

BRACING REQUIREMENTS BASED ON SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY

Tager ~sa2.~o~)
TS BASED QN SE~M[G ~1 CATEl~RY

~ ~~~. ~i~+~a~1.

WAI.I. HEIfaH'E:10 FEET
• t0 PSF FLQDR EiEAD 1.0lk~

N~IIAIMRII'i0TAl. LENGTH ~fEETj fDF 6RAGE0 WA9 i. PANEL$

76 PSF RQit1F/CEit.Ml6 DEAD LOAQ
iiE4t81~D ~i4LONG EACH BF~GEO W141.1. LINE'

• 8ii~tkGED WJrt.f. EINE SP14C~1<3'~36 F£ET

$aisrt~2 Dos1~1 ~or~r La~Ban
$fbC~d W~
LIT~a Lsrlgth INethod L18° ellWfwd+6B -

itetht~d~
QW6, SF~, ~

Ii~tfiOd~
t~-YYSP,

(!Doty
R~ ~

HPS! F~°~ ~

I0 ?..5' 2.5 2.5 l,b t.4

5>~} S 0 S.0 3 2 ~.7

~ 7,5 7.S 7.5 ~:$ 4.1

4U Q.Q 10.Q 1ifA 5.d S~

S0 12.5 12.5 1~.3 8 ~1 6.8

t4 NP' 4.5 d.5 3.4 2.6

NP 9 0 9.0 ~,.d "s.l

30 ~1F 13.5 13.3 9.~1 7.7
(townhaa~ses only)

d(► I~TF I~$.0 1$.0 12D 1f~~

5~ Nt' '22.5 22.5 1~.0 12:5

10 i+IP' G.0 6.f! d.5 3.8

2(1 NP 12.0 12.Q ~,d 7.7

3~ NF 18.0 18:U 13.5 11:5

dtl NF 2A.0 ?,e~.0 18.0 IS.3

5fl: NP .30.0 3Q.Q Z2.S L9.1

fF} NP ~B-~ ~-8~- ~.~ 1.8 l.b

2ET i+1[~' 3-~9,~,Q -3:3~-~ 3.15 9.1

ail ~1P -83-~ -8:3-~~ 5,4 d.6

:fib 1+7F -X3:8-~ ~3:K-2i~ ~.t1 7.7

I0 NP '~-NP -5:3- NP 3.S 3.2

24 I~iP -~B~-NP - N? '7.S 5.4

Dq 30 I~IP 33:8-NQ 33:8- dP 1Y.3 9.G

4p NP ~kQ- ~ X1:#1- NP 15.0 12.ff

5fl 1~3t' ~6:~ N2 X63- dL' 18.8 16.0

tQ NEB ~ ~ ~3- NL' S3 4,3

~t ~ -cue -NP ias ~.o
3p 11TP X2:8- ~ ~-~Ip, t5.8 13.4

a4 rm -~s~- ~e ~:~- r~ee ~r.o x~.~
~o rrn ~s:3- eye ~- de z~.~ zx:~

(contid)

HOA.1009141.1 23



TABLE R8!?2 t~~(3}-c~tt~ued
~RAlC1Nts REQUtHEt/~+ITS BASES ~OFi SE9ElAIG tiESiGt+1 CI►T~C#~ItY

WA1.1. HEtGliT ~ t0 FEET
to P~ I~.00rt DES tOnor ~~n M mraE. ~n~crN (~~+~ eaac~w~►u. pnr~~
16 PSF RO[!f/~EB.INO DEAE1 WAD e~nam ~u oetc ~+►~cH e~a+~ w~u.
BitACE~ WALL CIE SPACING ~ 2~ F£~T'

Methods

sa~smkr Dwb~n 5taryLaaa~[an
BI'aGetl kl/a!t
L(no Lance Met6ad L.~°

B
1AdUwd ~B'

OWB, SFB,
FSS. PCP. method lNelhoda

CS-NiSR,Campory ~ H~ ~ WSP ~
~F8°g

10 NP 3ii~- BA 3:13-6.0 2.0 1.7

2t} NP ~G~12A -b:9'12.0 4A 3A

3p Np ~}:$-18.0 X9$18.0 6.0 5.i.

40 NP }~B- 24.0 -t2-8-24.0 S.a b:$

5(} PIP -f~:9- 30.0 ~~-30.0 14.Q $.3
10 NP -~6:~-1+iP -+~r.B-TIP 4..5 3.8

21} NP -~8-1Vi' -1~H-2+1P 9.Q ?.7

D, 30 NP -~8:8- NL' ~S~1+A' 1.3.5 t1,3

ao rm tee- rr~ r~ is.a ts~
~u rm ~:e- ~rn 3ea~m z~.s ~.~
xo tai -~- t~a~ ~ s.o ~.i.
as rrn -rye- r~ -~:e-~ iz.o zo z
~+n rm ~ rre~ ~-ra~ is.a ~.~
ao rm -ate- tvr ~.s-~m 2,~.a zo.~
sa rm ~-~ -~a~s-rr~ ~o,~ zs~s
~o i+m -~.:~-a.o -~-s.o 2.s 2.1
2tF NP -&16.0 -8:9-16.0 S.p 4.3

3Q Np -}i~24.0 -t$6.24.0 7.S ~.4

40 Np ~+Yr,~32.0 -1~i;H32.0 10.0 $.~

5l} I~dP -~8:$-40.0 -x&8-40.0 12.5 I0.6

10 IrTP 3:3-NP ~-I~TP :3.5 4.7

2t} NP -15:6-IVP -ks:B-NP I t.0 9.4

30 NP ~3-1VP ~~-NP 16.5 1d.0

40 NP BBB- 3~iP 3B:B-i+II' 23.0 18.7

~4 1~dP 3~1.r- ~:5~NP 27.5 23.4~ 

z 1~ PIP IVP' NP I~3P NF

21i IdP Ids NP I+IF I+7~

30 NF I+Ii~ IVP I+tP I+1P

Aaf IQP i+IP IdP I~~P IJI'

5ti NP ~+dP" IVP NP NF

20 ~ NP ~+IP IdF 15.Q f2.8
Cxippiewall.betcnv

30 NP i~ NP 22.5 t9.~one- o~ twa-stay dwelling
4~f NP ?~T~" NP 3p.Gi 25.5

5D NP NP NP 37.5 31.9

Far St: finch =?S.4 mm, 1. foot =305 mm, 1 pnumi persquare foot=Etd►479 kPe.
r. Lioaer intcipol~ion afiall iii pamiiited.
b. ~atl txacing lengtl~s are basQd on a sa site taiass D.'• Integwlatia~n of bracing teng9h between ft~ S~, yatues ~ssociatecl with lire Sers[aic Desi~a C~egaies

shop 6e pemsitted wren e site-epee fie B~ v~lus is determined is a000rd~oe wltli 8oetion 16Y3.3 of tLe buemaiianat Bu~~di~g Code.

e. I~elhtxl L1B shell have gyj~um 609td f etled Ui At lest Glee Side with a&~s a[ ~c[ews pea T0b10 Ii602.9(1j fnt elttgt'ioT Bhe~Uling ar Teh9e Ii702.3.5 €n['
itN~sior gy{rsum board. 9~ing of fastenats et peas! edges shall nntezt~d 8 inches.

cL h3eihod GS-SHB Mies in 3L}C C only.
e. Methods GB and PCP braced wall panel hMr ratio shall not exceed 1:1 in SDC Do D~ or D2 Methods DVVB, SFB, PBS, and HPS are not premilted in SDC Do~D~,

~~2~

HOA.1009141.1 24



SECTION 39. Table R602.10.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

TABLE R602.10.4

BRACING METHODS

TA81E RSD2i0A
BAACINGi MEtt~DS f

~It~aCT1oN ~ITEF~A•
7WOII8, MATEAIRL t~lIRIINI'LFgGKNESB Hl~IRE

Faa9orwrs 8paotng

t x 4 wont or V~ood: 2-8d common nails Woad: der stmt a►~1
~p~r+orved metal straps ~r to;► ansl bntt~smplaFes

~~ atd5° tnGO° eng~s#'~r 3-Sd (2~fZ°tong x 0.113" dia.} nails
Lez in bracing m~imum 16" ~~~:

stud apaein~ Metes trap: gar maawFact~r~r manufectun~r

llWB 9ls'~1 ° numiiml} foi' 2-8si (2'!,"loc►g x Q.1 i3° dia.~ veils
Diagonal ma~cimuin24" nr ~ecs~ud

WQOt~ fl08[t~S 6ht~ S~CIfl+~ ~G' ~~.~4` ~fflig'$~8[3~8

~gp
~qp~

8d common f21r2"x0.1311 nails ~~~
IB"~ed edi n e p~~l~.~

~..~ 1~,,.~~

$d [21 f2"x0.131 l ~~fl~"P~`~~ ~ 15/32„ common nails
3~" edae distanceto panel edge ~ (yw~~►g~ 12" field

B~=NSP`
'V4~oait Stnccturat 4"~tpsne! edges
Panels with Stowe

~t~° Sec Figure ItG02.10 b.5 Sd ccamm~n (2'1~" x 0.131) nails
12" eR:int bate

~l!lasonryi~a~er supports d'" atbct
(S~ Section wall panel end pasts
RG(f2.1(l.6.r)

1 /̀~" laAg x 0.12° dis. ~f~►r'fZ"ttuck
~ ~~ '/$"ar ~C~" f~ -°°"""°~t s6eathin 7~f{"[ong x 0.12°dia.

~Yheiboard sdeath-
maa~annm 15" ~~ 9(f~ /~"tt►►icic shesthimg,~ 3"edges 6°field
stud si~acin~ g~tvazuzed ragfing aa"rIs vt &l ~nmmtsn

~~ (~~Ix" tar~,x 0.131 ° XGa.) ~nail~

I~TeilsorsecewspecTableRb(Y1.~(I~for Porall~aceci'~vall
cacteriorlacati~una mspaneliat~titms:7°

~ a~ ~r~s ~ b t, ~~~ ~ ~..Nails ~sctews der 1~bie R102.3.5 for
int~icu 1oc~iar~s ~rek1

F$5 g~E« ~,. Aj!2w~~ ~kf 3~q t ~ t~lll.11l(311

Pazti~lebnartt maaEimum 16" 62° long x i~,l"1~°ilia.) nails 3"~igcs 6"field
sheathing.

shcdapaeing
Fam Jz ; Sd camm~n

(Sea SectionIt,GOS) ~k7z~l~gx~p.131"dia.~naits

rce SeeSectionR7Q3.6fay Y/z"long, ]l gage, !3e"dia,headWaits b"oa fi~amaming
d~Dt~la[td m8ntinlum lei" ~ °1 g

"long,

au ail
t»ieeltiber~

Dement plaster stud apa~eiag ~a l6 gage staplea

4i °rte ;~u~► ~~° a o~2°a~., ~r aa~°~a~~. t;~ ~;r~
Hetiiboazii 16 ~I spacing,

length fo accommodate i /~° d"edges 8"field
panel siding penctcatian into studs

aBw
Alternate ~/~° See Se~tionit6t}2.1Q.6.1 Seefiop12602.tQ.6.l

irraEed wail

(continued)

HOA.1009141.1 2rJ



BRA~1l~ lIIETHOi33 f

~CQI~ONECTi~[ CF~TERUt'
~11EiFiUaS, MA7'EEiIAL AIININIL~/'fFiEB~ F1~1)IitE

Fss~~s SP~~9

PFH
Portal fcem~e with 'l~ ° fee Suction ~Gt~2.l0 G.2 See pct aa► It6t?2.1E).f.~

hold-,d~r~rns

'/~s" SeeS~ti~an gtb02.1Q 6.3 See Section R .10.f.3
Portal fx~acne; at gage

C5-'WSP
8d common [21 f2"x0.1311 nails
3+8" ed e distance to anel ed e - * ~V+ ̂ r~~

~~~-.`
~n~ ~~p~~~~

~GDC~finuDicsly slt~atltet! ~-~--

q~~ g ~ gg~~ 15!32„ 
8d common [21 t2"x0.1311 nails ~~~
"e edi anceto anel d (̂~~g]~~~~j~ld.

~:DAtinanu&ly sltP,atlteacl
wand str~tiu~al panel ~'— ~~e M~►c~d![~fi-'9~~P ~eel~+Iethod CS-~U'~P
~ijSCellt t~ ~,81'~ge 15x32„

opemmgs

CS-PF
~Ga~tiaunusty sheatt~ect ►~ See 3ecfiion I2bQ2.10 6.4 See motion R6~12.1Q.0 4

Portal frwme 1~

1F! ~` 9cs~g x a.12" dia.
~(far~'!Z"thick sE~et6ing~

Cssr~• '!? or ~J~ f~rr 1'/ "~nng x 0.12"" dia.
$sf~ "'ecEges~ontinue~usly sheHthed maa€~atam lei" (gym, °thick sheat6iug] 3 6°

311UGGICB~ ~~t' SUft~ S~taCl~~ ~"`MBifiZE~ I00~IE1,~* tIHt~6 4L

CQIIIIIiViI

Per 3I: 1 inch = 25.~d :~m,1 = 3{t5 mm, i ~gt?~e- Od}175 rod, i gonad per sgoar~ farm= 47.8 ~+F/m ;1 mile psr haatr= 6.~+i7 mis.

..Adhesive a~l~fimeat ~oEwall ~ffiing, includi~ i►5~th~ed C38, shall 6e pa~itteit zn 5eaxmic :L7esign IC~fegsenes'C> iau+ D', a€~1 Ar
b. Appilies tcs panels. nett t~ garage door ~opemng whin soppcsr~ing g~ahle eacf ws11 ar rnaf Iaact ~1y. May only be use c3o ang walk of die garsge. In ~eismi~

Design ~iega~ies A~,17k end I3~cr~oove deal load ~y not exceed 3 psf:
~c. [tars$e openings ad~oent trs a It3ethnd ~~-t~ p~eeet ~tualt i~,o paovidad with a [seder en aacoadance wilh Table RSiU2.5(t). ~1 full height e~~r opening sh~i! not

tsepermitted ~ljs to a M~ethad+~S-ti Wit.
t1. Metlnd GS-;SFB does nrrt apply ~n Seismic De~ign'Cat~gor es Dm ~3; end I32 encl ~ ~neas wtsersa 1~ urind speed c+eeds Q6 mph.

~. Method ap~i~ tadeteched ogee- ~cl iwo-lem tydw~Itiaga in 3eism~ Design Catege~sies IIo throws D, only.

f. Methods OB and PCP braced wall panel htw ratio shall not exceed 1:1 in SDC D~ D~ o, r D2. Methods LIB. DVVB. SFB. P85. HPS, and PfG are not permitted in
SDC D" 6~ or Z

a. Use of staales in braced wall panels shall be prohibited in SDC D~ D~ o, r DZs

SECTION 40. Table R602.10.5 is hereby amended to read as follows:

TABLE R602.10.5

MINIMUM LENGTH OF BRACED WALL PANELS

HOA.1009141.1 26



-r,~s~~ u~nz.a~.~
N{fAlilallJl~! LEFIC,TH ~~° SRACEL} TDYALL PANELS

~~TTFif?ii
(4ea Tstsl~s R1i~.A~

~IlrltPdltiA3 LEt~E~T#1°.
{fteohes)

~.^QF1tBt7T#Nt"a L~tAGTl!
{irn~laes)*P~ffiI He7gtaf

8 iertit 9 fist t~ feet ii fit Z f~ei

I)~?i?$,~i'r'`SP, :iI I3, T'I;~f ~, FiPi~ B~-'UY~sP d$ ~$ fi£~ ~3 ~$ ~iet~ts'

~F1~81f =Q.S x rtllu:i~

~TI3 S5 Cif fib I1' fit? ~t~tbt~"

~~
ST3~ I4, I3 ~n~

wiu~l:~~s ~ 1.1~ tnph.
2~S 3~. 3~i ~€ 42

?i8
I I3~, I7, €mod t7~;,,

~r=ui~ s~c~ ~ ~ 1~! ~n~sta
:~2 :i~ Vii' ~dP

t?~FI.
Sit(~j i~~ rneaf 4a~ily ~Cr24 ~r24 -}~i-24 -} 24~ X24 4#3

~u~~r;iq~ i~ix;,,~zar~ and rca~9" 4 d r3 `~ ~~`

I?I?tT 1 ~7 ~#} 3~g 3~ ]. x ~ctuai~

~~-G ~A 2'7 ~tl ~~ 3£~ Aetual~'

~S-f ~ -1~i- 24 -I#~-24 x{}-24 X24 ~ f~rtt3~"

.a'~~ cesateTeara~~:~ire • 1ECi_=1~

i.r~}' OX ti].C'c ~-tt]`wl~EL3

..

~~ ail 3~ 3~

Yl~ii~iill~

~A 2fi ~~F i!'} :,

7:~ 2T ~'7 X11 ~~ aka

7#x ~f? ~<1 3fl ii ~b

Vii) 3~ ~4 ? :3 ~(a

~I :3~ i~ 2 :33 ~6

z ~B 41 ~~ ~6 ~~

(.;]{d .—. "ff i ''Rif .~ih ~C3

.#~~ "— '~F7 ~.l ~6F ~7

i.~~
~... ..__. :„FAd ~~ *3~

I ii .•"""• •••••~. ~~ 'tflt ~.F

TLV '— —. FRT .~3~ -^333

.i ti~i ._.~ _. ~_ ~.T~ .~3.

3L4 '_ _' ~.1 J?i

1.~.iZ
_. ._...... ....Y.. ~~ .D~

l~Q —. ., ~. _ ~j

~?nr St: 7 sn~h _ 2S.4mm, fE-3E~.~i m, S ~n~3ep~rhnu€-0.~4~ mTs,

~i~- tic3t Yci~Etsttt:l.
~t. I ~c.~yrsntcr~~c?I:v{itfASlaallt? rnr.;~itt~~3,

~t titiatli :,.~ ii. I..a~g~hti;h~~nitis~rt~~ter1[aa¢~r~~ge~te~ict't$~~~en~nitnurit3en~Ttt,
t~_ tt~zi~~r~~~~I _.!~rJies~htf~,rt~z-1ta~1r> fie, in ~ccard~nrt.~vriilaF;~>~r~i~ti .~x:2,lxuts~etiisr~i~;g~scm iaca~~ ~iicyi~f-:.~,~i pcauymall.

+3, ~t ~ ~ ~u~a iii`_; hzin~t ic~c 3'7 ;; is l tt feet an a~ua~c3scnc~ wiflh l~i~urc: ~t .iCt f.3. [aut w~lS 3t~y~ht m~~r he inccs~cxud tc ' ' f i . , i .`~ pray av~L
~. ~Z'd~ um _, s,~ h..~ ~t !nr ~S-I'! is IO few i~ ~ccard~~ ~~€;tiz ~ga~re Rfa€3`~.7 t3:~A; bait cumll . i at tnay tae ~r~ is 1 _ 1._ :f :~.:tta any wall.

HOA.1009141.1 27



SECTION 41. Figure R602.10.6.1 is amended to read as follows:

~~~~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ TOP PLRTE SHALL BE CONTINUOUS'~~ ~ 1 ~ ~i ,:' t:
` ~ —'x~K~~---IR BRACED WALL PANEL

_.__ _.
g~

_~~ _ _, --
-- _ ~ ~:~.

15132" 
,,~ €

i-. ,
T`I' ~- ~~cD(} ~F '.EL~FLPs-Eric-11E~~vC

L ~~TRl3S.TJt~ir"~1.f` t ~La *~'••~ J t 3 P~ dCt~~'~ 5Fi« ~ "~~f
,~ '-~Fks€3"i~G Gtd ,t7~;=.~:~~ +, k_.. ~ _~ ~ T'~;r1E~37~C ~iC<~~

MIN ~ s~ z F k ~+Ahi~ i~lt~t.
C9~?.f3~..F~.~T=Ja

".:~hF€I~,... 

~ - .it~.t+~t3~~-
$ttr~Rr?i~y.

iT PP., rEL~I~~~~~ ~C,R ItS~€~

~ F.tkT}~E'r1~aTF~F ~ 3;ORIE
~ :l-i +1 "~ C'~i; ~~ QR r2~~ZTf2 b'-T'c"P2= --,,,

~~ ~i; -i~~R.sF"E~ T~.BLE R~Ja T7 U.9 s,`_'eSd~.' ~~ .,

~q ~eF LAtH .:iiu ~~°t X17 r`~A,~, ~' . ~ "`K~--...~.,,~,» ~T4..f~~c. 1_lf-Ji ~ H~.±i f"KFC a =. ~.=

~TF"mr TeP~ FP } ~~ IiA~ t ~C
f'~l-t~~~T~C~ e ~ ~~ AST }dF".t. L~ ,~.Ii:
T;~E .,t2+~F7 ~ ~ ~l.s i;: ~f1El

t~~i~{l?L?.94~`~C E?E ~.5Y~4:tl~G ~ -~ a7 ev .' ~ It-1 E . rF: UUPPtttT.

p'r~LL 3t~Fl:'3~~~1 i U,'F_R ~~~~~ ~ _ ~t~^t f ~f~~t F~L1Pl~ ~ ~s~ l6d[7+ ~,Uf't,
6f~~C~Cr `.rLE l_I ~ r~ ~ -~•• $. 4 s._~.^{ ~'C1R ~=,i €t~ 6.7,~T~v~l4 LF~i'

— 
_ . L- _ ~ ~ ~ 24..

n

r,':
11At,1ETE~2htd~wHc~R 

____.,~ __, J' ft~;f1 F~ G lids ?I 3t,GF.R
r f71~ls''~' €.~ 1c < i'c" ~ Sa~o~vv~ ric-

T%i~ SErP.IEtJT -

dIETHt~i~ ~8~-A~.TE~+tATE. Rf#CEQ'k~~LL P~k~sIL

SECTION 42. Figure R602.10.6.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

HOA.1009141.1 2$



It#EP7'7" O(' 31E.~t R Ll+iTlt DDIl6LE FLRTAL F}YDJ&@4 £','N4 QSlA£L:0 VdPl.t FAN[L3

't' 1~ FR7 (S4~ C d ~Vt6t`1t ~P 6 PEIiRt## _~~~~
~""'—' PD :-iu£`lE tlA 7t~i18LE Bi4RT1hi..

TE?@SEO t{ 5~ ,? P~~ ~_......

FtlN"4 xdd. d 
a'aPt£ 8651.7 ',.stRi

~~~~y ~ OPF O£i7£SE[7E.Uf

i -„~µ SYL~LG EO~ s R~tC
F•.St tc cH. a.NiPFC F~y~l+..eR i.6 O~~LR 04IRAt1~J8.~~~ ~ CD~A dl O"i OR GAzYAtt l2f.~ 8QY.7AnIC5 U2 d GRID -i ~ tli-.I.fD xf~ C0~4:'V?1

~ ~ iK& TAR a AS 3 i01f,! aLO XI ~ t +. ~'1'HIN ~

.~`r ~ I3~bLSf ~'"03~4CF. STUD S7f2AR PEF>ABLE 
lAIJU 'O~~tAi.0 _F

$ #Td£tZ1{E'.4 CNfA to IpYS(tp HPE{fitYC9 
M7J H-(, diP. Ulf£ E

SPP~SSitcS16 U ~HE~~?SittG 
Af➢9YQP ~"QC. 7 F

~ ~_ dk1N3 tS REip1tQ£~
-~, .~r f.~^.H ~PJi6lfQlfE= -.

tA111 124DB7.~ E 4 pa.ukG COV~AIIt3 Y#17N tAltt_ ~ 1 ~. _
°~•~ ~~~ 15!32" mss- tiff: ~tJRflf15>R_VCTARHL PA~lHE &t[E A7tt7lSt~ T~`PiC#~LGtIRTA1s}~ ~r«r , x~•..~•

~y q~~ ;evi ~Ii N „J C9 F1hitlH bR GALVT+dii~Et7807C 7iA148 RT FRAffE COt-0~7RUC'F16N
~+ ~: Iq': ~`tk:G: itt RC.l ~RA~SNQ~3iU37S, 6t0~[Stti{3, A1f6

StSA.S}tXP. ~~

j`h, ~? ̀ `,•••-•.- rare.~tsnrxoraa~e~r~r~s~~tt~~zes yrj "~r-„~=„^ ,~;

[ ~ f"tta (G t'i 0Lfl 37RaA FV'I~f 11DLDFiflVtNS ~~'~~y?~

I (Er eF -vec iri ~;; utt ~a~RE_t~P,k~i2 Nr~[L~~aii Tp -
~ ~I1~

1
` t@d ~cf 7fC R~~'7G ~7 f ,_ IRN_'J3(E St GAR -r

—yam , ~~ - 1 ,~ "~
~~._... }~.it F ~iTrtc ~r a9 n=32tafu ,i?~9 '~,-A71,-

13t~ TN L~-5 SP 9 F:f;l z ~ ~i LO,~A GF~N~~."8.

!€gt_ ~i~5~"DU~fE „.r~n~~aNOitBOLTiNS:riI.E0~6R
P.lC3.1.8 ~ UJTi a' X 2' X 3fi E” PIA Te WASHER

SECTION 43.

METICt~ PFH—F~ORT~L FRARlIE WITH Ht5Li3-D€3WtVS

AT DETACHED GARAGE Dt3C}R OPENINGS

FAS7EDi3'OR
PLATE TO
N€RY~Eit ~Y~BH
34 6
F07 pF t~3

t F f R til~~~.~ :AT
3 9 C TEA

15!32'
k;d3~.~£8~Yf~it7D
St'RUCTUF2?9..
PAKEI
StiE&Tti#tQ

Figure 8602.10.6.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

HOA.1009141.1 29



:Y;~.N_A ~E ..i:~.~CAL1F~.., YfsL FE1Y.k~5fYYXC>"x~s?~.G~'~s';.iL

{E F~. e^'~ .F -

_~. •.:a ~~,,,

° ~,,.,,,,,,,µ
~"- ~3 

_

F~v ~ 4~ ~L
^i~f ~i S3 F~

r'l °~,........ i- to ;- S'n~A~ i~a '+e~..~ ~ ~ I

i, i 
• .: r,

.. (
gyp. '~. ~ 5if?~:A7 x F ~

~ '! j'

'. f t'If 0 Z 3 I 
53

'~ 15132" _,. ac 1~ci~ ~~
I >ts~Y ~.FL ~ _ xA

N fl.. -...a ̀ IU 35,

~ _

~. ~~ { --- 3~~x3"x0229" '~, ~!
l 

W.

c I
t .. '.

i... Y , 1

t34dE~CC{)ttGhf Il c)R~#ASQP2YtYBLi~CKf{%iNC1btTK2ti

i ~ ~

±~u~ r T~
~,r ~E.~r ~~r; } ~„,

i 'J
@R. ti i

PAS4t4
~' ~:

~ 1 EDEC F',NEL
P~ f - _ ~~'K~41. } -

4`98
>TT H~ "fC ~

S i ~ ELZ"' I'.'FCz ~ $3
~a i t ~i a ~ {GAEL ~~~~, ~,
#k~ uT. ~ ~JiAI

F.E t~f~ 1ti fiP..

YN2 A "°a~R trYk-
fP ~ „{5 V 7YF~i

~~ #

i1S.J (V ". ~.

3 ~° .. rII

f tiWl

^LSSE4ffi'^"`,v Pt1i3E TCA

~ 5732
_ . c:g~

_ 'a.d".P6dtfa4..

r~ .~~ ~
r~~,.A.~~ tt tr a38A.~.~ ~PYAY~

,, .- tia 7C r^,,,pBAF$6~O £ibt ~• E'. 7xA ~ ttA11L ~';~
~~ ~ eat` ~ t! *~„~~ ae i,~ is..._.,~._ ~~ 1~a~~rNlat3;_. t._...'~M,~ 3H&a?^AFL .~~ ~ 1 ,~::~--•,.+r~.- Pf~7 W..B

.- ~

,,:.`vim 5~ -:.L'C T;_nkt.

pv~RAis~o wgtst~f~~ -~~~.r Kr,rrr~~ricHOR t~r~q
~S, .-. --' ~ 'Gi f+V.8F1E'F,YH~Et$665 t .iT IfiF' C1!yrR ~A,`i C7 J~, tE C.t,CQ,2~i 'k

~r ~y'`
~

}A4`k T 't1~JR .Ll~
Pe B myFEAlHt t :b •'g °40.'i~~~

t,

~.~~r~
__. _ _.

~ t H~ ~
ca. r "EZl

3 % -', ~ _ ' ,~ IL r'2-

a4P~#tC'v Ei ~-,Nti
. ~ir,t;: i5T

~ l i A Y. L-"

f£ ~s_e~~~.~~.
-.

Vs~AfRA E.1.tM?R -AVERUSP APTK#N
~a~,tr~se+eza~zs ess~an ~a te~r~e~zsn~s}

~R'{~1T ~~.EVA~IC~! SECftON

~c~r SI: 7 inch = 25.E mm, t faot = 3€l~.8 mm.

FtG13RE R6U210.6.4
METtiCiCl GS-PF-Ct3PITINUQtfSLY S}iEkTliEd PQRTAL FF3A11~E PANEL CQNSTRIICTlt3N

SECTION 44. Section R602.10.9.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

~~:

HOA.1009141.1 3~



. r ■ - . r ■

SECTION 45. Section R606.2.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R606.2.4 Parapet walls.

Unreinforced solid masonry parapet walls shall not be less than 8 inches (203

mm) thick and their height shall not exceed four times their thickness. Unreinforced

hollow unit masonry parapet walls shall be not less than 8 inches (203 mm) thick, and

their height shall not exceed three times their thickness. Masonry parapet walls in

areas subject to wind loads of 30 pounds per square foot (1.44 kPa) or located in

Seismic Design Category Do, D~, or D2, or on townhouses in Seismic Design Category

C shall be reinforced in accordance with Section R606.12.

HOA.1009141.1 31



SECTION 46. Section 8606.12.2.2.3 is hereby amended to read as

follows:

8606.12.2.2.3 Reinforcement requirements for masonry elements.

Masonry elements listed in Section 8606.12.2.2.2 shall be reinforced in either the

horizontal or vertical direction as shown in Figure Q~~~,R606.11(3) and in

accordance with the following:

1. Horizontal reinforcement. Horizontal joint reinforcement shall consist of a~

s~-at least one No. 4 bar spaced not more than 48 inches (1219 mm). ~nrh~

~~~iS ~~~~~1!~~'I'i~~T~ I~\J~~~~l ~~/► J~ 1~1 ~~1~1~\t!~~ ~S[~JAi~~~~l~i~J 1!~~l ~l1'1'~~1~1~~~~1~i~ _ _

. Horizontal reinforcement shall be

provided within 16 inches (406 mm) of the top and bottom of these masonry elements.

2. Vertical reinforcement. Vertical reinforcement shall consist of at least one

No. 4 bar spaced not more than 48 inches (1219 mm). Vertical reinforcement shall be

within -a-6-8 inches (486203 mm) of the ends of masonry walls.

SECTION 47. Section 8803.2.4 is hereby added to read as follows:

8803.2.4 Openings in horizontal diaphragms.

Openings in horizontal diaphragms shall conform with Secfiion 8503.2.4.

HOA.1009141.1 32



SECTION 48.

R1001.3.1

Section R1001.3.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Vertical reinforcing.

For chimneys up to 40 inches (1016 mm) wide, four No. 4 continuous vertical

bars adequately anchored into the concrete foundation shall be placed between wythes

of solid masonry or within the cells of hollow unit masonry and grouted in accordance

with Section R609. Grout shall be prevented from bonding with the flue liner so that the

flue liner is free to move with thermal expansion. For chimneys more than 40 inches

(1016 mm) wide, two additional No. 4 vertical bars adequately anchored into the

concrete foundation shall be provided for each additional flue incorporated into the

chimney or for each additional 40 inches (1016 mm) in width or fraction thereof.

SECTION 49. The provisions of this ordinance contain various changes,

modifications, and additions to the 2013 Edition of the California Residential Code.

Some of these changes are administrative in nature in that they do not constitute

changes or modifications to requirements contained in the building standards published

in the California Building Standards Code

Pursuant to California Health and Safety Code sections 17958.5, 17958.7, and

18941.5, the Board of Supervisors hereby expressly finds that all of the changes and

modifications to requirements contained in the building standards published in the

California Building Standards Code contained in this ordinance, which are not.

administrative in nature, are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological,

or topographical conditions in the County of Los Angeles as more particularly described

in the table set forth below.

HOA.1009141.1 33



Code Section Condition Explanation of Amendment

R301.1.3.2 Geological Los Angeles County is prone to seismic activity due to the
existence of active faults in the Southern California area.
After the 1994 Northridge Earthquake, the Wood Frame
Construction Joint Task Force recommended that the
quality of wood frame construction needs to be greatly
improved. One such recommendation identified by the
Task Force is to improve the quality and organization of
structural plans prepared by the engineer or architect so
that plan examiners, building inspectors, contractors, and
special inspectors may logically follow and construct the
presentation of the seismic force-resisting systems in the
construction documents. For buildings or structures
located in Seismic Design Category Do, D~, D2, or E that
are subject to a greater level of seismic forces, the
requirement to have a California licensed architect or
engineer prepare the construction documents is intended
to minimize or reduce structural deficiencies that may
cause excessive damage or injuries in wood frame
buildings.. Structural deficiencies such as plan and vertical
irregularities, improper shear transfer of the seismic force-
resisting system, missed details or connections important
to the structural system, and the improper application of
the prescriptive requirements of the California Residential
Code can be readily addressed by a registered design
professional.

R301.1.4 Geological This technical amendment is for buildings constructed on
Topographical hillsides. Due to the local topographical and geological

conditions of the sites within the greater Los Angeles
region and their susceptibility to earthquakes, this
amendment is required to address and clarify special
needs for buildings constructed on hillside locations. A
joint Structural Engineers Association of Southern
California (SEAOSC) and Los Angeles City Joint Task
Force investigated the performance of hillside building
failures after the Northridge earthquake. Numerous
hillside failures resulted in loss of life and millions of dollars
in damage. These criteria were developed to minimize the
damage to these structures and have been in use by the
City and Count of Los An eles for several ears.

R301.2.2.2.5 Geological Los Angeles County is prone to seismic activity due to the
existence of active faults in the Southern California area.
Due to the hi h geologic activities in the Southern

HOA.1009141.1 34



Code Section Condition Explanation of Amendment

California area and the expected higher level of
performance on buildings and structures, this local
amendment limits the type of irregular conditions as
specified in the 2013 California Residential Code. Such
limitations are recommended to reduce structural damages

in the event of an earthquake. The cities and County of
the Los Angeles region have taken extra measures to
maintain the structural integrity of the framing of the shear
walls and all'associated elements when designed for high
levels of seismic loads.

R301.2.2.3.8 Geological Los Angeles County is prone to seismic activity due to the
existence of active faults in the Southern California. area.
Due to the high geologic activities in the Southern
California area and the expected higher level of
performance on buildings and structures, this local
amendment limits the potential anchorage and supporting
frame failure resulting from additional weight. There is no
limitation for weight of mechanical and plumbing fixtures
and equipment in the International Residential Code.
Requirements from ASCE 7 and the International Building
Code would permit equipment weighing up to 400 Ibs.
when mounted at 4 feet or less above the floor or attic
level without engineering design.. Where equipment
exceeds this requirement, it is the intent of this proposed
amendment that a registered design professional be
required to analyze if the floor support is adequate and
structural) sound.

Table R302.1(2) Climatic This amendment will not allow unprotected openings
(openings that do not resist the spread of fire) to be in the
exterior wall of a residential building that is located on a
property line. This amendment is necessary due to local
climatic conditions. During the hot, dry weather conditions
of late summer in combination with the Santa Ana winds
creates an extreme fire danger. Residential buildings with
unprotected openings located on a property line will allow
the spread of fire from the inside of the building to adjacent
properties and likewise from exterior properties to the
interior of the buildin .

R327.1.1 Climatic Clarifies the application of Chapter R327 to include
additions, alterations, and/or relocated buildings. Many
areas of the County have been designated as Fire Hazard
Severit Zones due to low humidit , stron winds, and d

HOA.1009141.1 35



Code Section Condition Explanation of Amendment

vegetation. Additions, alterations, and/or relocated
buildin shave the same fire risk as new buildin s.

R327.1.3 Climatic Clarifies the application of Chapter R327 to include
additions, alterations, and/or relocated buildings. Many
areas of the County have been designated as Fire Hazard
Severity Zones due to the increased risk of fire caused by
low humidity, strong winds, and dry vegetation. Additions,
alterations, and/or relocated buildings have the same fire
risk as new buildin s.

R327.1.3.1 Climatic Clarifies the application of Chapter R327 to include
additions, alterations, and/or relocated buildings. Many
areas of the County have been designated as Fire Hazard
Severity Zones due to the increased risk of fire caused by
low humidity,- strong winds, and dry vegetation. Additions,
alterations, and/or relocated buildings have the same fire
risk as new buildin s.

R327.3.5.2 Climatic- Disallows the use of wood-shingle/wood-shake roofs due
to the increased risk of fire in the County caused by low
humidit ,strop winds, and d ve etation.

R327.3.5.2.2 Climatic Disallows the use of wood-shingle/wood-shake roofs due
to the increased risk of fire in the County caused by low
humidit , strop winds, and d ve efiation.

R327.4.3 Climatic Disallows the use of wood-shingle/wood-shake roofs due
to the increased risk of fire in the County caused by low
humidity, strong winds, and dry vegetation in High Fire
Severit Zones.

R327.5.2 Climatic Disallows the use of wood-shingle/wood-shake roofs and
requires the use of Class A roof covering due to the
increased risk of fire in the County caused by low humidity,
strong winds, and dry vegetation in High Fire Severity
Zones.

R401.1 Geological Los Angeles County is prone to seismic activity due to the
existence of active faults in the Southern California area.
Wood foundations, even those that are preservative-
treated, encounter a higher risk of deterioration when
contacting the adjacent ground. The required seismic
anchorage and transfer of lateral forces into the foundation
system necessary for 2-story structures and foundation
walls could become compromised at varying states of
wood decay. In addition, global structure overturning
moment and sliding resistance is reduced when utilizing

HOA.1009141.1 36



Code Section Condition Explanation of Amendment

wood foundations as opposed to conventional concrete or
masonry systems. However, non-occupied, single-story
storage structures pose significantly less risk to human
safety and should be able to utilize the wood foundation
uidelines s ecified in this Cha ter.

R403.1.2 Climatic Los Angeles County is prone to seismic activity due to the
R403.1.3 Geological existence of active faults in the Southern California area.
R403.1.5 These proposed amendments require minimum
Figure R403.1.5 reinforcement in continuous footings and stepped footings

to address the problem of poor performance of plain or
under-reinforced footings during a seismic event. These
amendments reflect the recommendations by SEAOSC
and the Los Angeles City Joint Task Force that
investigated the poor perFormance observed in the 1994
Northridge Earthquake. These proposed amendments are
a continuation of an amendment adopted during previous
code adoption cycles. Interior walls can easily be called
upon to resist over half of the seismic loading imposed on
simple buildings or structures. Without a continuous
foundation to support the braced wall line; seismic loads
would be transferred through other elements such as non-
structural concrete slab floors, wood floors, etc. Requiring
interior braced walls be supported by continuous
foundations is intended to reduce or eliminate the poor
performance of buildings or structures.

R404.2 Climatic No substantiating data has been provided to show that
Geological wood foundations are effective in supporting structures

and buildings during a seismic event while being subject to
deterioration caused by presence of water in the soil as
well as other materials detrimental to wood foundations.
Wood foundations, when they are not properly treated and
protected against deterioration, have performed very
poorly and have led to slope failures. Most contractors are
typically accustomed to construction in dry weather in the
Southern California region and are not generally familiar
with the necessary precautions and treatment of wood that
makes it suitable for both seismic events and wet
applications. With the higher seismic demand placed on
buildings and structures in this region, coupled with the
dryer weather conditions here as oppose to the northern
and eastern part of the country, it is the intent of this
roposal to take the necessary precautiona steps to

HOA.1009141.1 37



Code Section Condition Explanation of Amendment

reduce or eliminate potential problems that may result from
the use of wood footings and foundations that does not
take into consideration the conditions of this surrounding
environment.

R501.1 Geological Due to the high geologic activities in the Southern
California area and the expected higher level of
performance on buildings and structures, this local
amendment limits the potential anchorage and supporting
frame failure resulting from additional weight. There is no
limitation for weight of mechanical and plumbing fixtures
and equipment in the International Residential Code.
Requirements from ASCE 7 and the International Building
Code would permit equipment weighing up to 400 Ibs.
when mounted at 4 feet or less above the floor or attic
level without engineering design. Where equipment
exceeds this requirement, it is the intent of this proposed
amendment that a registered design professional be
required to analyze if the floor support is adequate and
structurall sound.

R503.2.4 Geological Section R502.10 of the Code does not provide any
prescriptive criteria. to limit the maximum floor opening size
nor does Section R503 provide any details to address the
issue of shear transfer near larger floor openings. With the
higher seismic demand placed on buildings and structures
in this region, it is important to ensure that a complete load
path is provided to reduce or eliminate potential damages
caused by seismic forces. Requiring blocking with metal
ties around larger floor openings and limiting opening size
is consistent with the requirements of Section
R301.2.2.2.5.

R602.3.2 Geological Los Angeles County is prone to seismic activity due to the
existence of active faults in the Southern California area.
The cities and County of the Los Angeles region have
taken extra measures to maintain the structural integrity of
the framing of the shear walls when designed for high
levels of seismic loads by eliminating single top plate
construction. The performance of modern day braced wall
panel construction is directly related to an adequate load
path extending from the roof diaphragm to the foundation
system. This proposed amendment is a continuation of an
amendment adopted during the previous code adoption
c cle.

HOA.1009141.1 3$



Code Section Condition Explanation of Amendment

Table R602.3(1) Geological Los Angeles County is prone to seismic activity due to the
existence of active faults in the Southern California area.
In September 2007, limited cyclic testing data was
provided to the ICC Los Angeles Chapter Structural Code
Committee showing that stapled wood structural shear
panels do not exhibit the same behavior as the nailed
wood structural shear panels. As a matter of fact, the test
results of the stapled wood structural shear panels
appeared much lower in strength and drift than the nailed
wood structural shear panel test results. Therefore, the
.use of staples as fasteners for shear walls sheathed with
other materials shall not be permitted without being
substantiated by cyclic testing. This proposed amendment
is a continuation of an amendment adopted during the
revious Code ado Lion c cle.

Table R602.3(2) Geological Los Angeles County is prone to seismic activity due to the
existence of active faults in the Southern California area.
In September 2007, limited cyclic testing data was
provided to the ICC Los Angeles Chapter Structural Code
Committee showing that stapled wood structural shear
panels do not exhibit the same behavior as the nailed
wood structural shear panels. As a matter of fact, the test
results of the stapled wood structural shear panels
appeared much lower in strength and drift than the nailed
wood structural shear panel test results. Therefore, the
use of staples as fasteners for shear walls sheathed with
other materials shall not be permitted without being
substantiated by cyclic testing. This proposed amendment
is a continuation of an amendment adopted during the
revious Code ado tion c cle.

Table Geological Due to the high geologic activities in the Southern
R602.10.3(3) California area and the expected higher level of

performance on buildings and structures, this local
amendment continues to reduce/eliminate the allowable
shear values for shear walls sheathed with lath, plaster or
gypsum board. The poor performance of such shear walls
sheathed with other materials in the 1994 Northridge
Earthquake was investigated by SEAOSC and the
Los Angeles City Joint Task Force. The cities and County
of the Los Angeles region have taken extra measures to
maintain the structural integrity of the framing of the shear
walls when desi ned for hi h levels of seismic loads.

HOA.1009141.1 39



Code Section Condition Explanation of Amendment

Table Geological 3/8" thick 3ply-plywood shear walls experienced many
R602.10.4 failures during the Northridge Earthquake. This proposed

amendment specifies minimum WSP sheathing thickness
and nail size and spacing. so as to provide a uniform
standard of construction for designers and buildings to
follow. This is intended to improve the performance level
of buildings and structures that are subject to the higher
seismic demands placed on buildings or structure in this
region. This proposed amendment reflects the
recommendations by SEAOSC and the Los Angeles City
Joint Task Force that investigated-the poor performance
observed in 1994 Northridge Earthquake. In September
2007, cyclic testing data was provided to the structural
code committee showing that stapled wood structural
shear panels do not exhibit the same behavior as the
nailed wood structural shear panels. In addition; the test
results of the stapled wood structural shear panels
appeared much lower in strength and drift than the nailed
wood structural shear panel test results. This proposed
amendment is a continuation of an amendment adopted
durin the revious Code ado tion c cle.

Table Geological Los Angeles County is prone to seismic activity due to the
R602.10.5 existence of active faults in the Southern California area.

The poor performance of such shear walls sheathed in the
1994 Northridge Earthquake was investigated by SEAOSC
and the Los Angeles City Joint Task Force. The cities and
County of the Los Angeles region have taken extra
measures to maintain the structural integrity with respect
to the "maximum shear wall aspect ratios" of the framing of
the shear walls when designed for high levels of seismic
loads. This proposed amendment is consistent with the
shear wall aspect ratio provision of Section 4.3.4 of
AF&PA SDPWS-2008.

Figure Geological 3/8" thick 3ply-plywood shear walls experienced many
R602.10.6.1 failures during the Northridge Earthquake. The poor

performance of such shear walls sheathed in the 1994
Northridge Earthquake was investigated by SEAOSC and
the Los Angeles City Joint Task Force. Box nails were
observed to cause massive and multiple failures of the
typical 3/8" thick 3ply-plywood during the Northridge
Earthquake. The cities and County of the Los Angeles
re ion have taken extra measures to maintain the

HOA.1009141.1 4~



Code Section Condition Explanation of Amendment

structural integrity of the framing of the shear walls when
designed for high levels of seismic loads. The
performance of modern day braced wall panel construction
is directly related to an adequate load path extending from
the roof diaphragm to the foundation system. This.
proposed amendment continues amendments adopted
during the previous Code cycles for the California Building
Code.

Figure Geological 3/8" thick 3ply-plywood shear walls experienced many
R602.10.6.2 failures during the Northridge Earthquake. The poor

perFormance of such shear walls sheathed in the 1994
Northridge Earthquake was investigated by SEAOSC and
the Los Angeles City Joint Task Force. The cities and
County of the Los Angeles region have taken extra
measures to maintain the structural integrity of the framing
of the shear walls when designed for high levels of seismic
loads. Box nails were observed to cause massive and
multiple failures of the typical 3/8-inch thick plywood during
the Northridge Earthquake. The proposal to change the
minimum lap splice requirement is consistent with Section
12.16.1 of ACI 318-11. This proposed amendment is a
continuation of an amendment adopted during the
revious Code ado Lion c cles.

Figure Geological 3/8" thick 3ply-plywood shear walls experienced many
R602.10.6.4 failures during the Northridge Earthquake. The poor

performance of such shear walls sheathed in the 1994
Northridge Earthquake was investigated by SEAOSC and
the Los Angeles City Joint Task Force. The cities and
County of the Los Angeles region have taken extra
measures to maintain the structural integrity of the framing
of the shear walls when designed for high levels of seismic
loads. The proposal in which "washers shall be a
minimum of 0.229 inch by 3 inches by 3 inches in size" is
consistent with Section R602.11.1 of the California
Residential Code and Section 2308.12.8 of the California
Building Code. This proposed amendment is a
continuation of an amendment adopted during the
previous code adoption cycle.

R602.10.9.1 Geological Los Angeles County is prone to seismic activity due to the
existence of active faults in the Southern California area.
The erFormance of modern da braced wall- anel

HOA.1009141.1 41



Code Section Condition Explanation of Amendment

construction is directly related to an adequate load path
extending from the roof diaphragm to the foundation
system. Interior braced wall panels, therefore, are also
directly dependent upon the adequacy of the foundation
system. In addition, the proposed amendment for Section
R403.1.2 specifies that all exterior walls and required
interior braced wall panels in buildings shall be supported
with continuous footin s.

R606.2.4 Geological Los Angeles County is prone to seismic activity due to the
existence ofi active faults in the Southern California area.
The addition of the word "or" will prevent the use of
unreinforced parapets in Seismic Design Category Do, D~
or D2, or on townhouses in Seismic Desi n Cate o C.

8606.12.2.2.3 Geological Los Angeles County is prone to seismic activity due to the
existence of active faults in the Southern California-area.
Reinforcement using longitudinal wires for buildings and
structures located in high seismic areas are not as ductile
as deformed rebar. Having vertical reinforcement closer to
the ends of masonry walls help to improve the seismic
performance of mason buildin sand structures.

8803.2.4 Geological Section 8802 of the Code does _not provide any
prescriptive criteria to limit the maximum size of roof
openings, nor does Section 8803 provide any details to
address the issue of shear transfer near larger roof
openings. With the higher seismic demand placed on
buildings and structures in this region, it is important to
ensure that a complete load path is provided to reduce or
eliminate potential damage caused by seismic forces.
Requiring blocking with metal ties around larger roof
openings and limiting the size of openings is consistent
with the requirements of Section 8301.2.2.2.5.

81001:3.1 Geological Los Angeles County is prone to seismic activity due to the
existence of active faults in the Southern California area.
The performance of fireplaces/chimneys without
anchorage to the foundation has been observed to be
inadequate during major earthquakes. The lack of
anchorage to the foundation results in overturn or
dis lacement.

SECTION 49. This ordinance shall become operative on January 1, 2014.

[TITLE302013CSCC]

HOA.1009141.1 42


