
 
 

 

 
 
 

 
 
 
 

 
MARINA DEL REY DESIGN CONTROL BOARD 

AGENDA 
 

Wednesday, April 21, 2021, 1:30 p.m. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

NOTICE 
 
Following Governor Newsom’s executive orders prohibiting the convening of public agency 
meetings in light of the COVID-19 pandemic, all regularly scheduled Marina del Rey 
Design Control Board meetings will convene as virtual (online) meetings and by 
teleconference until further notice.   
 
OBSERVING THE MEETING   
To observe the meeting, go to http://beaches.lacounty.gov/watch-dcb-meeting (Zoom 
Meeting ID: 913 7426 1482) or dial (408) 638-0968 or (669) 900-6833.   
 
PROVIDING VERBAL PUBLIC COMMENT 
To provide verbal public comment for the record during the meeting, go to 
http://beaches.lacounty.gov/watch-dcb-meeting (Zoom Meeting ID: 913 7426 1482) 
and staff will assist you via the Zoom chat feature.  
 
If you are calling in to the meeting, send an email to DBHPlanner@bh.lacounty.gov with 
the agenda item number, first name, last name, email address, and phone number, and 
identify yourself as the applicant or not the applicant. 
 
PROVIDING WRITTEN PUBLIC COMMENT 
To provide written public comment for the record, send an email to 
DBHPlanner@bh.lacounty.gov with your comment, the agenda item number, your first 
name and last name, email address, and phone number, and identify yourself as the 
applicant or not the applicant. Written comments submitted prior to 5 p.m. on the day 
before the meeting will be provided to the Design Control Board. Written public comments 
submitted after 5 p.m. on the day before the meeting will not be provided to the Design 
Control Board, but will be added to the public record. 



Design Control Board Agenda 
April 21, 2021 
Page 2  
 

 
 

1.  Call to Order, Action on Absences, Pledge of Allegiance, and Order of Agenda 
 

2.  Approval of the January 20, 2020 Minutes 
 
3.  Consent Agenda 

The Chair may entertain a motion by a Board member at the beginning of the meeting to approve certain non-
controversial agenda items as consent agenda items unless held by a Board member or member(s) of the 
public for discussion or separate action. 

  
4.  Old Business 
 None 
 
5.   New Business 
             A.  Parcel 42 – Marina del Rey Hotel / Tesla Motors Inc. – DCB # 21-001 – Consideration of Tesla Supercharging 

station  
 
6. Staff Reports 

 A.  Ongoing Activities Report 
• Board of Supervisors Actions on Items Relating to Marina del Rey 
• Regional Planning Commission’s Calendar 
• Coastal Commission’s Calendar 
• Future Major DCB Agenda Items 
• Small Craft Harbor Commission Minutes  
• Redevelopment Project Status Report 

 
B.  Marina del Rey Special Events 

 
7.  Public Comment 

This is the opportunity for members of the public to address the Board on items that are not on the posted 
agenda, provided that the subject matter is within the jurisdiction of the Board.  Speakers are reminded of the 
three-minute time limitation. 

 
8.   Adjournment 

 
 

PLEASE NOTE 
 

1. ADA ACCOMODATIONS:  If you require reasonable accommodations or auxiliary aids and services such 
as material in alternate format or a sign language interpreter, please contact the ADA (Americans with 
Disabilities Act) Coordinator at (424) 526-7752 (Voice) or (TTY/TDD) users, please call the California 
Relay Service at 711.  The ADA coordinator may be reached by email at rstassi@bh.lacounty.gov. 
 

2. The Los Angeles County Board of Supervisors adopted Chapter 2.160 of the Los Angeles Code (Ord. 93-
0031 ~ 2 (part), 1993), relating to lobbyists.  Any person who seeks support or endorsement from the 
Design Control Board on any official action must certify that he/she is familiar with the requirements of this 
ordinance.  A copy of the ordinance can be provided prior to the meeting and certification is to be made 
before or at the meeting. 
 

3. Si necesita asistencia para interpretar esta información, llame a este numero: 424-526-7777. 
 

4. All materials provided to the Design Control Board Members are available for public review, beginning the 
Friday prior to the meeting, at https://beaches.lacounty.gov/design-control-board/.  The Department of 



Design Control Board Agenda 
April 21, 2021 
Page 3  
 

Beaches and Harbors website also provides all reports and audio files from current and past meetings.  
Electronic copies of project submittals for Business Items referred to in this agenda will be available online 
for a two week period from the date of this agenda. 

 
 



Location of April 21, 2021 DCB Items

Old Business
None

New Business
5A – Parcel 42 – Marina del Rey Hotel

Parcel 42



1 
 

DESIGN CONTROL BOARD MINUTES 
January 20, 2021 

 

Members Present: Meg Rushing Coffee, Member (First District); Steven Cho, Chair (Fourth 
District); Tony Wong, P.E., Vice Chair (Fifth District) 
 
Members Absent: None 
 
Department Staff Present: Amy Caves, Deputy Director; Michael Tripp, Planning Division Chief; 
Maral Tashjian, Planning Specialist; Porsche White, Planner; Tor-Ree Jones-Freeman, Secretary 
 
County Staff Present: Joseph Abdelkerim, County Counsel; Rob Glaser, Supervising Regional 
Planner; Clark Taylor, Regional Planner 
 
Guests Testifying: Aaron Clark, Armbruster Goldsmith & Delvac LLP; Daniel Taban, Pacific 
Ocean Management; Dean Gayon, ACRM Architects & Interiors; Sandy Chung, TCA Architects; 
Kathy Wishard, LRM 
 
1. Call to Order and Pledge of Allegiance 

Chair Cho called the meeting to order at 1:36 p.m. and led the Pledge of Allegiance. 
 

2. Approval of the December 16, 2020 Minutes  
 
Moved by Vice Chair Wong, seconded by Ms. Coffee. The December 16, 2020 minutes 
were approved.  

 
  Ayes: 3 – Vice Chair Wong, Ms. Coffee, Chair Cho 
  Nays: 0 
 
3. Consent Agenda 

None  
 
4. Old Business 

A. Parcel 9 – Marriott Courtyard and Residence Inn – DCB # 04-015-H – Consideration of 
dock gate 

 
Ms. White presented the staff report. 
 
Public Comment 
None 

 
Board Comment 
Vice Chair Wong asked if there were different styles of dock gates located along the 
promenade, as the gate presented appeared to be different from other gates. 
 
Ms. White responded saying yes. 
 
Vice Chair Wong asked if there were any requirements for this type of gate. 



Design Control Board Minutes 
January 20, 2021 
Page 2 of 6 
 

 
Ms. Tashjian responded that there are no standards for gate designs.  
 
Ms. Coffee asked if the dock gate would only be available to guests of the hotel or if the gate 
would be open to the public. She also inquired if the gate would be continuously open or if a 
key would be needed to open it. 
 
Ms. White responded that the gate would be connected to the public transient docks and 
would be available to the public, and that there would be a locking mechanism for the gate. 
She deferred to the applicant to provide more information. 
 
Chair Cho inquired about the location of the public docks. 
 
Ms. White responded that the transient docks front the hotel.  
 
Chair Cho inquired about the number of boats that could be accommodated by the transient 
docks. 
 
Ms. White responded that the transient docks consist of four dock fingers and the number of 
boats able to use the docks at one time could vary.  
 
Ms. Coffee inquired about the purpose of transient docks. 
 
Ms. White explained that transient docks can be used by the public for an established amount 
of time.  
 
Ms. Coffee asked if transient docks are similar to boat parking spaces.  
 
Ms. Tashjian agreed and reiterated that the docks would be used like short-term parking for 
boats. 
 
Ms. Coffee asked for further explanation from the applicant about how the public would utilize 
the gate. 
 
Ms. Tashjian noted that two applicants were present, Dean Gayon and Aaron Clark.  
 
Mr. Clark introduced the project and explained why the transient docks were created, 
indicating that the docks were part of a Coastal Commission condition of approval for the 
development of the adjacent Neptune Marina Apartments. He further explained that in addition 
to the docks, a portion of Parcel 9U would need to be developed as a public wetland park, 
which was almost complete. He also noted that there would be no unfettered access through 
the proposed dock gate from the landside due to safety considerations. The hotel would work 
with the County to manage the logistics of the dock operations, so there would be control over 
the vessels using them. Mr. Clark explained that the hotel concierge would serve as the dock 
master over the anchorage and that the hotel operator was working with the County to develop 
a public dock management agreement.   
 
Ms. Coffee thanked Mr. Clark for his response. 
 



Design Control Board Minutes 
January 20, 2021 
Page 3 of 6 
 

Vice Chair Wong asked Mr. Clark if a hotel contact would be provided for people who needed 
to gain access to the docks through the gate.  
 
Mr. Clark responded saying yes. Mr. Clark noted that normally the County would operate the 
public docks, however, a management agreement was being created between the County 
and the hotel operator, for the hotel operator to manage the docks.  He believed that the docks 
would play nicely into the experience of the hotel whereby people could utilize the docks, 
enjoy al fresco dining along the promenade, have access to the wetland park, or go down to 
the Silver Strand. 

 
Chair Cho asked if there would be an intercom system associated with the docks.  
 
Mr. Clark responded that those details were being worked out and would be resolved before 
the docks opened to the public.  He mentioned that the Department of Beaches and Harbors 
Asset Management Division was working with the lessee to establish clear protocols for use 
of the docks.  
 
Vice Chair Wong asked if the design of the gate from the seaside would allow people to exit 
onto the promenade in case of emergencies.  
 
Mr. Clark responded that the public would be able to get out of the gate and noted that the 
intent of the gate was to ensure controlled access for people who have reservations to use 
the docks. Mr. Clark detailed a scenario regarding people that loiter around transient docks in 
other areas of the Marina, which was why security in the area would be important. He also 
noted that the adjacent Neptune Marina and Tahiti Marina anchorages were privately sold and 
there would need to be coordination with all the parties to make sure the transient docks 
function smoothly.  
 
Vice Chair Wong noted that he worked on a gate design in the Marina where similar 
discussions occurred.  
 
Ms. Tashjian noted that Mr. Gayon wrote a message indicating he was sorry he has no 
microphone connection and that Mr. Clark’s description was consistent with his understanding 
of how the gate access would work.  
 
Vice Chair Wong moved to approve the DCB # 04-015-H, seconded by Chair Cho. There 
was a delay in roll call for the vote due to technical difficulties. Ms. Tashjian asked for 
a few minutes to allow Ms. Coffee to return. Ms. Coffee rejoined by phone. 
 

Ayes: 3 – Ms. Coffee, Vice Chair Wong, Chair Cho 
  Nays: 0 

 
The motion was carried. 
 
B. Parcel 95 & LLS – Marina West Shopping Center – DCB # 20-002-B Consideration of  
modifications to conceptual design for site redevelopment. 

 
Ms. White presented the staff report. 
 
 



Design Control Board Minutes 
January 20, 2021 
Page 4 of 6 
 

Public Comment 
None 
 
Board Comment 
Chair Cho asked if there were any applicants present for this project.   
 
Ms. Tashjian responded that there were four applicants from the project team: Aaron Clark, 
Kathy Wishard, Daniel Taban, and Sandy Chung. 
 
Mr. Clark introduced the project team. He noted that discovering new easements on the 
property were a blessing because the team was able to design a variety of enhancements for 
the project. He thanked staff for their work on the project and asked Mr. Taban to address the 
Board. 
 
Mr. Taban introduced himself and thanked the Department for working with his team. He 
stated that the team was aware of two prior easements that bisected the site, but was recently 
made aware of an unrecorded Los Angeles Department of Water and Power (LADWP) 
easement.  He then explained conversations the project team had with LADWP and how 
additional opportunities were identified in regards to the easements. He noted that the site no 
longer had a limitation to providing a parkway along Via Dolce and as such the team expanded 
the public space previously on the west side of Building 3 and moved it more towards the west 
between Buildings 1 and 2. He also noted that Building 3 was also shifted slightly to the west 
to also open up the gateway park on Via Marina and Washington Boulevard. Mr. Taban stated 
that the proposed park design was the fourth design iteration and what was presented at the 
meeting was a culmination of thoughtful design effort and due diligence, which he believed 
created an overall better project for the community. 
 
Ms. Wishard thanked the team and Ms. White for summarizing the major changes. She agreed 
that a lot of effort had gone into the corner park design. She noted that there was a placeholder 
within the corner planter of the gateway park for a park identification sign, and therefore, the 
planter may need to be adjusted in the future. Ms. Wishard expressed that enlarging the patio 
of the building adjacent to the park was a nice addition that was incorporated due to the 
building shift. She stated that before this change, there was an anemic patio space, which 
now looked like an appropriate scale, allowing more interactions and seating along the park. 
Ms. Wishard felt that the project team incorporated the majority of comments received 
regarding the park. Ms. Wishard explained the design intent behind certain elements within 
the proposed park and the newly proposed mid-block plaza. She explained that the design of 
the mid-block plaza was similar to the design of the corner park, on a more intimate scale. 
She noted that there was also a building overhang within the space  which would be used as 
a public patio. Ms. Wishard explained that for Via Dolce, the project team was able to include 
a parkway with trees along the curb edge while meeting the City of Los Angeles’ standards. 
She also noted that the changes made along Via Dolce allowed the project team to open up 
the corner and a include a larger tented patio space. 
 
Mr. Taban commented that the project team felt that it was appropriate to increase the height 
of the building floors by approximately one foot, which increased each of the building heights. 
He explained that the project was still significantly below the 140-foot height limit, but the team 
was looking to allow more light into the units to make them more enjoyable for residents as 
they would most likely be spending more time in the units. He also noted other changes that 
were required due to the building being shifted to the west.  



Design Control Board Minutes 
January 20, 2021 
Page 5 of 6 
 

 
Ms. Coffee commented that the park design looked great, and she  appreciated the Applicant’s 
willingness to work with the County on improving the design. She agreed that the current 
design was stronger and addressed the public in a much more complete way. Ms. Coffee also 
appreciated the way the project team repeated some of the design vocabulary from the 
gateway park in the mid-block open space.  
 
Chair Cho responded that the corner park looked very good and incorporating a mid-block 
plaza instead of the originally proposed driveway improved the project design. Chair Cho 
noted that Washington Boulevard was a large thoroughfare for bicycles. He then asked the 
Applicant if the project would have bike parking. 
 
Ms. Wishard responded that the project team anticipated adding more bike parking along the 
project frontage, along Washington Boulevard. She also stated that the project team intended 
to scatter bicycle parking near various retail shops so patrons would have immediate bicycle 
parking in addition to the spaces that were specific to the plazas. 
 
Mr. Clark asked Ms. Chung to comment on how the project team intended to meet code 
requirements for long-term and short-term bicycle parking. 
 
Ms. Chung indicated that all long-term parking is located within the buildings and short-term 
parking would be located along the sidewalks.  
 
Mr. Clark asked Ms. Chung to comment on how many short-term bicycle parking spaces 
versus long-term spaces would be at the site. 
 
Ms. Chung responded that  35 short-term spaces and 88 long-term spaces would be provided, 
which would include an additional 14 spaces above requirements since the project team would 
request a 5% reduction in commercial parking.  
 
Vice Chair Wong moved to approve DCB # 20-002-B, seconded by Ms. Coffee. 
 

Ayes: 3 – Ms. Coffee, Vice Chair Wong, Chair Cho 
  Nays: 0 
 
The motion was carried. 
 

5. New Business 
None 
 

6. Staff Reports 
All reports were received and filed. 
 
Moved by Ms. Coffee, seconded by Vice Chair Wong 
 
  Ayes: 3 – Vice Chair Wong, Ms. Coffee, Chair Cho 
  Nays: 0 

 
7. Public Comment 

None 



Design Control Board Minutes 
January 20, 2021 
Page 6 of 6 
 
 
8. Adjournment 

Chair Cho adjourned the meeting at 2:27 p.m. 
 
 

Respectfully Submitted, 
 
 
 

Tor-Ree Jones-Freeman 
Secretary for the Design Control Board 









SHEET NUMBER

SHEET TITLE

IT IS A VIOLATION OF THE LAW FOR ANY PERSON,
UNLESS THEY ARE ACTING UNDER THE DIRECTION

OF A LICENSED PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER, TO
ALTER THIS DOCUMENT.

REV DATE DESCRIPTION
A 10.21.19

CHECKED BY: RP/KMD

DRAWN BY:

GPD PROJECT NUMBER:

GMY

2018241.57

T-1

13534 BALI WAY
(TESLA STATION)

MARINA DEL REY, CA 90292

TITLE SHEET &
PROJECT DATA

INSTALLATION MANAGER: NADIR HOSSAIN

B 01.03.20
C 03.13.20 REVISED PER AHJ

SIGNED AND SEALED
ISSUED FOR 100% REVIEW

D 03.17.21 REVISED PER AHJ

GPD GROUP, INC. ®

520 South Main Street, Suite 2531
Akron, OH 44311

330.572.2100 Fax 330.572.2101

0 03.24.21 REVISED PER AHJ

DRAWING INDEX

FLOOD HAZARD AREA NOTE

BEFORE SCALING & PLAN REPRODUCTION WARNING

· INSTALL (2) V3 SUPERCHARGER  CABINETS
· INSTALL (8) V3 CHARGING POSTS
· INSTALL (1) MASTER CONTROLLER
· INSTALL (1) SWITCHGEAR ASSEMBLY
· INSTALL (1) UTILITY TRANSFORMER

ADDRESS:
13534 BALI WAY
(TESLA STATION)
MARINA DEL REY, CA 90292

POWER COMPANY:
SOCAL EDISON
CONTACT: CORY SKILLERN
(909) 278-9054

PROPERTY OWNER:
INVEST WEST/PACIFICA HOTELS
CONTACT: VAN WONG
(949) 491-8021

EQUIPMENT SUPPLIER:
TESLA, INC.
3500 DEER CREEK ROAD
PALO ALTO, CA 94304
(650) 681-5000

PERMIT COORDINATOR:
NADIR HOSSAIN
(858) 382-4742
NHOSSAIN@TESLA.COM

GPD GROUP, INC. CONTACTS:

PROJECT MANAGER:
ZACHERY SHEETS, PE - OH# 77870
(330)572-2148
ZSHEETS@GPDGROUP.COM

PROJECT COORDINATOR:

UTILITY COORDINATOR:

DESIGN CRITERIA:

WIND SPEED = 110 MPH 3-SECOND GUST, ULTIMATE
EXPOSURE = C
CATEGORY = II
FROST DEPTH = 5"

SITE INFORMATION APPLICABLE CODES PROJECT DESCRIPTION
T-1

SHEET TITLE

TITLE SHEET & PROJECT DATA

CIVIL

LOCATION MAP VICINITY MAP

GN-1

GN-2

GN-3

--

C-1A

C-2

C-3A

C-5

C-6

GENERAL NOTES

TOPOGRAPHIC SURVEY (BY OTHERS)

OVERALL SITE PLAN

DEMOLITION PLAN

SITE PLAN

EQUIPMENT DIMENSION PLAN

CIVIL DETAILS

GENERAL NOTES

GENERAL NOTES

C-7 CIVIL DETAILS

GREG YANDA
(330) 572-3629
GYANDA@GPDGROUP.COM

JADEN BEACHY
330-572-3643
JBEACHY@GPDGROUP.COM

CHARGING STATION
13534 BALI WAY (TESLA STATION)

MARINA DEL REY, CA 90292

CONTRACTORS SHALL VERIFY ALL PLANS, EXISTING DIMENSIONS, AND FIELD
CONDITIONS ON THE JOB SITE AND SHALL IMMEDIATELY NOTIFY THE ENGINEER
IN WRITING OF ANY DISCREPANCIES BEFORE PROCEEDING WITH THE WORK OR
BE RESPONSIBLE FOR SAME.

MAP DATA ©2019 GOOGLE MAP DATA ©2019 GOOGLE

LATITUDE (NAVD88)

LONGITUDE (NAVD88)

PERMITTING JURISDICTION:
LOS ANGELES COUNTY
201 N FIGUEROA ST.
LOS ANGELES, CA 90012
CONTACT: TBD

COUNTY:
LOS ANGELES

N 33°58'50.0"
33.980568

W -118°26'44.6"
118.445732-

- TESLA V3 DATASHEET
ALL WORK SHALL COMPLY WITH THE FOLLOWING APPLICABLE CODES:

2019 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, 2019 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE, 2019 CALIFORNIA
ENERGY CODE, 2019 CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE, 2019 CALIFORNIA PLUMBING
CODE, 2019 CA BUILDING ENERGY EFFICIENCY STANDARDS, 2020 LOS ANGELES
COUNTY ELECTRICAL CODE
2019 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE

2019 CBC 11B: ACCESSIBILITY TO PUBLIC BUILDINGS, PUBLIC ACCOMODATIONS,
COMMERCIAL BUILDINGS, AND PUBLIC HOUSING

IN THE EVENT OF CONFLICT, THE MOST RESTRICTIVE CODE SHALL PREVAIL.

THE SITE IS LOCATED IN FLOOD ZONE "X (SHADED)" (AREAS OF 0.2% ANNUAL
CHANCE FLOOD PLAIN) AND ZONE "X" (AREAS DETERMINED TO BE OUTSIDE

THE 0.2% ANNUAL CHANCE FLOODPLAIN) PER FLOOD INSURANCE MAP NUMBER
06037C1752F, EFFECTIVE DATE - 09/26/2008.

SITE

SITE

C-3B SITE PLAN

C-3C SITE PLAN

C-8 CIVIL DETAILS

C-4A GRADING PLAN

C-4B GRADING PLAN

C-9 CALIFORNIA ADA STANDARDS

C-10 EQUIPMENT ELEVATIONS

C-1B PROJECT NARRATIVE SITE MAP
0

03/24/2021



FOR REFERENCE ONLY

NOT TO SCALE



DEAD B
ACK

FR
ONT

SHEET NUMBER

SHEET TITLE

IT IS A VIOLATION OF THE LAW FOR ANY PERSON,
UNLESS THEY ARE ACTING UNDER THE DIRECTION

OF A LICENSED PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER, TO
ALTER THIS DOCUMENT.

REV DATE DESCRIPTION
A 10.21.19

CHECKED BY: RP/KMD

DRAWN BY:

GPD PROJECT NUMBER:

GMY

2018241.57

C-1A

13534 BALI WAY
(TESLA STATION)

MARINA DEL REY, CA 90292

OVERALL SITE
PLAN

OVERALL SITE PLAN

INSTALLATION MANAGER: NADIR HOSSAIN

B 01.03.20
C 03.13.20 REVISED PER AHJ

SIGNED AND SEALED
ISSUED FOR 100% REVIEW

D 03.17.21 REVISED PER AHJ

GPD GROUP, INC. ®

520 South Main Street, Suite 2531
Akron, OH 44311

330.572.2100 Fax 330.572.2101

0 03.24.21 REVISED PER AHJ

0' 20' 40' SCALE: 1"=40'

BALI W
AY

MARINA DEL
REY HOTEL

HALF SIZE

1. AERIAL IMAGERY FROM GOOGLE EARTH DATED ON
03/14/2018. THIS PLAN IS FOR REFERENCE ONLY.

MAP DATA: GOOGLE, LANDSAT, COPERNICUS

2. PROPERTY LINE AND RIGHT-OF-WAY BOUNDARIES
ARE SHOWN FOR REFERENCE ONLY. REFER TO
SURVEY BY OTHERS FOR EXACT LOCATION.

NOTES:EASEMENT LEGEND

EXISTING 10' BUILDING SETBACK

EXISTING 11' UTILITY EASEMENT

EXISTING EXCLUSION FROM PARKING
AND CONSTRUCTION EASEMENT

PROJECT AREA: SEE SITE
PLAN ON SHEET C-3A.

ZONE X SHADED

ZONE X
APPROXIMATE

FLOODPLAIN LINE

EXISTING
VAULT

PROJECT AREA: SEE SITE
PLAN ON SHEET C-3B.

FULL SIZE 0' 20' 40' SCALE: 1"=20'

PROJECT AREA: SEE SITE
PLAN ON SHEET C-3C.

EXISTING PARKING AND
CONSTRUCTION EASEMENT
(WIDTH VARIES)

03/24/2021



SHEET NUMBER

SHEET TITLE

IT IS A VIOLATION OF THE LAW FOR ANY PERSON,
UNLESS THEY ARE ACTING UNDER THE DIRECTION

OF A LICENSED PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER, TO
ALTER THIS DOCUMENT.

REV DATE DESCRIPTION
A 10.21.19

CHECKED BY: RP/KMD

DRAWN BY:

GPD PROJECT NUMBER:

GMY

2018241.57

C-1B

13534 BALI WAY
(TESLA STATION)

MARINA DEL REY, CA 90292

OVERALL SITE
PLAN

OVERALL SITE PLAN

INSTALLATION MANAGER: NADIR HOSSAIN

B 01.03.20
C 03.13.20 REVISED PER AHJ

SIGNED AND SEALED
ISSUED FOR 100% REVIEW

D 03.17.21 REVISED PER AHJ

GPD GROUP, INC. ®

520 South Main Street, Suite 2531
Akron, OH 44311

330.572.2100 Fax 330.572.2101

0 03.24.21 REVISED PER AHJ

PROJECT NARRATIVE SITE  MAP 1 PROJECT NARRATIVE SITE MAP 2

03/24/2021



SHEET NUMBER

SHEET TITLE

IT IS A VIOLATION OF THE LAW FOR ANY PERSON,
UNLESS THEY ARE ACTING UNDER THE DIRECTION

OF A LICENSED PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER, TO
ALTER THIS DOCUMENT.

REV DATE DESCRIPTION
A 10.21.19

CHECKED BY: RP/KMD

DRAWN BY:

GPD PROJECT NUMBER:

GMY

2018241.57

C-2

13534 BALI WAY
(TESLA STATION)

MARINA DEL REY, CA 90292

DEMOLITION PLAN

DEMOLITION PLAN

INSTALLATION MANAGER: NADIR HOSSAIN

B 01.03.20
C 03.13.20 REVISED PER AHJ

SIGNED AND SEALED
ISSUED FOR 100% REVIEW

D 03.17.21 REVISED PER AHJ

GPD GROUP, INC. ®

520 South Main Street, Suite 2531
Akron, OH 44311

330.572.2100 Fax 330.572.2101

0 03.24.21 REVISED PER AHJ

0' 10' 20' SCALE: 1"=20'

EXISTING ASPHALT TO BE REMOVED
TRENCHING NOT INCLUDED

XX L.F.±
DENOTES LIMITS OF SAWCUT

1. CONTRACTOR SHALL REMOVE EXISTING PAVEMENT AND/OR CURB USING
CLEAN SAWCUTS TO INSTALL PROPOSED UNDERGROUND CONDUITS AND
REPLACE PAVEMENT AND/OR CURB AFTER CONDUITS HAVE BEEN
INSTALLED.  SEE ELECTRICAL SHEETS FOR CONDUIT ROUTING,
APPROXIMATE CONDUIT RUN LENGTHS AND TRENCH DETAIL. CONTRACTOR
SHALL MEET OR EXCEED EXISTING PAVEMENT SPECIFICATIONS. NOTIFY
ENGINEER OF ANY DISCREPANCIES PRIOR TO PERFORMING WORK.

2. APPLY LIQUID ASPHALT AT ALL JOINTS BETWEEN CONCRETE AND ASPHALT
AND WHERE PROPOSED ASPHALT MEETS EXISTING, INCLUDING SAW CUT
JOINTS.

3. FOR TRAFFIC CONTROL PROCEDURES (IF APPLICABLE), SEE TRAFFIC
CONTROL NOTES ON SHEET GN-1.

4. EXISTING LANDSCAPING AREA REMOVED FOR PROPOSED CONSTRUCTION:
190 SQ.FT.

GENERAL SHEET NOTES1. PROPERTY LINE AND RIGHT-OF-WAY BOUNDARIES
ARE SHOWN FOR REFERENCE ONLY. REFER TO
SURVEY BY OTHERS FOR EXACT LOCATION.

NOTE: DEMOLITION KEYNOTES AND LEGEND

1. EXISTING CURB TO BE REMOVED.

2. EXISTING PAVEMENT MARKINGS TO BE REMOVED. CONTRACTOR SHALL REMOVE
MARKINGS WITH SMALL HANDHELD GRINDERS, SCARIFIERS, BEAD BLASTING OR
OTHER METHODS, WITH THE APPROVAL OF THE ENGINEER OF RECORD. TAKE
CARE DURING MARKING REMOVAL TO NOT SCAR, DISCOLOR, OR OTHERWISE
DAMAGE THE PAVEMENT SURFACE. DO NOT OVER PAINT OR USE OTHER
METHODS OF COVERING MARKINGS IN LIEU OF REMOVAL.

3. EXISTING MAGNOLIA GRANDIFLORA TREE TO BE RELOCATED (APPROXIMATELY
12'-0"  HEIGHT, TYPICAL OF 2). SEE SHEET C-3B FOR PROPOSED LOCATION.

4. EXISTING MASONRY WALL TO REMAIN AND BE PROTECTED THROUGHOUT
CONSTRUCTION.

#

2
TYP.

1
TYP.

2
TYP.

2
TYP.

1

8'-4"
TYP.

18
'-0

"
TY

P.
16

'-1
"

TY
P.

27
'-4

"
EX

IS
TI

N
G

 D
R

IV
E 

AI
SL

E

10 L.F.±

20
 L.

F.
±

1 L.F.±

60 L.F.±

2 
L.

F.
±

3 
L.

F.
±

3

1

8'-6" 8'-5"
TYP.

9'-7"±TYP.

9'-1"TYP.

7'-1"

9'-9"10'-3"

9'-2"
9'-3"

9'-7"

HALF SIZE

FULL SIZE 0' 20'10' SCALE: 1"=10'

4

0

0

0

03/24/2021



D
EA

D
 B

AC
K

FR
O

N
T

D
EA

D
 B

AC
K

FR
O

N
T

SHEET NUMBER

SHEET TITLE

IT IS A VIOLATION OF THE LAW FOR ANY PERSON,
UNLESS THEY ARE ACTING UNDER THE DIRECTION

OF A LICENSED PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER, TO
ALTER THIS DOCUMENT.

REV DATE DESCRIPTION
A 10.21.19

CHECKED BY: RP/KMD

DRAWN BY:

GPD PROJECT NUMBER:

GMY

2018241.57

C-3A

13534 BALI WAY
(TESLA STATION)

MARINA DEL REY, CA 90292

SITE PLAN

SITE PLAN

INSTALLATION MANAGER: NADIR HOSSAIN

B 01.03.20
C 03.13.20 REVISED PER AHJ

SIGNED AND SEALED
ISSUED FOR 100% REVIEW

D 03.17.21 REVISED PER AHJ

GPD GROUP, INC. ®

520 South Main Street, Suite 2531
Akron, OH 44311

330.572.2100 Fax 330.572.2101

0 03.24.21 REVISED PER AHJ

0' 10' 20' SCALE: 1"=20'

1. PROPOSED EQUIPMENT CLEAR SPACE (TYPICAL).

2. PROPOSED ELECTRIC METER MOUNTED TO SWITCHGEAR PER ELECTRIC
COMPANY SPECIFICATIONS AND DETAILS ON ELECTRICAL SHEETS.

3. PROPOSED SWITCHGEAR ASSEMBLY PER ELECTRICAL DRAWINGS. SEE
SHEET C-7 FOR ANCHORAGE DETAIL.

4. PROPOSED TESLA CHARGE POST WITH INDIVIDUAL PRECAST CONCRETE
FOUNDATION (TYPICAL OF 8). SEE DETAILS ON SHEET C-6.

5. PROPOSED TESLA NON-ILLUMINATED PARKING SIGN (TYPICAL OF 8). SEE
DETAILS ON SHEET C-6. SEE CHARGING POST SCHEDULE THIS SHEET
FOR SIGN TYPE. WHERE APPLICABLE, CONTRACTOR SHALL MOUNT SIGN
TO LIGHT POLE IN LIEU OF POST.

6. PROPOSED TESLA CHARGING CABINET WITH CONCRETE FOUNDATION
(TYPICAL OF 2). SEE DETAILS ON SHEETS C-6 & C-7.

7. PROPOSED MASTER CONTROLLER MOUNTED TO H-FRAME. SEE
ELECTRICAL SHEETS.

8. PROPOSED CONCRETE PAD. SEE DETAIL ON SHEET C-7.

9. PROPOSED PAINTED DOUBLE WIDE SOLID WHITE STRIPE TO MATCH
EXISTING SITE CONDITIONS.

10. PROPOSED PAINTED 4" WIDE WHITE TRANSVERSE STRIPING. STRIPING
SHALL BE 3'-0" O.C. SEE DETAIL ON SHEET C-7.

11. PROPOSED 6" CONCRETE CURB. SEE DETAIL ON SHEET C-7.

12. PROPOSED 4" YELLOW CONCRETE BOLLARD (TYPICAL OF 10). SEE DETAIL
ON SHEET C-6.

13. PROPOSED WHEELSTOPS (TYPICAL OF 8). SEE DETAIL ON SHEET C-7.

14. ALL AREAS NOT TO BE PAVED SHALL BE MULCHED PER
LANDSCAPE/IRRIGATION NOTES ON SHEET GN-2.

15. PROPOSED LANDSCAPE: PERENNIAL. (8) TOTAL DIETES FLAVIDA, WOOD
IRIS. TO BE PLANTED 1.5' O/C, NO. 2 CONTAINER SIZE. SEE LANDSCAPE
NOTES ON SHEET GN-2. PLANTING DETAIL ON SHEET C-8.

PROPOSED ASPHALT PAVEMENT TO MATCH
EXISTING IN TYPE AND DEPTH. INCLUDE
ENGINEERED COMPACTED BACKFILL BELOW
PAVEMENT SECTION. TRENCHING NOT INCLUDED

1. CONTRACTOR SHALL REMOVE EXISTING PAVEMENT AND/OR CURB USING CLEAN SAWCUTS TO INSTALL
PROPOSED UNDERGROUND CONDUITS AND REPLACE PAVEMENT AND/OR CURB AFTER CONDUITS
HAVE BEEN INSTALLED.  SEE ELECTRICAL SHEETS FOR CONDUIT ROUTING, APPROXIMATE CONDUIT
RUN LENGTHS AND TRENCH DETAIL. CONTRACTOR SHALL MEET OR EXCEED EXISTING PAVEMENT
SPECIFICATIONS. NOTIFY ENGINEER OF ANY DISCREPANCIES PRIOR TO PERFORMING WORK.

2. APPLY LIQUID ASPHALT AT ALL JOINTS BETWEEN CONCRETE AND ASPHALT AND WHERE PROPOSED
ASPHALT MEETS EXISTING, INCLUDING SAW CUT JOINTS.

3. FOR TRAFFIC CONTROL PROCEDURES (IF APPLICABLE), SEE TRAFFIC CONTROL NOTES ON SHEET GN-1.

GENERAL SHEET NOTES

PROPERTY LINE AND RIGHT-OF-WAY BOUNDARIES
ARE SHOWN FOR REFERENCE ONLY. REFER TO
SURVEY BY OTHERS FOR EXACT LOCATION.

NOTE:PARKING STALL SCHEDULE

21
EXISTING STANDARD
STALLS UTILIZED AS A
RESULT OF THIS PROJECT

PROPOSED TESLA STALLS 8

PROPOSED STANDARD STALLS

NET STALL COUNT

13

0

CONSTRUCTION KEYNOTES AND LEGEND #CHARGING POST CIRCUIT SCHEDULE
CHARGING CABINET DEDICATED/ENABLEDCHARGE POST

1A

1B

DEDICATED

DEDICATED

1C

1D

DEDICATED

DEDICATED

2A

2B

2C

2D

1

2

DEDICATED

DEDICATED

DEDICATED

DEDICATED

CONTRACTOR TO ENSURE PROTECTION
OF UNDERGROUND SANITARY-LINE
DURING CONSTRUCTION & CONTACT
ENGINEER OF RECORD IF THERE ARE
ANY DISCREPANCIES IN FIELD.

EQUIPMENT ENLARGEMENT DETAIL
HALF SIZE: 1"=10'
FULL SIZE: 1"=5'

CONTRACTOR TO ENSURE PROTECTION
OF GAS METER AND UNDERGROUND

GAS-LINE DURING CONSTRUCTION

ZONE X SHADED

ZONE X
APPROXIMATE

FLOODPLAIN LINE

2

8

3

12

12

6

1

4

5
45

13
11

11

11

11

99

9

10
14

14

1

2
1A

1B1C1D2A2B2C2D

TYP.

TYP.

TYP.

TYP.

TYP.

TYP.

TYP.

TYP.
TYP.

TYP.

TYP.

13
TYP.

RELOCATE EXISTING
UNDERGROUND ELECTRICAL

LINE AS NECESSARY

PROJECT AREA: SEE EQUIPMENT
ENLARGEMENT DETAIL ON THIS
SHEET.

V3 (250kW) TESLA OUTDOOR EQUIPMENT SCHEDULE
TESLA EQUIPMENT

CHARGING POST 

DESCRIPTION

VERSION 3 1450758-00-D 2

PART NUMBER QUANTITY

VERSION 3 8

CHARGING CABINET

1088585-00-D

SITE MASTER CONTROLLER INDUSTRIAL SITE CONTROLLER 11137202-02-C

CHARGING POST FOUNDATION UNIVERSAL PRECAST 1478598-00-A 8

ASY CONST. TEMPLATE SC3 1521279-00-A 2CHARGING CABINET BASE TEMPLATE

TYP.

1 TYP.

7

M
AT

C
H

LI
N

E 
O

N
 S

H
EE

T 
C

-3
B

HALF SIZE

FULL SIZE 0' 20'10' SCALE: 1"=10'

M
AT

C
H

LI
N

E 
O

N
 S

H
EE

T 
C

-3
C

RELOCATE EXISTING
UNDERGROUND ELECTRICAL

LINE AS NECESSARY

PROPOSED GROUNDCOVER:
TRACHELOSPERMUM JASMOIDES, STAR
JASMINE.  (12) TOTAL QUANTITY, SPACED 1.5'
O/C, TRIANGULAR SPACING. SEE PLANTING
DETAIL ON SHEET C-9

15 TYP.

14

14

0

0

03/24/2021



SHEET NUMBER

SHEET TITLE

IT IS A VIOLATION OF THE LAW FOR ANY PERSON,
UNLESS THEY ARE ACTING UNDER THE DIRECTION

OF A LICENSED PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER, TO
ALTER THIS DOCUMENT.

REV DATE DESCRIPTION
A 10.21.19

CHECKED BY: RP/KMD

DRAWN BY:

GPD PROJECT NUMBER:

GMY

2018241.57

C-3B

13534 BALI WAY
(TESLA STATION)

MARINA DEL REY, CA 90292

SITE PLAN

SITE PLAN

INSTALLATION MANAGER: NADIR HOSSAIN

B 01.03.20
C 03.13.20 REVISED PER AHJ

SIGNED AND SEALED
ISSUED FOR 100% REVIEW

D 03.17.21 REVISED PER AHJ

GPD GROUP, INC. ®

520 South Main Street, Suite 2531
Akron, OH 44311

330.572.2100 Fax 330.572.2101

0 03.24.21 REVISED PER AHJ

0' 10' 20' SCALE: 1"=20'

1. CONTRACTOR SHALL REMOVE EXISTING PAVEMENT AND/OR CURB USING CLEAN SAWCUTS TO INSTALL
PROPOSED UNDERGROUND CONDUITS AND REPLACE PAVEMENT AND/OR CURB AFTER CONDUITS
HAVE BEEN INSTALLED.  SEE ELECTRICAL SHEETS FOR CONDUIT ROUTING, APPROXIMATE CONDUIT
RUN LENGTHS AND TRENCH DETAIL. CONTRACTOR SHALL MEET OR EXCEED EXISTING PAVEMENT
SPECIFICATIONS. NOTIFY ENGINEER OF ANY DISCREPANCIES PRIOR TO PERFORMING WORK.

2. APPLY LIQUID ASPHALT AT ALL JOINTS BETWEEN CONCRETE AND ASPHALT AND WHERE PROPOSED
ASPHALT MEETS EXISTING, INCLUDING SAW CUT JOINTS.

3. FOR TRAFFIC CONTROL PROCEDURES (IF APPLICABLE), SEE TRAFFIC CONTROL NOTES ON SHEET GN-1.

GENERAL SHEET NOTES PROPERTY LINE AND RIGHT-OF-WAY BOUNDARIES
ARE SHOWN FOR REFERENCE ONLY. REFER TO
SURVEY BY OTHERS FOR EXACT LOCATION.

NOTE: CONSTRUCTION KEYNOTES AND LEGEND #

1. PROPOSED PAD MOUNTED ELECTRICAL UTILITY TRANSFORMER (BY UTILITY).
CONTRACTOR SHALL PROVIDE CONCRETE PAD PER UTILITY SPECIFICATIONS.
COORDINATE FINAL LOCATION WITH UTILITY. SEE ELECTRICAL PLANS FOR
PROPOSED ROUTING.

2. PROPOSED EQUIPMENT CLEAR SPACE (TYPICAL).

3. PROPOSED REMOVABLE UTILITY BARRIER POST PER SCE STANDARDS (TYP.
OF 2). SEE DETAIL ON ELECTRICAL SHEETS. BOLLARDS SHALL BE COLORED
YELLOW UNLESS SPECIFIED OTHERWISE BY THE UTILITY COMPANY.

4. PROPOSED FIXED UTILITY BARRIER POST PER SCE STANDARDS (TYP. OF 5).
SEE DETAIL ON ELECTRICAL SHEETS. BOLLARDS SHALL BE COLORED YELLOW
UNLESS SPECIFIED OTHERWISE BY THE UTILITY COMPANY.

5. PROPOSED LOCATION FOR EXISTING MAGNOLIA GRANDIFLORA TREE
(APPROXIMATELY 12'-0"  HEIGHT, TYPICAL OF 2). SEE RELOCATION NOTES AND
PLANTING DETAIL ON SHEET C-8.

6. PROPOSED LANDSCAPE: PERENNIAL. (17) TOTAL DIETES FLAVIDA, WOOD IRIS.
TO BE PLANTED 1.5' O/C, NO. 2 CONTAINER SIZE. SEE LANDSCAPE NOTES ON
SHEET GN-2. PLANTING DETAIL ON SHEET C-8.

EXISTING
VAULT

1

2

M
AT

C
H

LI
N

E 
O

N
 S

H
EE

T 
C

-3
A

TYP.
3 TYP.

4

TYP.
4

HALF SIZE

FULL SIZE 0' 20'10' SCALE: 1"=10'

5

5

SEE EXISTING CONDITIONS
IMAGE ON THIS SHEET.

EXISTING CONDITIONS PHOTO

TYP.6

0

0

0

03/24/2021



SHEET NUMBER

SHEET TITLE

IT IS A VIOLATION OF THE LAW FOR ANY PERSON,
UNLESS THEY ARE ACTING UNDER THE DIRECTION

OF A LICENSED PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER, TO
ALTER THIS DOCUMENT.

REV DATE DESCRIPTION
A 10.21.19

CHECKED BY: RP/KMD

DRAWN BY:

GPD PROJECT NUMBER:

GMY

2018241.57

C-3C

13534 BALI WAY
(TESLA STATION)

MARINA DEL REY, CA 90292

SITE PLAN

SITE PLAN

INSTALLATION MANAGER: NADIR HOSSAIN

B 01.03.20
C 03.13.20 REVISED PER AHJ

SIGNED AND SEALED
ISSUED FOR 100% REVIEW

D 03.17.21 REVISED PER AHJ

GPD GROUP, INC. ®

520 South Main Street, Suite 2531
Akron, OH 44311

330.572.2100 Fax 330.572.2101

0 03.24.21 REVISED PER AHJ

0' 10'5' SCALE: 1"=10'

1. CONTRACTOR SHALL REMOVE EXISTING PAVEMENT AND/OR CURB USING CLEAN SAWCUTS TO INSTALL
PROPOSED UNDERGROUND CONDUITS AND REPLACE PAVEMENT AND/OR CURB AFTER CONDUITS
HAVE BEEN INSTALLED.  SEE ELECTRICAL SHEETS FOR CONDUIT ROUTING, APPROXIMATE CONDUIT
RUN LENGTHS AND TRENCH DETAIL. CONTRACTOR SHALL MEET OR EXCEED EXISTING PAVEMENT
SPECIFICATIONS. NOTIFY ENGINEER OF ANY DISCREPANCIES PRIOR TO PERFORMING WORK.

2. APPLY LIQUID ASPHALT AT ALL JOINTS BETWEEN CONCRETE AND ASPHALT AND WHERE PROPOSED
ASPHALT MEETS EXISTING, INCLUDING SAW CUT JOINTS.

3. FOR TRAFFIC CONTROL PROCEDURES (IF APPLICABLE), SEE TRAFFIC CONTROL NOTES ON SHEET GN-1.

GENERAL SHEET NOTES
CONSTRUCTION KEYNOTES AND LEGEND #

1. PROPOSED PAINTED 4" WIDE WHITE TRANSVERSE STRIPING. STRIPING
SHALL BE 3'-0" O.C. SEE DETAIL ON SHEET C-7.

HALF SIZE

FULL SIZE 0' 5' 10' SCALE: 1"=5'

1

5'-0"

2'-8"
11'-1"

9'-3"

10
'-3

"
EXISTING ACCESSIBLE PASSENGER
LOADING / DROP-OFF ZONE, SEE
IMAGES ON THIS SHEET.

8'-0"

20'-0"

EXISTING CONDITIONS PHOTO 1

EXISTING CONDITIONS PHOTO 2

0

0

03/24/2021



D
EA

D
 B

AC
K

FR
O

N
T

11

12

11

12

11.18

12.71

12.78

12.60

11.32

11.15

11.01

12.66

1.5
%

TP=12.95

1.5%

1.5%

1.5%

1.5%

1.5% MIN.

1.5%
 M

IN
.

D
EA

D
 B

AC
K

FR
O

N
T

12.71

12.78

12.60

12.66

TP=12.95

1.5%

1.5%

1.5%

1.5% MIN.

1.5%
 M

IN
.

11

11.18

11.32

11.15

11.01

1.
5%

1.5%

SHEET NUMBER

SHEET TITLE

IT IS A VIOLATION OF THE LAW FOR ANY PERSON,
UNLESS THEY ARE ACTING UNDER THE DIRECTION

OF A LICENSED PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER, TO
ALTER THIS DOCUMENT.

REV DATE DESCRIPTION
A 10.21.19

CHECKED BY: RP/KMD

DRAWN BY:

GPD PROJECT NUMBER:

GMY

2018241.57

C-4A

13534 BALI WAY
(TESLA STATION)

MARINA DEL REY, CA 90292

GRADING PLAN

GRADING PLAN

INSTALLATION MANAGER: NADIR HOSSAIN

B 01.03.20
C 03.13.20 REVISED PER AHJ

SIGNED AND SEALED
ISSUED FOR 100% REVIEW

D 03.17.21 REVISED PER AHJ

GPD GROUP, INC. ®

520 South Main Street, Suite 2531
Akron, OH 44311

330.572.2100 Fax 330.572.2101

0 03.24.21 REVISED PER AHJ

0' 10' 20' SCALE: 1"=20'

GRADING LEGEND

EXISTING ELEVATION 000.00
EX.

PROPOSED ELEVATION AT FINISHED GROUND ELEVATION000.00

PROPOSED TOP OF CURB ELEVATION
PROPOSED BOTTOM OF CURB/FINISHED PAVEMENT ELEVATION

T=000.00
B=000.00

PROPOSED TOP OF PAD ELEVATIONTP=000.00

MATCH EXISTING ELEVATION000.00±*

PROPOSED DRAINAGE SLOPE AND DIRECTION0.0%

BENCHMARK

SEE CLARK SURVEY FOR ALL APPLICABLE BENCHMARKS.

1. PROPERTY LINE AND RIGHT-OF-WAY BOUNDARIES
ARE SHOWN FOR REFERENCE ONLY. REFER TO
SURVEY BY OTHERS FOR EXACT LOCATION.

NOTE:

EQUIPMENT ENLARGEMENT DETAIL
HALF SIZE: 1"=10'
FULL SIZE: 1"=5'

CONTRACTOR TO ENSURE PROTECTION
OF GAS METER AND UNDERGROUND

GAS-LINE DURING CONSTRUCTION

1

2

SEE TRANSFORMER ENLARGEMENT
DETAIL ON THIS SHEET.

TRANSFORMER ENLARGEMENT DETAIL
HALF SIZE: 1"=10'
FULL SIZE: 1"=5'

HALF SIZE

FULL SIZE 0' 20'10' SCALE: 1"=10'

SEE EQUIPMENT ENLARGEMENT
DETAIL ON THIS SHEET.

GRADING NOTES

1. THE CONTRACTOR SHALL FIELD VERIFY ALL EXISTING
ELEVATIONS PRIOR TO CONSTRUCTION. FINAL GRADES IN THE
SUPERCHARGING EQUIPMENT AREA SHALL BE DETERMINED IN
FIELD BY THE CONTRACTOR.

2. THE CONTRACTOR SHALL ENSURE POSITIVE DRAINAGE TOWARDS
THE NEAREST EXISTING DRAINAGE STRUCTURE AND ENSURE NO
PONDING OCCURS ON SITE.

3. THE FINAL SLOPES OF THE SUPERCHARGING EQUIPMENT AREA
SHALL NOT EXCEED THE MAXIMUM ALLOWABLE SLOPES AS
NOTED ON THE PLANS.

SUPERCHARGING EQUIPMENT
AREA, SEE GRADING NOTES ON

THIS SHEET.

11

11

12

12

11

11.18

11.32

11.15

11.01

1.
5%

1.5%

TRANSFORMER ENLARGEMENT DETAIL
HALF SIZE: 1"=10'
FULL SIZE: 1"=5'

11

03/24/2021



SHEET NUMBER

SHEET TITLE

IT IS A VIOLATION OF THE LAW FOR ANY PERSON,
UNLESS THEY ARE ACTING UNDER THE DIRECTION

OF A LICENSED PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER, TO
ALTER THIS DOCUMENT.

REV DATE DESCRIPTION
A 10.21.19

CHECKED BY: RP/KMD

DRAWN BY:

GPD PROJECT NUMBER:

GMY

2018241.57

C-6

13534 BALI WAY
(TESLA STATION)

MARINA DEL REY, CA 90292

CIVIL DETAILS

INSTALLATION MANAGER: NADIR HOSSAIN

B 01.03.20
C 03.13.20 REVISED PER AHJ

SIGNED AND SEALED
ISSUED FOR 100% REVIEW

D 03.17.21 REVISED PER AHJ

GPD GROUP, INC. ®

520 South Main Street, Suite 2531
Akron, OH 44311

330.572.2100 Fax 330.572.2101

0 03.24.21 REVISED PER AHJ1N.T.S3N.T.S5N.T.S

6N.T.S 4N.T.S 2N.T.S

TESLA CHARGING CABINET ANCHOR BOLT PLANCHARGING POST ELEVATION

CHARGING POST CONCRETE FOUNDATION TESLA DEDICATED NON-ILLUMINATED PARKING SIGN DETAIL TESLA CHARGING CABINET DETAIL

NOTES:

1. BOLLARD MUST BE FROM TESLA AND INCLUDE
WELDED ON FIXTURE ATTACHMENT PADS.

2. THE 4.33W, 315mA COMBINED TESLA LOGO AND TASK
LIGHT LED ASSEMBLIES DRAWS POWER FROM THE
PROPOSED SUPERCHARGER.

3. CONTRACTOR TO FIT REAR SKIN DURING
INSTALLATION AND REMOVE REAR SKIN UNTIL TESLA
INSPECTION IS COMPLETED.

CONDUIT

CAR SIDE

PLAN VIEW

20-3/32"

25-31/32"

6-3/32"

31-7/8"

(2) RED, 130mA
"TESLA" LOGO LED
ASSEMBLIES (SEE
NOTE 2)

8"
-1

0"

(1) WHITE, 55mA
TASK LIGHT LED
ASSEMBLY (SEE
NOTE 2)

2"

EXISTING GRADE

CAR SIDE

CONDUIT 66
-1

3/
32

"

PAVEMENT

PRECAST CONCRETE
FOUNDATION BY
UNIVERSAL

1'
-1

0"

4'-3"

CURB

EXP.
JOINT

EXISTING GRADE

CAR SIDE

PRECAST
CONCRETE
FOUNDATION
BY UNIVERSAL

NOTES:

1. PRECAST CONCRETE FOUNDATION DESIGNED AND ENGINEERED BY
UNIVERSAL.

2. PRECAST CONCRETE FOUNDATION SUPPLIED BY TESLA AND
INSTALLED BY CONTRACTOR.

3. CHARGING POST SHALL BE ANCHORED TO PRE-INSTALLED
THREADED INSERTS ON PRECAST FOUNDATION WITH HARDWARE
SUPPLIED BY TESLA AND INSTALLED BY CONTRACTOR.

4. PRECAST CONCRETE FOUNDATION DIMENSIONS SHOWN FOR
REFERENCE ONLY. CONTRACTOR SHALL  COORDINATE WITH TESLA
FOR EXACT DIMENSIONS AND SPECIFICATIONS.

5. SEE FROST NOTES ON SHEET GN-3 FOR FOUNDATION PREPARATION.

6. CONTRACTOR TO PROTECT EXISTING CURB AND PAVEMENT DURING
INSTALLATION OF CONCRETE FOUNDATION. REPAIR OR REPLACE AS
REQUIRED.

3'-4"

2'
-6

"

±1
"

PAVEMENT

PLAN VIEW

1'-10"

1'-6"

CONDUIT STUB

6" MIN GRANULAR
BACKFILL. SEE
FROST NOTES ON
SHEET GN-3 FOR
FOUNDATION
PREPARATION4'-3"

VEHICLE
CHARGING

ONLY

NOTES:

1. SIGN AND TAMPER PROOF HARDWARE SHALL BE PROVIDED BY TESLA.
2. GALVANIZED POST & CAP SHALL BE PROVIDED BY CONTRACTOR.
3. IF PAINT FINISH IS DAMAGED DURING INSTALLATION, CONTRACTOR SHALL REPAINT AS REQUIRED.
4. NON-ILLUMINATED POLE MOUNT PARKING SIGN FACES AND RETURNS TO BE 0.090" ALUMINUM

PANELS WITH #680-82 RED REFLECTIVE VINYL APPLIED (VERIFY REFLECTIVITY WITH OWNER).
5. LOGO TO BE #280-10 REFLECTIVE WHITE VINYL (VERIFY REFLECTIVITY WITH OWNER).
6. SEE TYPICAL TESLA PARKING SIGNAGE DETAIL FOR SIGNAGE VARIATION (IF APPLICABLE).
7. CONTRACTOR SHALL MOUNT SIGN POST IN 8" DIA., 3'-0" DEEP CONCRETE FOUNDATION OR

CONCRETE BOLLARD. SEE PLAN.
8. SIGN POST SHALL BE POWDER COATED, COLOR - MEDIUM/DARK GREY
9. SIGN POST SHALL BE PLUGGED/CAPPED TO PREVENT WATER INTRUSION FROM TOP.
10. SIGN SHALL BE MOUNTED TO LIGHT POLE OR BOLLARD WHERE APPLICABLE. SEE PLAN.

#8 FLATHEAD
SCREW (TYP.)

SIGN PLATE
MECHANICALLY
FASTENED TO 2"x2"x1/8"
CONTRACTOR SUPPLIED
HSS STEEL POST
(8' LONG, 6' ABOVE
GRADE)

1'-0"
1'

-6
"

6'
-0

" T
O

 G
R

AD
E

INCOMING FROM SOURCE:
(3) AC CONDUITS. STUB UP SHALL BE 6"
OFF GROUND AND END IN FEMALE NPT
THREADED COUPLING (SEE NOTE 4).
SEE FEEDER SCHEDULE ON SHEET E-3
FOR CONDUIT SIZE/QUANTITY.

TESLA CHARGING CABINET

ENCLOSURE: INGRESS PROTECTION IP66

WEIGHT:   1500.03 kg, 3307 lbs.

COMPLIANCE: THE UNIT IS TUV LISTED AS IEC 61851-23,
UL 2202, CSA 22.2 NO. 107.1-01 COMPLIANT.

NOTES:

1. CABINET SHOULD BE LIFTED USING ROOF
MOUNTED EYE HOOKS. A FORKLIFT OR PALLET
JACK CAN ALSO BE USED TO MOVE CABINET IF
DONE PROPERLY.

2. SEE EN-1 FOR CHARGING CABINET NOTE.52-3/4"

86
-1

3/
64

"

54-23/32"

49-7/32"

85
-1

/3
2"

42-7/32"

37-15/16"

35-53-64"

28
-4

5/
64

"

32
-6

3/
64

"

FRONT SIDE

TOP

VENT
FAN

NOTE:

1. TESLA PROVIDED TEMPLATE PLATE TO BE USED TO LAYOUT CHARGING CABINET ANCHORING
BOLT LOCATIONS AND CONDUIT STUB UP LOCATIONS.

2. BOLT HOLES FOR REFERENCE ONLY.

3. USE DOTTIE DUCT SEAL COMPOUND PC 6130 (CAT NO LHD1) TO SEAL ENDS OF CONDUIT (TYP.
ALL CONDUITS FOR CHARGING CABINETS AND CHARGE POSTS)

4. USE BELL FITTINGS ON ALL AC AND DC CONDUIT STUBS

5. SEE DETAIL 3 ON SHEET C-7 FOR FOUNDATION DETAIL CAST-IN-PLACE:
(4) 5/8" DIA. HILTI KWIK BOLT
TZ STAINLESS STEEL
ANCHORS, 3-1/8" MIN.
EMBEDMENT PROVIDED AND
INSTALLED BY CONTRACTOR

PRECAST:
(4) 5/8" DIA. STAINLESS
GRADE 304 BOLTS PROVIDED
BY TESLA AND INSTALLED BY
CONTRACTOR

OUTGOING TO POSTS:
STUB UP SHALL BE 6" OFF
GROUND AND END IN
FEMALE NPT THREADED
COUPLING (SEE NOTE 4).
CONDUITS/CONDUCTORS
BY TESLA.

1" CONDUIT FOR
POTENTIAL
EARTH GROUND

52-3/4"

28
-4

5/
64

"

32
-6

3/
64

"

AC
AC

OPENING FOR SHARED DC
BUSS CONNECTIONS
BETWEEN CABINETS

AC

1" AC CONDUIT FOR
MASTER CONTROLLER
COMMUNICATION CABLE

COMM

DEADBACK

D
EA

D
BA

C
K

BUS

BUS

BUS

BUS

BUS

BUS

BUS

BUS

BUS

BUS

BUS

BUS

POST
A

POST
B

POST
C

POST
D

PE

FRONT

BACK

4" STD. GALV. STEEL PIPE
FILLED WITH CONCRETE

PIPE SURFACE TO HAVE
ONE PRIME COAT OF RED
OXIDE AND ONE COAT OF
YELLOW ENAMEL

SLOPE TO DRAIN

EX. GRADE

CONCRETE FOOTING

3'
-6

"
3'

-0
"

M
IN

1'-0"
DIA.

3"
 C

LR
.

CONCRETE TO BE CURVED

BOLLARD DETAIL

03/24/2021



SHEET NUMBER

SHEET TITLE

IT IS A VIOLATION OF THE LAW FOR ANY PERSON,
UNLESS THEY ARE ACTING UNDER THE DIRECTION

OF A LICENSED PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER, TO
ALTER THIS DOCUMENT.

REV DATE DESCRIPTION
A 10.21.19

CHECKED BY: RP/KMD

DRAWN BY:

GPD PROJECT NUMBER:

GMY

2018241.57

C-8

13534 BALI WAY
(TESLA STATION)

MARINA DEL REY, CA 90292

CIVIL DETAILS

INSTALLATION MANAGER: NADIR HOSSAIN

B 01.03.20
C 03.13.20 REVISED PER AHJ

SIGNED AND SEALED
ISSUED FOR 100% REVIEW

D 03.17.21 REVISED PER AHJ

GPD GROUP, INC. ®

520 South Main Street, Suite 2531
Akron, OH 44311

330.572.2100 Fax 330.572.2101

0 03.24.21 REVISED PER AHJDETAIL NOT USED

DETAIL NOT USED

1N.T.S3N.T.S

6N.T.S 4N.T.S 2N.T.S

PLANTING DETAIL: TREE

PLANTING DETAIL: PERENNIALDETAIL NOT USED

TREE RELOCATION PLANTING NOTES5N.T.S

PRUNE BRANCHES IF BROKEN
OR DAMAGED

GALVANIZED STEEL WIRE,
SAFETY FLAGGING AND BLACK
RUBBER HOSE AS SPECIFIED.

2" X 4" WOOD STAKE

FINISHED GRADE

SCARIFY SIDES OF
PLANTING HOLE

BREAK 6" SUB-SOIL
AS NECESSARY

60°'

2'-0" R TYP.

PLANT ROOT BALL 2" ABOVE
GRADE, ROOT FLARE SHOULD
BE ABOVE GRADE.

MULCH PER SHEET GN-2

REMOVE TOP 1/2 OF BURLAP,
TWINE, ROPE AND BASKET
FROM ROOTBALL. REMOVE
ANY EXCESS SOIL FROM TOP
OF ROOTBALL TO EXPOSE
ROOT FLARE.

2 X BALL

WHEN BACKFILLING PLANT PIT, PLACE PLANTING SOIL IN TWO LIFTS. AFTER FIRST LIFT, PUDDLE
SOIL IN WITH WATER TO REMOVE ALL AIR POCKETS. PLACE SECOND LIFT AND REPEAT. CONTINUE
TO PUDDLE AND FILL AS NECESSARY.

GENERAL NOTES:

ORGANIC MULCH PER
SPECIFICATIONS.

FINISHED GRADE

BACKFILL WITH SOIL FROM PLANT PIT

PLANT PERENNIALS AT THE
SAME LEVEL THEY WERE GROWN
IN THE NURSERY.

INDICATED
SPACE AS

GENERAL NOTES:

1. CONTRACTOR SHALL LOCATE NEW CHARGE POST CONDUITS PRIOR TO INSTALLING
TREES AND SHRUBS. PLANT INSTALLATION SHALL NOT DAMAGE CONDUIT.

RELOCATION PLANTING NOTES:
1. PRIOR TO MOVING RELOCATED TREES, CONTRACTOR SHALL DIG APPROPRIATE HOLES FOR TREES

IN THE PROPOSED LOCATION PER THE PLAN.

2. SOAK THE ROOT BALL OF THE EXISTING TREES PRIOR TO MOVING TO REDUCE STRESS ON THE
TREES. ALLOW SOIL TO REMAIN TOGETHER DURING THE DIGGING PROCESS.

3. TREES SHALL BE DUG AND PREPARED FOR MOVING IN A MANNER THAT WILL NOT CAUSE DAMAGE
TO BRANCHES, SHAPE, ROOT SYSTEM, AND DEVELOPMENT. BALL SIZES SHALL BE AS
RECOMMENDED IN ANSI Z60.1.

4. TREES SHALL BE REPLANTED IN THE PROPOSED LOCATION ON THE SAME DAY THEY ARE DUG AND
NOT ALLOWED TO DRY OUT.

5. RELOCATED TREES SHALL BE PLANTED AND MULCHED ACCORDING TO THE TREE PLANTING DETAIL
ON SHEET C-8.

6. CONTINUE WATERING AND CARING FOR RELOCATED MATERIAL ACCORDING TO THE LANDSCAPE
SPECIFICATIONS AND DETAILS DESCRIBED FOR NEW MATERIAL.

03/24/2021



D
EA

D
 B

AC
K

FR
O

N
T

SHEET NUMBER

SHEET TITLE

IT IS A VIOLATION OF THE LAW FOR ANY PERSON,
UNLESS THEY ARE ACTING UNDER THE DIRECTION

OF A LICENSED PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER, TO
ALTER THIS DOCUMENT.

REV DATE DESCRIPTION
A 10.21.19

CHECKED BY: RP/KMD

DRAWN BY:

GPD PROJECT NUMBER:

GMY

2018241.57

C-10

13534 BALI WAY
(TESLA STATION)

MARINA DEL REY, CA 90292

CIVIL DETAILS

INSTALLATION MANAGER: NADIR HOSSAIN

B 01.03.20
C 03.13.20 REVISED PER AHJ

SIGNED AND SEALED
ISSUED FOR 100% REVIEW

D 03.17.21 REVISED PER AHJ

GPD GROUP, INC. ®

520 South Main Street, Suite 2531
Akron, OH 44311

330.572.2100 Fax 330.572.2101

0 03.24.21 REVISED PER AHJ

EQUIPMENT
ELEVATIONS

EQUIPMENT PLAN VIEW - 1" = 20'

ELEVATION - B - NTS

ELEVATION - A - NTS

ELEVATION - C - NTS

PROPOSED
CHARGE POSTS

EXISTING LIGHT
POLE

EXISTING TREE
(TYP.)

PROPOSED
GROUNDCOVER
LANDSCAPE

PROPOSED
SWITCHGEAR

PROPOSED
BOLLARD (TYP.)

EXISTING WALL

PROPOSED
BOLLARD (TYP.)

PROPOSED
TRANSFORMER

EXISTING TREE

EXISTING TREE
(TYP.)

A

C
B

VEHICLE
CHARGING

ONLY

VEHICLE
CHARGING

ONLY

VEHICLE
CHARGING

ONLY

VEHICLE
CHARGING

ONLY

VEHICLE
CHARGING

ONLY

VEHICLE
CHARGING

ONLY

VEHICLE
CHARGING

ONLY

VEHICLE
CHARGING

ONLY

0

0

03/24/2021

















SMALL CRAFT HARBOR COMMISSION MINUTES 
SPECIAL VIRTUAL MEETING 

December 17, 2020 
 

Commissioners: David Lumian, Chair; Nathan Salazar, Vice Chair; Richard Montgomery  
      
Department of Beaches and Harbors (DBH): Gary Jones, Director; Amy Caves, Deputy 
Director; Steve Penn, Chief of Asset Management Division; Susana Graether, Chief Property 
Manager; Phyllis Bordenave-Priestley, Senior Real Property Agent 
 
County: Joseph Abdelkerim, Deputy County Counsel 
 
Item 1 - Call to Order and Pledge of Allegiance 
Chair Lumian called the virtual meeting to order at 10:01 a.m., followed by the Pledge of 
Allegiance. Susana Graether read the virtual meeting procedures.   
 
Item 2 - Approval of Minutes 
Motion to approve November 18, 2020 Special Meeting Minutes by Mr. Montgomery, seconded 
by Vice Chair Salazar, unanimously approved.   
 
Walter Lamb requested certain revisions to his comments on the meeting minutes. 
 
Chair Lumian stated that the minutes were accurate and should be approved as they are. 
 

Ayes: 3 – Chair Lumian, Vice Chair Salazar, and Mr. Montgomery 
 

Item 3 – Communication from the Public 
Pam Gore provided a brief update on the formation of the yacht charter association and 
announced their name, Charter Boat Operators of Marina del Rey California Association.  She 
further explained that they are currently working on the bylaws. 
 
Captain Alex Balian asked if the commissioners received a copy of the letter he submitted 
regarding the violation of the health order. 
 
Chair Lumian answered affirmatively. 

 
Item 4 – Communication with the Commissioners 
Mr. Montgomery disclosed his communication from DBH staff. 
 
Vice Chair Salazar disclosed his communication from DBH staff and congratulated Supervisor 
Hilda Solis on becoming the Chair of the Board of Supervisors (BOS). 
 
Chair Lumian disclosed his communication with Steve Cho, Ken Johnson, Greg Schem, Aaron 
Clark, and Mollie Perlman. 
 
 
 
 



SCHC Minutes 
December 17, 2020 
Page 2 of 5 
 
Item 5a – Marina Sheriff 
Sergeant Carlson reported on the Crime Stats report and noted that the burglaries are down. 
 
Mr. Montgomery expressed his gratitude towards the Sheriff’s Department and staff. 
 
Item 5b – MdR and Beach Special Events 
Catrina Love reported that the programing is limited due to COVID-19; however, it’s being 
tailored to implement physical distancing guidelines to keep the members of the public safe.  
She added that the Farmer’s Market, the afternoon sailing classes, the youth sailing classes, 
and winter sailing classes are ongoing.  Lastly she provided the participant numbers from the 
current year’s sailing classes per the commission’s request. 

 
Item 5c – Marina Boating Section Report 
Michael Blenk reported that Anchorage 47 has two 34 feet, two 27 feet, five 24 feet, and two 
22 feet vacant slips. Parcel 77 power boat storage is completely full, and Mast-Up storage has 
41 spaces available.   
 
Item 5d – Marina del Rey Maintenance Report 
Jose Bedolla announced the annual tree trimming is almost complete, the expansion of Lot 4’s 
entrance, and the wash-down machines are all operational. 
 
Item 6a –. How to Legally Operate a Boat Charter Business in Marina del Rey 
Amir Tadros presented the staff report. 
 
Gary Gilpin inquired about the County or business license that wasn’t mentioned in the 
presentation.  He also inquired about the Dock 55 operator’s licenses to provide food. 
 
Rob Kessler expressed concerned about the illegal charters and lack of enforcement. 

 
Mr. Montgomery deferred Mr. Kessler’s questions to staff. 
 
Vice Chair Salazar and Chair Lumian inquired about the enforcement of illegal charters. 
 
Amir Tadros replied that the enforcement is handled by DBH code enforcement, Sheriff and 
Harbor Master. 
 
Sergeant Carlson stated that commercial vessel is handled by the US Coast Guard.  He further 
explained the difficulties with enforcement of illegal charters. 
 
Mark Sentryz spoke about illegal charters, safety concerns and read a letter from Robert 
Hamilton regarding his rescue by Mr. Sentryz’s crew. 
 
Pam Gore spoke about the lack of enforcement and response.   
 
Chair Lumian asked staff and sheriff for continued monitoring of this situation. 
 



SCHC Minutes 
December 17, 2020 
Page 3 of 5 
 
Vince agreed with two previous speakers and expressed concerns about the increasing safety 
issues. 
 
Sergeant Carlson gave out the sheriff department’s phone number (310-482-6000), to report 
illegal boat charters. 
 
 Item 7a – Public Health Order Update 
Steve Penn presented the staff report. 
 
Mr. Montgomery expressed his gratitude to staff for the update. 
 
Vice Chair Salazar updated everyone on the numbers for COVID-19 cases and urged everyone 
to follow the rules. 
 
Chair Lumian inquired as to what businesses and water based businesses does the Public 
Health Order effect. 
 
Steve Penn referred Chair Lumian to the Department of Public Health’s website to view the 
essential and non-essential businesses allowed to operate along with the protocols in place. 
 
Captain Alex Balian suggested everyone use the website as well as the wait time via phone 
call is approximately two hours.  He also spoke about the importance of the Public Health Order 
and it’s violations. 
 
Item 7b – Commission Letter in Support of Allowing Outdoor Equipment Rentals in 
Marina del Rey 
Janet Zaldua presented the staff report. 
  
Jennifer Vaughan spoke about her company’s safety procedures and read a positive yelp 
review from a customer.  
 
Mark Sentryz spoke about his business’s closing and re-opening due to the Public Health Order 
and his company’s efforts to comply with it. 
 
Vice Chair Salazar inquired if they had contacted Public Health about this issue. 
 
Janet Zaldua replied that she sent an e-mail to a representative at the Department of Public 
Health and Dr. Ferrer with no response yet. 
 
Mr. Montgomery suggested following-up due to Public Health’s busy schedule and to inform 
the BOS of the situation. 
 
Chair Lumian stated that he agrees that boat rentals are a great way and safe recreational 
activities during the pandemic and should not be closed down.  He suggested sending a letter 
to the BOS and Public Health requesting the change.  He also inquired if CVB is going to 
request from Public Health the re-opening of outdoor dining. 



SCHC Minutes 
December 17, 2020 
Page 4 of 5 
 
 
Janet Zaldua responded that there hasn’t been a discussion nor a request submitted; however, 
she isn’t opposed to making a request. 
 
Motion to send a letter in support of allowing outdoor equipment rentals in Marina del 
Rey by Mr. Montgomery, seconded by Vice Chair Salazar, unanimously approved.   
 

Ayes: 3 – Chair Lumian, Vice Chair Salazar, and Mr. Montgomery 
  

Item 7c – Election of Marina del Rey Convention and Visitor’s Bureau (CVB) 
Representative 
Walter Lamb spoke about the lack of transparency and accountability from Beaches and 
Harbors and expressed concern about the County’s voting rights. 
 
Chair Lumian and Vice Chair Salazar asked that county counsel answer the voting rights 
question. 
 
Joseph Abdelkerim advised that the non-profit corporation’s code requires voting rights to be a 
director.  He added that the CVB bylaws are vague and offered to meet with the commission’s 
elected representative to give further legal opinion. 
 
Chair Lumian stated that he doesn’t recall having any voting rights when he served as the 
elected representative. 
 
Joseph Abdelkerim stated that the bylaws mentioned the appointee of commissioner’s 
representative to the CVB makes that person a director.  

 
Motion to appoint Chair Lumian to be the CVB representative by Mr. Montgomery, 
seconded by Vice Chair Salazar, unanimously approved.   

 
Ayes: 3 – Chair Lumian, Vice Chair Salazar, and Mr. Montgomery 

 
Motion to appoint Vice Chair Salazar as the alternate CVB representative by Mr. 
Montgomery, seconded by Vice Chair Salazar, unanimously approved.   

 
Ayes: 3 – Chair Lumian, Vice Chair Salazar, and Mr. Montgomery 

 
Item 8 – Staff Reports 
Steve Penn presented the staff report.  

 
Captain Alex Balian expressed concern about the Fisherman’s Village plan and requested an 
update. 
 
Mr. Montgomery expressed his gratitude to staff. 
 
Adjournment 



SCHC Minutes 
December 17, 2020 
Page 5 of 5 
 
Chair Lumian adjourned the meeting at 11:37 a.m.  



SMALL CRAFT HARBOR COMMISSION MINUTES 
VIRTUAL MEETING 

January 13, 2021 
 

Commissioners: Richard Montgomery, Chair; David Lumian, Vice Chair; Allyn Rifkin, Nathan 
Salazar 
      
Department of Beaches and Harbors (DBH): Gary Jones, Director; Amy Caves, Deputy 
Director; Steve Penn, Chief of Asset Management Division; Susana Graether, Chief Property 
Manager; Phyllis Bordenave-Priestley, Senior Real Property Agent 
 
County: Joseph Abdelkerim, Deputy County Counsel 
 
Item 1 - Call to Order and Pledge of Allegiance 
Chair Montgomery called the virtual meeting to order at 10:00 a.m., followed by the Pledge of 
Allegiance led by Sergeant Carlson. Chair Montgomery read the virtual meeting procedures.   
 
Item 2 - Approval of Minutes 
Motion to approve December 17, 2020 Special Meeting Minutes by Vice Chair Lumian, 
seconded by Mr. Salazar. Mr. Rifkin abstained due to his absence from the meeting.  
 

Ayes: 3 – Chair Montgomery, Vice Chair Lumian, and Mr. Salazar 
 

Item 3 – Communication from the Public 
Pam Gore provided a brief update on the formation of the Charter Boat Operators of Marina del 
Rey California Association and mentioned that the bylaws were approved. She requested that 
an ongoing legal charters item be placed on the agenda and spoke in favor of scattering ashes 
at sea. 
 
Captain Alex Balian spoke about issues with docking for yacht charters and Pier 44’s docks 
available for sailing schools only. 
 
Vice Chair Lumian pointed out that there is an illegal charter enforcement item under agenda 
number eight. 
 
Item 4 – Communication with the Commissioners 
Mr. Salazar disclosed his communication from DBH staff. 
 
Vice Chair Lumian disclosed his attendance at the Convention and Visitors Bureau and 
communication with Chris Robertson, Greg Schem, Elliot Zimmerman, Amy Deft, and Janet 
Zaldua. 
 
Chair Montgomery disclosed his communication from DBH staff, Caruso Company, Captain 
Alex Balian, and Janet Zaldua. 
 
 
 

 



SCHC Minutes 
January 13, 2021 
Page 2 of 5 
 
Item 5a – Marina Sheriff 
Sergeant Carlson reported on the Crime Stats report and noted the comparisons between 2019 
and 2020. 
 
Item 5b – MdR and Beach Special Events 
Carol Baker reported that the programing is limited due to COVID-19; however, drawing and 
painting classes on Zoom are ongoing.   She noted that the Farmer’s Market has had their best 
year ever and the youth sailing program is also ongoing. Lastly, she stated that they are 
currently working on safe and compliant programing.  
 
Vice Chair Lumian inquired about the attendance at the Farmer’s Market. 
 
Carol Baker replied that approximately 1,100 to 1,200 patrons have been attending the 
Farmer’s Market each weekend. 

 
Item 5c – Marina Boating Section Report 
Michael Blenk reported that Anchorage 47 has two 38-feet, two 34-feet, one 27-feet, five 24-
feet, and three 22-feet vacant slips. Parcel 77 power boat storage is completely full, and Mast-
Up storage has 43 spaces available.   
 
Vice Chair Lumian inquired about Parcel 77 power boat storage status, specifically the number 
of power boats and sail boats. 
 
Michael Blenk replied that it is predominantly sail boat storage, power boats are remaining on 
the waitlist. 
 
Item 5d – Marina del Rey Maintenance Report 
Jose Bedolla stated that there are no items to report at this meeting. 
 
Item 7a –. Parcel 41 (Catalina Yacht Anchorage) Proposed Lease Assignment and Five-
Year Lease Extension 
 
Kristal Ghil presented the staff report. 
 
Elliot Zimmerman spoke about his tenancy at Parcel 41 and expressed his concern about the 
County’s view on mixing recreational versus commercial use of slips.  He also spoke of the 
displacement of his business and lack of parking. 
 
Greg Schem noted the rarity of a marine commercial parcel with an anchorage becoming 
available in Marina del Rey.  He further explained that the boating industry has shifted on how 
people access boating.  He added that it has become more collaborative boating uses such as 
boat clubs, multiple owner vessels, rentals, and charters which are not being addressed.  He 
stated that he would like this issue addressed in Marina del Rey. 
 



SCHC Minutes 
January 13, 2021 
Page 3 of 5 
 
Elliot Zimmerman pointed out that Parcel 41 is in a marine commercial zone which is not retail 
or visitor serving, they specialize to serve boaters.  He stated that the marine commercial 
community needs access to commercial slips. 
 
Bryce Ross, with Caruso, explained that they don’t have any immediate plans.  He further stated 
that they are familiarizing themselves with the community and interested in public input to meet 
the community’s needs.   
 
Vice Chair Lumian inquired if Caruso has any other properties with anchorages. 
 
Bryce Ross responded that they don’t, however, Rick Caruso has experience with boats and 
marinas.  He added that there are experts on the team and staff from Catalina to ensure a 
smooth transition.  
 
Vice Chair Lumian inquired if they intend to change the zoning designation on Parcel 41. 
 
Bryce Ross replied that their goal is to have public input to learn their desires before making 
any plans. 
 
Mr. Salazar stated that he looks forward to community serving design with plenty of boating 
slips. 
 
Chair Montgomery requested staff to explain the purpose of the five-year lease extension. 
 
Steve Penn explained that the five-year extension allows both parties to plan ahead. 
 
Chair Montgomery inquired if a five-year extension has been done before. 
 
Steve Penn replied that it has been done before with Parcel 61 (Whiskey Reds), and Parcel 22 
(Cheese Cake Factory). 
 
Vice Chair Lumian expressed concern for Parcel 41 and hopes it remains marine commercial. 
He also expressed concern about Caruso’s lack of expertise regarding Parcel 41. He asked if 
the item can be delayed to allow him to meet with Caruso’s staff to learn the specifics. 
 
Chair Montgomery asked staff about the urgency of the item. 
 
Steve Penn explained that the urgency is with the timely preparation for an expiring ground 
lease for County’s interest. County needs to start planning for future development of the 
leasehold by engaging with a qualified developer. He stated that staff would like to request the 
Commission’s endorsement today.   
 
Chair Montgomery asked that Bryce Ross address concerns about the elimination of marine 
commercial zoning and their lack of expertise.  
 



SCHC Minutes 
January 13, 2021 
Page 4 of 5 
 
Bryce Ross explained that Caruso is committed to excellence in all that they do.  He stated that 
experts and a transition team from the Catalina Yacht Anchorage will be part of the team.  He 
added that they are committed to the property’s long term use of the marina and anchorage. 
 
Mr. Rifkin asked staff if they can add a set amount of public input meetings to be a requirement 
as a condition of their endorsement. 
 
Steve Penn explained that the commission can add the suggestion and staff will present it to 
the Board of Supervisors. He added that this endorsement is only the beginning. The project 
will be presented before the commission through its long process, allowing the opportunity for 
the commission to give suggestions and recommendations.  
 
Bryce Ross assured Mr. Rifkin that they are committed to community outreach. 
 
Amy Caves stated that its already a part of the negotiating lease amendment with Caruso which 
is in the process of being finalized.  She explained that there will be continuous input throughout 
the process which includes community outreach and engagement. 
 
Mr. Salazar explained that the extension is to allow the County to move forward on planning 
redevelopment of the leasehold. 
 
Mr. Rifkin accepted Caruso’s community outreach commitments and withdrew his suggestions. 

 
Motion to approve Parcel 41 (Catalina Yacht Anchorage) Proposed Lease Assignment 
and Five-Year Lease Extension by Vice Chair Lumian, seconded by Mr. Rifkin, 
unanimously approved.   
 

Ayes: 4 – Chair Montgomery, Vice Chair Lumian, Mr. Rifkin, and Mr. Salazar 
 

Item 8 – Staff Reports 
Steve Penn presented the staff report.  

 
Chair Montgomery inquired about the ash scattering at sea. 
 
Steve Penn replied that the matter was posed to the Department of Public Health and they 
replied that it is not currently allowed due to the rising cases of COVID-19 and ICU capacity is 
at 0%.  He stated that staff will remain in contact with DPH in relation to this subject. 
 
Gary Jones gave an update on the letter from the commission regarding the recreational 
boating rentals.  Public Health Services is reviewing the issue.  He explained that they have no 
current plans to change the health order but have instructed the rental companies to contact 
their guidance office for further clarification.   
 
Pam Gore requested that legal charters or commercial boating operation items be added to the 
agenda. 
 



SCHC Minutes 
January 13, 2021 
Page 5 of 5 
 
Kathe Bass introduced herself as the vice commodore of Santa Monica Windjammers Yacht 
Club and inquired about the health order and how it pertains to sailing and the club. 
 
Steve Penn stated that staff will reach out to her because the answers are different for each 
specific activity. 
 
Mr. Salazar requested the contact person at Public Health Services and suggested a legal 
charters presentation.  
 
Chair Montgomery agreed on the legal charters presentation especially during the pandemic. 
 
Steve Penn stated that legal charters will be included in the annual evening event.  The event 
will be schedule based on the commissioners’ availability.  
 
Vice Chair Lumian expressed concern regarding Fisherman’s Village and also suggested a 
legal charters presentation.  He inquired about the advertisement of the March annual evening 
meeting. 
 
Steve Penn replied that the same advertisement campaign from the previous meetings will be 
used. 
 
Mr. Rifkin requested that staff provide a chart or map of the Marina during the meetings so that 
the public can identify the location of the items being considered. 
 
Steve Penn stated that staff will send the commissioners the latest version of the Marina’s 
leasehold map and use the chat box feature for the public to access the map. 
 
Mr. Montgomery inquired about Pier 44 as it related to Captain Alex Balian’s question. 
 
Steve Penn replied that he believes the design has guest docks but that should not exclude 
anyone.  He stated that staff will look into it and reach out to Captain Alex Balian and report 
back on the results.  
 
Gary Jones suggested that the commission receive updates on docks adjacent to the new 
Marriott Hotel and Wetland Park because they have a component of those docks that will 
facilitate some limited charter use.  He explained that DBH is currently in negotiations with the 
hotel operator.  
 
Chair Montgomery asked if the items would return before the commission. 
 
Gary replied affirmatively.   
    
Adjournment 
Chair Montgomery adjourned the meeting at 11:20 a.m.  











Marina del Rey Redevelopment Projects Report 
As of April 7, 2021 

1 

 

 

 
Parcel No. 

Project Name 
Representative Redevelopment 

Proposed 
Massing and Parking Status 

9 -- Proposed Hotel 
on northern portion 
of Parcel 9U, 
wetland park on 
southern portion. 

Sam Hardage * Proposed dual building 
hotel, 6-story, 72’-high 
Marriott Residence Inn, and, 
5-story, 61’-high Courtyard 
Marriott. 

 
*New promenade 
improvements, restaurants 
and amenities. 

 
* Wetland public park project 
(1.46 acres). 

Massing – One six-story, 
72’ high hotel and one five- 
story 61’ high hotel. 

 
Parking – 231 parking 
spaces serving the hotel and 
wetland park. 

Proprietary -- Option was approved by BOS on 
10/6/15. Lease was executed on July 31, 2017 

Regulatory -- January 6, 2016, the BOS' approval of 
the hotel project was appealed to the CCC.   On May 
13, 2016, the CCC granted a time extension, until 
December 12, 2016, for the wetland park CDP 
On July 11, 2016, work began on the wetland park. 
On April 26, 2017, the DCB approved the final design 
of the hotel project. Construction of the hotel began 
on August 11, 2017, and anticipated completion is 
expected in early 2021. 

10/14 (FF) -- 
Neptune Marina/ 
Legacy Partners 

Tim O’Brien * Demolish existing facilities 
and build 526 apartments. 

 
* 161-slip marina + 7 end-ties. 

 
* 28 foot-wide waterfront 
promenade. 

Massing -- Four 55' tall 
clustered 4-story residential 
buildings over Parking with 
view corridor. 

 
Parking -- 1,012 project 
required parking spaces to 
be provided (103 public 
Parking spaces to be 
replaced off site) 

 
* Replacement of public 
parking both on and off site. 

Proprietary – December 1, 2015, the BOS agreed to 
extend the term of the option for up to one year. 
Lessee submitted Lease Assignments and 
Assignments of Options to extend existing lease for 
Parcel 10 and the lease for Parcel 14. The SCHC 
endorsed the assignments on September 21, 2016 
and the BOS approved on October 4, 2016. Parcel 10 
and 14 Lease as executed on 12/9/16. 

 
Regulatory -- On January 21, 2015, the final project 
design was approved by the Design Control Board. 
On December 12, 2016, work began on the project. 
Project completion is expected in early 2021. 



Marina del Rey Redevelopment Projects Report 
As of April 7, 2021 

2 

 

 

 
Parcel No. 

Project Name 
Representative Redevelopment 

Proposed 
Massing and Parking Status 

44 - Pier 44/Pacific 
Marina Venture 

Michael Pashaie/ 
David Taban 

* Build 5 new visitor serving 
commercial and dry storage 
buildings 

 
* 82,652 s.f. visitor serving 
commercial space 

 
* 141 slips + 5 end ties and 
57 dry storage spaces 

Massing -- Four new visitor- 
serving commercial 
buildings, maximum 36' tall 
and one dry stack storage 
building, 65' tall. 771.5 lineal 
feet view corridor proposed. 

 
Parking -- 381 at grade 
Parking spaces will be 
provided with shared 
Parking agreement (402 
Parking spaces are 
required). 

Proprietary -- The lessee initialed a revised Term 
Sheet on July 9, 2015. On January 13, 2016, SCHC 
endorsed DBH’s recommendation to grant lessee an 
option to extend the lease term for 39 years. The 
Grant of Option was approved by the BOS in October 
2016. Amended and restated lease was executed on 
August 24, 2017. Construction began on September 
11, 2017. Trader Joe’s opened on 4/18/19. Project 
completion is expected in early 2021. 

 
Regulatory -- February 9, 2016, the BOS approved 
the project, which was appealed to the CCC. CCC 
denied the appeal on June 9, 2016. 

 
Regulatory Matter: Shared Parking Agreement. 

113 -- Mariner's 
Village 

Michael 
Sondermann 

* Renovation of 981 
apartments 

 
* Improvements to 
promenade 
*  

Massing – Existing buildings 
to remain. 

 
Parking – Existing parking 
to remain. 

Proprietary – Item opened on 9/23/2013. On 
October 30, 2018, the Los Angeles County Board of 
Supervisors approved an option for an amended at 
restated lease. The revised project will include 20% 
affordable units. 

 
Regulatory – The Regional Planning Commission 
approved an after-the-fact Coastal Development Permit 
(CDP) for the previous removal of waterbird nests.  The 
appeal of that CDP is expected to be heard by the 
Coastal Commission in early 2021. 

15 -- AMLI 
Residential 

Jason Armison * Demolish existing facilities 
and build 585 apartments 
* New 8,000 s.f. commercial 
space 
* New 241 boat slip marina 
* New 1,271-Parking space 
garage 

Massing -- Six buildings up 
to 5 stories and 70' high 

 
Parking -- All Parking to be 
provided on site within new 
1,271-space Parking garage 

Proprietary -- The lease was executed on 1/30/14. 
Construction commenced on August 4, 2014. 

Regulatory -- June 30, 2014, demolition of the site 
commenced. August 2014 –Construction of project is 
underway. Project completion is expected in early 
2021. 

 


