
Proposed ordinance to adopt, update, and set forth provisions and regulations for the enforcement of 
the Residential Code to be known as Title 30 of the Los Angeles County Code as required by State 
law.

SUBJECT

November 03, 2010

The Honorable Board of Supervisors
County of Los Angeles
383 Kenneth Hahn Hall of Administration
500 West Temple Street 
Los Angeles, California 90012
 
Dear Supervisors:

PROPOSED 2011 LOS ANGELES COUNTY
RESIDENTIAL CODE

(ALL SUPERVISORIAL DISTRICTS)
(3 VOTES)

IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOUR BOARD:

Introduce, waive reading, and schedule a public hearing on November 23, 2010, regarding an 
ordinance that adopts by reference the 2010 California Residential Code, with amendments.

AFTER THE PUBLIC HEARING, IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOUR BOARD:

1. Find that the proposed changes and modifications to building standards contained in the 2010 
California Residential Code are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological, and/or 
topographical conditions, as detailed in the ordinance.

2. Find that the proposed ordinances are exempt from the provisions of the California Environmental 
Quality Act pursuant to State Guidelines Section 15061(b)(3).
 
3. Approve the ordinance and establish its operative date as January 1, 2011.

4. Direct the County of Los Angeles Department of Public Works to file the adopted ordinance 

ctalamantes
New Stamp

ctalamantes
Typewritten Text
29	NOVEMBER 3, 2010

ctalamantes
Typewritten Text
SET FOR HEARING: NOVEMBER 23, 2010 AT 9:30 AM



containing your Board of Supervisors' findings with the California Building Standards Commission.

PURPOSE/JUSTIFICATION OF RECOMMENDED ACTION

The enclosed ordinance, when adopted, will update and set forth provisions and regulations for the 
enforcement of the Residential Code within the unincorporated areas of the County of Los Angeles 
(County) and the Contract Cities served by the County that elect to adopt the same ordinance by 
reference, as required by State law.

Implementation of Strategic Plan Goals

The Countywide Strategic Plan directs the provision of Operational Effectiveness (Goal 1), 
Community and Municipal Services (Goal 3), and Public Safety (Goal 5) as it provides services to the 
public that have a wide-reaching positive effect on the entire community.  The adoption of the 
County's Residential Code provides minimum construction standards that promote the health and 
welfare of the general public throughout the unincorporated area of the County.  By incorporating the 
most up-to-date building and safety standards, the County will be able to ensure that its Strategic 
Goals are fully addressed.

FISCAL IMPACT/FINANCING

There will be minimal impact on expenditures for the Department of Public Works (Public Works) for 
training its personnel.  All associated costs including these training costs and the printing of the new 
codes are funded from construction-related plan review and permit revenues from Fiscal Year 2010-
11.

FACTS AND PROVISIONS/LEGAL REQUIREMENTS

The State recently adopted the 2010 Edition of California Building Standards Code, which includes 
the 2010 California Residential Code.

The California Health and Safety Code requires that the County adopt an ordinance that imposes the 
same building standards as are contained in the 2010 California Residential Code, with the 
exception that the County may make amendments to these building standards that are more 
restrictive and that are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological, and/or 
topographical conditions.

The enclosed ordinance incorporates, by reference, the building standards contained in the 2010 
California Residential Code together with critical and necessary County amendments.  In accordance 
with Sections 17958.5 and 17958.7 of the Health and Safety Code, your Board of Supervisors 
(Board) must determine and expressly find that the amendments to the State standards are needed 
because of local climatic, geological, and/or topographical conditions.

The applicable finding(s) for each proposed amendment to the State's building standards are clearly 
delineated in a chart which is set forth in the proposed ordinance.  The ordinance also contains 
various administrative changes that do not require special local findings.

In its continued efforts to provide consistency within the Los Angeles Basin and to provide the public 

The Honorable Board of Supervisors
11/3/2010
Page 2



with locally applicable and efficient codes, Public Works has, again, joined efforts with a majority of 
the cities within the County to undergo thorough examination of previous and proposed amendments 
to the building standards published by the State.  Many of the proposed local amendments to the 
State Code are based on the model language generated by the Los Angeles Regional Uniform Code 
Program.  This Regional Program has the support of all 88 cities and the County.  The goal of these 
multijurisdictional groups is to minimize differences in Code language and interpretation within the 
region, thereby assisting the local construction industry by unifying and streamlining the permitting 
process.

Health and Safety Code Section 17958 and 18941.5 require that all amendments, together with the 
unamended portions of the California Residential Code, become effective 180 days after the 
publication of the California Building Standards Code.  The State has established that date to be 
January 1, 2011.  Accordingly, it is recommended that your Board establish the operative date of the 
amendments, together with the unamended portions of the California Building Standards Code, to be 
January 1, 2011.  The proposed amendments will then become operative when your Board's findings 
are filed with the State of California Building Standards Commission.

In accordance with the requirements of Government Code Section 50022.3, your Board must 
schedule a public hearing after the first reading of the title of the adopting ordinances.  Notice of the 
hearing is required to be published pursuant to Government Code 6066.  A copy of the California 
Residential Code must be on file with the Executive Office at least 15 days preceding the hearing 
and made available for public inspection.

A sample, notice is submitted herewith.

ENVIRONMENTAL DOCUMENTATION

Adoption of this ordinance is exempt from the California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) in that it 
can be seen with certainty that there is no possibility that the ordinance may have a significant effect 
on the environment pursuant to State CEQA Guidelines Section 15061(b)(3).  The adoption of the 
proposed ordinance is covered by the general rule that CEQA applies only to projects that have the 
potential for causing a significant effect on the environment.  The adoption of the proposed 
ordinances does not have such potential.

IMPACT ON CURRENT SERVICES (OR PROJECTS)

Other departments embarking on construction projects will be required to comply with the provisions 
of these ordinances if applications for permits to begin construction are submitted on or after the 
operative date of these ordinances.

Copies of the proposed code changes were circulated to professional associations within the design 
and construction communities for review and comments.  Public Works has carefully evaluated the 
comments received as a result of the review and has incorporated those changes into the 
ordinances, where appropriate.

CONCLUSION

The Honorable Board of Supervisors
11/3/2010
Page 3



Upon approval of the enclosed ordinance, please return one adopted copy of this letter and one 
adopted copy of the ordinance to the Department of Public Works, Building and Safety Division.

Respectfully submitted,

GAIL FARBER

Director

GF:RP:ll

Enclosures

c: Chief Executive Office
County Counsel
Executive Office
Department of Regional Planning
Fire Department

The Honorable Board of Supervisors
11/3/2010
Page 4



ANALYSIS

This ordinance adds new Title 30 - Residential Code to the Los Angeles County

Code. Title 30 incorporates by reference portions of the 2010 California Residential

Code, published by the California Building Standards Commission, with certain changes

and modifications.

State law requires that the County adopt ordinances that contain the same

requirements as are contained in the building standards published in the California

Residential Code. State law allows the County to change or modify these requirements

only if it determines that such changes or modifications are reasonably necessary

because of local climatic, geological, or topographical conditions.

The changes and modifications to requirements contained in the building

standards published in the 2010 California Residential Code which are contained in this

ordinance are based upon express findings, contained in the ordinance, that such

changes are reasonably necessary due to local climatic, geological, or topographical

conditions.

Title 30 also incorporates by reference certain administrative provisions

contained in Title 26 - Building Code.

ANDREA SHERIDAN ORDIN
County Counsel

~;:z 9...--
By

MARK T. YANAI
Principal Deputy County Counsel
Property Division

MTY:vn

03/10/10 (Requested)

10/18/10 (Revised)

HOA.684523.11



ORDINANCE NO. _

An ordinance adding Title 30 - Residential Code to the Los Angeles County

Code, relating to the adoption of the 2010 California Residential Code by reference, with

certain changes and modifications.

The Board of Supervisors of the County of Los Angeles ordains as follows:

SECTION 1. Title 30 is hereby added to read as follows:

TITLE 30

RESIDENTIAL CODE

CHAPTER 1

ADMINISTRATION

ADOPTION BY REFERENCER100

Except as hereinafter changed or modified, Sections 102 through 119 of

Chapter 1, Section 1207 of Chapter 12, Chapters 34, 67, 69, 98, 99, and Appendix J of

Title 26 of the Los Angeles County Code are adopted by reference and incorporated

into this Title 30 as if fully set forth below, and shall be known as Sections 102 through

119 of Chapter 1, Section 1207 of Chapter 12, Chapters 34, 67, 69, 98, 99, and

Appendix J of Title 30 of the Los Angeles County Code.

Except as hereinafter changed or modified, Chapters 2 through 10, Chapter 44,

and Appendix H of that certain code known and designated as the 2010 California

Residential Code as published by the California Building Standards Commission are

adopted by reference and incorporated into this Title 30 as if fully set forth below, and

HOA.684523.11



shall be known as Chapters 2 through 10, Chapter 44, and Appendix H of Title 30 of the

Los Angeles County Code.

A copy of the 2010 California Residential Code shall be at all times maintained

by the Building Official for use and examination by the public.

R101 TITLE,PURPOSE,ANDINTENT

R101.1 Title. Title 30 of the Los Angeles County Code shall be

known as the "Residential Code For One And Two Family Dwellings," may be cited as

such, and will be referred to herein as "these regulations" or "these building standards"

or "this Code."

R101.2 Purpose and Intent. The purpose of this Code is to provide

minimum standards to preserve the public safety, health, and welfare by regulating the

design, construction, installation, quality of materials, use, occupancy, location, and

maintenance of all buildings, structures, grading, and certain equipment as specifically

set forth herein. Consistent with this purpose, the provisions of this Code are intended

to confer a benefit on the community as a whole and are not intended to establish a

duty of care toward any particular person.

This Code shall not be construed to hold the County of Los Angeles or any

officer, employee, or agent thereof responsible for any damage to persons or property

by reason of any inspection authorized herein or by reason of the issuance or non-

issuance of any permit authorized herein, and/or for any action or omission in

connection with the application and/or enforcement of this Code. By adopting the

provisions of this Code, the County does not intend to impose on itself, its employees,

HOA.684523.11 2



or agents any mandatory duties of care toward persons and property within its

jurisdiction so as to provide a basis of civil liability for damages.

This Section is declaratory of existing law and is not to be construed as

suggesting that such was not the purpose and intent of previous Code adoptions.

R101.3 Scope. The provisions of this Code shall apply to the

construction, alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, use

and occupancy, location, removal, demolition, and grading of detached one- and two-

family dwellings and townhouses not more than three stories above grade plane in

height with a separate means of egress and their accessory structures within the

unincorporated territory of the County of Los Angeles and to such work or use by the

County of Los Angeles in any incorporated city.

Exception: Live/work units complying with the requirements of Section 419 of

Title 26 of the Los Angeles County Building Code shall be permitted to be built as one-

and two-family dwellings or townhouses. Fire suppression otherwise required by

Section 419.5 of Title 26 of the Los Angeles County Building Code for buildings and

structures constructed under this Code shall conform to Section 903.3.1.3 of Title 26 of

the Los Angeles County Building Code.

Additions, alterations, repairs, and changes of use or occupancy in all buildings

and structures to which this Title 30 applies shall comply with the provisions for new

buildings and structures except as otherwise provided in Section 109 and Chapter 34 of

Title 26 of the Los Angeles County Building Code.

HOA.684523.11 3



R101.4 APPLICABILITY

R101.4.1 General.

Where there is a conflict between a general requirement and a specific

requirement, the specific requirement shall be applicable. Where, in any specific case,

different Sections of this Code specify different materials, methods of construction, or

other requirements, the most restrictive shall govern.

R101.4.2 Other laws.

The provisions of this Code shall not be deemed to nullify any provisions of local,

state, or federal law.

R101.4.3 Referenced codes and standards.

The codes and standards referenced in this Code shall be considered part of the

requirements of this Code to the prescribed extent of each such reference. Where

differences occur between provisions of this Code and referenced codes and standards,

the provisions of this Code shall apply.

SECTION 2. Section R301.1.3.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R301.1.3.2 Woodframe structures greater than tvlO stories.

The aBuilding eOfficial shall require construction documents to be approved and

stamped by a California licensed architect or engineer for all dwellings of woodframe

construction more than two stories and basement in height located in Seismic Design

Category A, B. or C. Notwithstanding other sections, the law establishing these

provisions is found in Business and Professions Code sections 5537 and 6737.1.

HOA.684523.11 4



The Building Official shall require construction documents to be approved and

stamped by a California licensed architect or engineer for all dwellings of wood frame

construction more than one story in height or with a basement located in Seismic

Design Category DO~l' or Dz.=.

SECTION 3. Section R301.1.4 is hereby added to read as follows:

R301.1.4 Seismic design provisions for buildings constructed on

or into slopes steeper than one unit vertical in three units horizontal (33.3 percent

slope).

The design and construction of new buildings and additions to existing buildings

when constructed on or into slopes steeper than one unit vertical in three units

horizontal (33.3 percent slope) shall comply with Section 1613.9 of the 2011 County of

Los Angeles Building Code.

SECTION 4. Section R301 .2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R301.2 Climatic and geographic design criteria.

Buildings shall be constructed in accordance with the provisions of this Code as

limited by the provisions of this sSection. Additional criteria shall be established by the

local jurisdiction and set forthConsult with the Building Official regarding additional

criteria in Table R301.2(1).

HOA684523.11 5



SECTION 5.

R301.2.2.2.5

Section R301.2.2.2.5 is amended to read as follows:

Irregular buildings.

1. When exterior shear wall lines or braced wall panels are not in one plane

vertically from the foundation to the uppermost story in which they are required.

Exception: For wood light frame construction, floors 'Nith cantilevers or

setbacks not exceeding four times the nominal depth of the wood floor joists are

permitted to support braced 'Nail panels that are out of plane 'Nith braced wall panels

below provided that:

1. Floor joists are nominal 2 inches by 10 inches (61 mm by 264 mm) or

larger and spaced not more than 16 inches (406 mm) on center.

2. The ratio of the back span to the cantilever is at least 2 to 1.

3. Floor joists at ends of braced wall panels are doubled.

4. For 'Nood frame construction, a continuous rim joist is connected to ends

or all cantilever joists. When spliced, the rim joists shall be spliced using a galvanized

metal tie not less than 0.068 inch (1.6 mm) (16 gage) and 11/2 inches (38 mm) wide

fastened 'Nith six 16d nails on each side of the splice or a block of the same size as the

rim joist of sufficient length to fit securely bet.veen the joist space at which the splice

occurs fastened with eight 16d nails on each side of the splice; and

6. Gravity loads carried at the end of cantilevered joists are limited to uniform

vvall and roof loads and the reactions from headers having a span of 18 feet (2438 mm)

or less.

HOA.684523.11 6



2. When a section of floor or roof is not laterally supported by shear walls or

braced wall lines on all edges.

Exception: Portions of floors that do not support shear walls or braced wall

panels above, or roofs, shall be permitted to extend no more than six feet (1829 mm)

beyond a shear wall or braced wall line.

3. When the end of a braced wall panel occurs over an opening in the wall

below and ends at a horizontal distance greater than 1 foot (305 mm) from the edge of

the opening. This provision is applicable to shear walls and braced wall panels offset in

plane and to braced wall panels offset out of plane as permitted by the exception to

item 1 above.

Exception: For wood light frame wall construction, one end of a braced '.vall

panel shall be permitted to extend more than one foot (305 mm) over an opening not

more than 8 feet (2438 mm) '.vide in the '.vall belm.v provided that the opening includes a

header in accordance with the follm.ving:

1. The building width, loading condition and framing member species

limitations of Table R502.5(1) shall apply; and

2. Not less than one 2*12 or two 2*10 for an opening not more than 4 feet

(1219 mm) wide; or

3. Not less than t\vo 2*12 or three 2*10 for an opening not more than 6 feet

(1829 mm) '.vide; or

4. Not less than three 2*12 or four 2*10 for an opening not more than 8 feet

(2438 mm) wide; and

HOA.684523.11 7



5. The entire length of the braced 'Nail panel does not occur over an opening

in the '.vall belm'\'.

4. When an opening in a floor or roof exceeds the lesser of 12 feet

(3658 mm) or 50 percent of the least floor or roof dimension.

5. When portions of a floor level are vertically offset.

Exceptions:

1. Framing supported directly by continuous foundations at the perimeter of

the building.

2. For \\f{)od light frame construction, floors shall be permitted to be vertically

offset 'I/hen the floor framing is lapped or tied together as required by section R502.6.1.

SECTION 6.

R301.2.2.3.S.1

Section R301.2.2.3.5.1 is hereby added to read as follows:

AISI S230, Section 81. (Modify AISI S230, Section 81 to

read as follows:)

Where No.8 screws are specified, the required number of screws in a steel-to-

steel connection shall be permitted to be reduced in accordance with the reduction

factors in Table 81-1 when larger screws are used or when the sheets of steel being

connected are thicker than 33 mils (0.84 mm). When applying the reduction factor, the

resulting number of screws shall be rounded up.

HOA.684523.11 8



SECTION 7.

R322.1.4.1

Section R322.1.4.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Determination of design flood elevations.

2. Determine the design flood elevation in accordance with accepted

hydrologic and hydraulic engineering practices used to define special flood hazard

areas. Determinations shall be undertaken by a registered design professionalcivil

engineer who shall determine that the technical methods used reflect currently accepted

engineering practice. Studies, analyses, and computations shall be submitted in

sufficient detail to allow thorough review and approval.

SECTION 8. Section R322.2.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R322.2.2 Enclosed area below design flood elevation. Enclosed

areas for attached and detached building and structures, including crawl spaces, that

are below the design flood elevation shall:

SECTION 9. Section R327 is hereby amended to read as follows:

SECTION R327

MATERIALS AND CONSTRUCTION METHODS FOR EXTERIOR WILDFIRE

EXPOSURE

NOTE: This Chapter has been amended by Los Angeles County and is

applicable to all occupancy groups.

HOA.684523.11 9



SECTION 10. Section R327.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.1.1 Scope.

This eChapter applies to building materials, systems, and or assemblies used in

the exterior design and construction of new buildings, and to additions, alterations, or

repairs made to existing buildings, erected, constructed, located, or moved within a

Wildland-Urban Interface Fire Area as defined in Section R327.2.

SECTION 11. Section R327 .1.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.1.3. Application.

New buildings, and any addit,ions, alterations, or repairs made to existing

buildings located in or moved within any Fire Hazard Severity Zone within State

Responsibility Areas or any Wildland-Urban Interface Fire Area designated by the

enforcing agencyLos Angeles County Fire Department constructed after the application

date shall comply with the provisions of this eChapter.

Exceptions:

4. Additions to and remodels of buildings originally constructed prior to the

,applicable application date.

SECTION 12. Section R327.1.3.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.1.3.1 Application date and where required.

New buildings for which an application for a building permit is submitted on or

after July 1, 2008, and any additions, alterations, or repairs made to existing buildings

for which an application for a building permit is submitted on or after January 1, 2011,

HOA.684523.11 10



located in any Fire Hazard Severity Zone or Wildland Interface Fire Area shall comply

with all sSections of this eChapter, including all of the following areas:

Exceptions:

1. Nmv bBuildings located in any Fire Hazard Severity Zone within State

Responsibility Areas, for which an application for a building permit is submitted on or

after January 1, 2008, shall comply with all sSections of this eChapter.

2. Nmv bBuildings located in any Fire Hazard Severity Zone within State

Responsibility Areas or any Wildland Interface Fire Area designated by cities and other

local agencies for which an application for a building permit is submitted on or after

December 1, 2005J-but prior to July 1, 2008, shall only comply with the following

, sSections of this eChapter:

SECTION 13.

R327.1.4

Section R327.1 .4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Inspection and certification.

1. Building permit issuance. The local bBuilding eOfficial shall, prior to

construction, provide the owner or applicant a certification that the building as proposed

to be built complies with all applicable state and local building standards, including

those for materials and construction methods for wildfire exposure as described in this

Chapter. Issuance of a building permit by the 10caibBuilding eOfficial for the proposed

building shall be considered as complying with this sSection.

HOA.684523.11 11



2. Building permit final. The local bBuilding eOfficial shall, upon completion

of construction, provide the owner or applicant with a copy of the final inspection report

that demonstrates the building was constructed in compliance with all applicable state

and local building standards, including those for materials and construction methods for

wildfire exposure as described in this Chapter. Issuance of a certificate of occupancy

by the local bBuilding eOfficial for the proposed building shall be considered as

complying with this sSection.

SECTION 14. Section R327.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

SECTION R327.2

DEFINITIONS

FIRE PROTECTION PLAN is a document prepared for a specific project or

development proposed for a Wildland-Urban Interface Fire Area. It describes ways to

minimize and mitigate potential for loss from wildfire exposure. The Fire Protection Plan

shall be in accordance with this €Chapter and the CaliforniaLos Angeles County Fire

Code Title 32, Chapter 49. When required by the enforcing agency for the purposes of

granting modifications, a fire protection plan shall be submitted. Only locally adopted

ordinances that have been filed with the California Building Standards Commission or

the Department of Housing and Community Development in accordance 'Nith Section

1.1 .8 shall apply.

FIRE HAZARD SEVERITY ZONES are geographical areas designated pursuant

to California Public Resources Code S~ections 4201 through 4204 and classified as

HOA.684523.11 12



Very High, High, or Moderate in State Responsibility Areas or as Local Agency Very

High Fire Hazard Severity Zones designated pursuant to California Government Code

sections 51175 through 51189. See CaliforniaLos Angeles County Fire Code~ Article

~Chapter 49.

HEAVY TIMBER. A type of construction classification specified in Section 602 of

the CaliforniaLos Angeles County Building Code. For use in this Chapter, heavy timber

shall be sawn lumber or glue laminated wood with the smallest minimum nominal

dimension of 4 inches (102 mm). Heavy Timber walls or floors shall be sawn or glue-

laminated planks splined, tongue-and-grove, or set close together and well spiked.

WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE FIRE AREA is a geographical area identified

by the state as a "Fire Hazard Severity Zone" in accordance with the Public Resources

Code S§ections 4201 through 4204 and Government Code S§ections 51175 through

51189, or other areas designated by the enforcing agencyLosAngeles County Fire

Department to be at a significant risk from wildfires.

SECTION 15. Section R327.3.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.3.2 Qualification by testing.

Material and material assemblies tested in accordance with the requirements of

Section R327.3 shall be accepted for use when the results and conditions of those tests

are met. Product evaluation testing of material and material assemblies shall be

HOA.684523.11 13



approved or listed by the State Fire Marshal, the Building Official or identified in a

current report issued by an approved agency.

SECTION 16. Section R327.3.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.3.3 Approved agency.

Product evaluation testing shall be performed by an approved agency as defined

in Section 1702 of the CaliforniaLos Angeles County Building Code. The scope of

accreditation for the approved agency shall include building product compliance with

sCode.

SECTION 17. Section R327.3.5.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.3.5.2 Weathering.

Fire-retardant-treated wood and Fire retardant treated wood shingles and shakes

shall meet the fire test performance requirements of this Chapter after being subjected

to the weathering conditions contained in the following standards, as applicable to the

materials and the conditions of use.

SECTION 18.

R327.3.5.2.1

Section R327.3.5.2.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Fire-retardant-treated wood.

Fire-retardant-treated wood shall be tested in accordance with ASTM D2898,

"Standard Practice for Accelerated Weathering of Fire-Retardant Treated Wood for Fire

Testing (Method A)" and the requirements of sSection 2303.2 of the

CaliforniaLos Angeles County Building Code.

HOA.684523.11 14



SECTION 19. Section R327.3.5.2.2 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

R327.3.5.2.2 Fire retardant treated wood shingles and shakes. Fire

retardant treated 'Nood shingles and shakes shall be approved and listed by the State

Fire Marshal in accordance with Section 208(c), Title 19 California Code of Regulations.

SECTION 20. Section R327.3.6 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.3.6 Alternates for materials, design, tests, and methods of

construction.

The enforcing agency is permitted to modify the provisions of this eChapter for

site-specific conditions in accordance with Chapter 1, Section 1.11.2.4104.2.7. When

required by the enforcing agencyBuilding Official for the purposes of granting

modifications, a fire protection plan shall be submitted in accordance with the

CaliforniaLos Angeles County Fire Code, Chapter 49.

SECTION 21. Section R327.4.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.4.3 Alternative methods for determining Ignition-resistant

material.

2. Fire-retardant-treated wood. Fire-retardant-treated wood identified for

exterior use that complies with the requirements of sSection 2303.2 of the

CaliforniaLos Angeles County Building Code.

3. Fire retardant treated "'\lood shingles and shakes. Fire retardant treated

wood shingles and shakes, as defined in section 1505.6 and listed by State Fire

HOA.684523.11 15



Marshal for use as "Class 8" roof covering, shall be accepted as an Ignition resistant

'Nail covering material when installed over solid sheathing.

SECTION 22. Section R327.5.2. is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.S.2 Roof coverings.

Roof coverings shall be Class A as specified in Section 1505.2. Where the roof

profile allows a space between the roof covering and roof decking, the spaces shall be

constructed to prevent the intrusion of flames and embers, be firestopped with approved

materials or have one layer of minimum 72 pounds (32.4 kg) mineral-surfaced non:

perforated cap sheet complying with ASTM D 3909 installed over the combustible

decking. Wood shingles and wood shakes are prohibited in any Fire Hazard Severity

Zones regardless of classification.

SECTION 23. Section R327.6.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.6.1 General.

Where provided, ventilation openings for enclosed attics, enclosed eave soffit

spaces, enclosed rafter spaces formed where ceilings are applied directly to the

underside of roof rafters, and underfloor ventilation shall be in accordance with

Section 1203 of the CaliforniaLos Angeles County Building Code and sSections

R327.6.1 through R327.6.3 of this sSection to resist building ignition from the intrusion

of burning embers and flame through the ventilation openings.

SECTION 24. Section R327.6.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Exceptions:

HOA.684523.11 16



1. The enforcing agencyBuilding Official may accept or approve special eave

and cornice vents that resist the intrusion of flame and burning embers.

2. Vents complying with the requirements of Section R327.6.2 may be

installed on the underside of eaves and cornices in accordance with either one of the

following conditions:

2.1. The attic space being ventilated is fully protected by an automatic

sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 of the

CaliforniaLos Angeles County Building Code or,

SECTION 25.

R327.10.2

Section R327.1 0.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Applicability.

Exceptions:

2. Awnings and canopies shall comply with the requirements of Section 3105

of the CaliforniaLos Angeles County Building Code.

SECTION 26. Section R327.1 0.3.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.10.3.2 When required by the enforcing agencyBuilding Official,

detached accessory structures within 50 feet of an applicable building shall comply with

the requirements of this sSection.

HOA.684523.11 17



SECTION 27. Section R327.10A is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.10.4. Requirements.

When required by the enforcing agencyBuilding Official, accessory structures

shall be constructed of noncombustible or ignition-resistant materials.

SECTtON 28. Section R401.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R401.1 Application.

Wood foundations in Seismic Design Category Do, 01, or O2 shall be designed in

accordance 'Nith accepted engineering practicenot be permitted.

Exception: In non-occupied, single-story, detached storage sheds and similar

uses other than carport or garage, provided the gross floor area does not exceed

200 square feet, the plate height does not exceed 12 feet in height above the grade

plane at any point, and the maximum roof projection does not exceed 24 inches.

SECTION 29.

R403.1.2

Section R403.1.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Continuous footing in Seismic Design Categories Do, 01,

and O2•

The braced wall panels at exterior walls of buildings located in Seismic Design

Categories Do, 01, and O2 shall be supported by continuous footings. All required

interior braced wall panels in buildings '/lith plan dimensions greater than 50 feet (15240

mmt-shall alse-be supported by continuous footings.

HOA.684523.11 18



SECTION 30.

R403.1.3

Section R403.1.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Seismic reinforcing.

Exception: In detached one- and two-family dwellings located in Seismic

Design Category A, B, or C which are three stories or less in height and constructed

with stud bearing walls, plain concrete footings without longitudinal reinforcement

supporting walls, and isolated plain concrete footings supporting columns or pedestals

are permitted.

SECTION 31. Section R403.1.5 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R403.1.5 Slope.

The top surface of footings shall be level. The bottom surface of footings shall be

permitted to have a slope not exceeding one unit vertical in 10 units horizontal (10-

percent slope). Footings shall be stepped where it is necessary to change the elevation

of the top surface of the footing or where the surface of the ground slopes more than

one unit vertical in 10 units horizontal (1O-percent slope).

For structures located in Seismic Design Categories DO.Llh, or D21stepped

footings shall be reinforced with two No.4 deformed reinforcing bars located at the top

and bottom of the footings as shown in Figure R403.1.5.

HOA.684523.11 19



"G:&IDE
---··..,,··-...--...,....r~L-..

RECOMMEND: a > b
b s: 2'~'

"

FIGURE R403.1.5

STEPPED FOOTING

SECTION 32. Section R404.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R404.2 Wood foundation walls.

Wood foundation walls shall be constructed in accordance with the provisions of

Sections R404.2.1 through R404.2.6 and with the details shown in Figures R403.1 (2)

and R403.1 (3). Wood foundation walls shall not be used for structures located in

Seismic Design Category DO....Ql.or Db=,

SECTION 33. Section R501.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

RS01.1 Application.

The provision of this €Chapter shall control the design and construction of the

floors for all buildings including the floors of attic spaces used to house mechanical or

plumbing fixtures and equipment weighing less than 400 pounds and maximum height

of 4 feet above the floor or attic level.

HOA.684523.11 20



SECTION 34. Section R503.2.4 is hereby added to read as follows:

RS03.2.4 Openings in horizontal diaphragms.

Openings in horizontal diaphragms with a dimension perpendicular to the joist

that is greater than 4 feet (1.2 m) shall be constructed in accordance with Figure

R503.2.4.

DOUBLE JOISTS, TVP.

M(ITN...TIE t~ x 11t.r' l{ .;t'q MIN" {,nOTA1.)
WI 164M COMMON NAILS AS SHOWN ~-....,/

.00.

METAl...TIE tOOA x 1 Mi!' x (OPENING 'MMH '" 4'4') MIN"
(:2TOTAL) W/2:~ 16d COMMON NAlLS

Figure RS03.2.4

a. Blackings shall be provided beyond headers.

b. Metal ties not less than 0.058 inch [1.47 mm (16 galvanized gage)] by

1.5 inches (38 mm) wide with eight 16d common nails on each side of the header-joist

intersection. The metal ties shall have a minimum yield of 33,000 psi (227 MPa).

HOA.684523.11 21



c. Openings in diaphragms shall be further limited in accordance with

Section R301.2.2.2.5.

SECTION 35.

R602.3.2

Section R602.3.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Top plate.

Exception: In other than Seismic Design Category Do~1.. or D~....1!Asingle top

plate may be installed in stud walls, provided the plate is adequately tied at joints,

corners and intersecting walls by a minimum 3-inch-by-6-inch by a 0.036-inch-thick

(76 mm by 152 mm by 0.914 mm) galvanized steel plate that is nailed to each wall or

segment of wall by six 8d nails on each side, provided the rafters or joists are centered

over the studs with a tolerance of no more than 1 inch (25 mm). The top plate may be

omitted over lintels that are adequately tied to adjacent wall sections with steel plates or

equivalent as previously described.

SECTION 36. Table R602.3(1) is hereby amended to read as follows:

TABLE R602.3(1)

FASTENER SCHEDULE FOR STRUCTURAL MEMBERS

HOA.684523.11 22



TABLE R602.3(1)
FASTENER SCHEDULE FOR STRUCTURAL MEMBERS

ITEM SPACING OF FASTENERS

Roof

t4U:r.I9ERANIHVPE OF
DESCRIPTIONOF BUILDING ELEMENTS FASTENER'"b..

Blocking between joists or rafters to top D late, toe nail

2 Ceiling joists to plate, toe nail

3 Ceiling joists not attached to parallel rafter. laps over partitions.
fare nail

3-!Od

5 Rafter to plate, toe nail

4 Collar tie rafter, face nail or 11/;' x 20 gage ridge strap

6
Roof rafters to ridge. valley or hip rafters:
toe naiJ
face nail

3-1Od (3" x 0.128')

2-16:1 (31/,")< OJ 35")

4-16:1 (3 Jl," )( 0,135'')
3-16:1 (3Jj~"')( OJ35''}

Wall

24"0.c,7 Built-up corner studs !Od (3" x 0,128''')

Built-up header, two pieces with 1/," snacer

9 Continued header, two pieces

16<'o.c. alonz each edze

16'/O,C, alone each edge

11 Double studs, face nai.l 24" o.c,

ro Continuous header to stud, toe nail

12 Double top plates, face nail

13
Double top plate-s, minimum 48·indl.ol1set of end joints,
face nail in lapped area

14 So le plate to joist or blocking. face nail

15 Sole plate to [oist or blockinz at braced wall panels

16

4-Sd (21[," X. 0.1 13"}

10d(Y x O,128~)

16d (31!~" x eU35")

3-8d (21/;/' x 0,113,,)
or

2-16d3Ii/' x 0.135")

16"o.c,

16" o.c,

17 Top or sole plate to srud, end nail

18 Top plates, laps at corners and intersections, face nail

2-16:1 (3Jf," x 0.135")

2-H~i (3" x D.U8'')

19
2-8d (21/," X0, 113',)

2 stadles 13/ "

20 1,"x 6" sheathing to each bearing. face nail

21 1" x 8" sheathing to each bearing. face nail

\Vider than I" x 8" sheathing to each bearing. face nail

2-8d (21rt x 0,113")
2 staples Pi "

2-8d (21i," x D.II3''}
3 stadies jJ i ,.

3-8d (21/," x 0,113')
4 staples j3l~"

floor

23 Joist to sill or girder, toe nail

1" x 6" sub floor or less to each joist. fare nail

6'" 0,(;,

24

25 2'" subfloor to ioist or girder. blind and face nail

3-8d (21/," x 0, 113")

2-8d (lilt x OJ 13')
:2 staples Pl,,"

2-16:1 (31/,"~: I),DS")

26 Rim joist to top plate, toe nail (roof applications also)

27 2'" planks (plank & beam - floor & roof) 2-16:1 (3It,..' x 0.135'')

28 Built-lip girders and beams. 2.inch lnmber layers lOd (3" x 0,128',,)

Nail each layer as follows:
32'" o.c, at top and bottom and
staggered. Two nails at ends

and at each splice.

(continued)

29 Ledeerstrin slIpporting [oists or rafters

HOA.684523.11 23

3-16dCW," ><-0.135") At eachjoist or rafter



HOA.684523.11

TABLE R602.3(1 }----continued
FASTENER SCHEDULE FOR STRUCTURAl MEMBERS

40

OESCRI!PTION OF BUIU)JNG
MATERIAlS OESCfl!PTION OF FASTENER!>,·"

Ed~$.
(lncnll<s)'

lnteflnediate
supports'"
(Jnches)

Wood structurnJ panels, subflocr, roof and interior willi sheathing to lraming and particleboard wall sheathing to framing

ITEM

30 od common (2" ::<: 0, II Y') nail (subfloor wallY
8d common (2llt x G.B!") nail (roof)

31
od common (2" ::,;0, 113"') nail (sabfloor, wall)
8d common (2'ft x 0.131'") nail (roof)!

32

ltJd common (3" x 0.148"") nail or
8d(2'I( xO.l31") deformed flail

33

SPACING OF FASTENERS

6 1'1:>!"-~

IS p.

6 12~

6 12

1/," structural cellulosic
fiberboard sheathing

Itt galvanized roofing nail. 'lIt crown Of I"
C1'OW11 staple 16 ga., Pi/, long

2.."1,;" structural cellulosic
fi~rboard sheathing

~J(t galvanized roofing nail~1il(',;':'crown or l"
crown staple J 6 ga., lilt long35

Lit gypsum sheathing! j1l2' galvanized roofing nail; staple galvanized,
I liz" long; 11/4 screws, Type W' Of S

slt gypsum sheathing! PI/ glavanized roofing nail: staple galvanized,
Pi/long; {5i8~ SC1'e\." Type W or S

, 6

3 6

"] 7

..,
7,

38 '// and less

Wood structural p~nels, oomblnaHoo sublloor underlayroont 10 fmming

6d deformed (2'" x OJ 2!Y') nail or
Sd common (2W'"x OJ31"}mul

39
Sd common (21/," x O.B!"} nail or
Sd deformed (21J{ xOJ20,;l) nail

Wdoommon (3" x OJ 48") nail or
8d deformed (2iJz" x OJ 20'') nail

6 1"s:

6 12

6 12

For SI: 1 inch = 25.4 rum, 1 foot = 304.8 mm, [ mile per hour = 0,447 m1.; lksi = 6,895 MPa,
a. All nails are smooth-comraon, box." deformed shanks except where otherwise stated. Nails used fodrnming and sheathing connections "nan have minimum

average bending yield stre."gths as shown; 80 ks, fOB)",,,k diameter of 0, 192 inch (20d common nail), (,lOksi far shank diameters larger than O.142 incb but not
Iargenh.nO.lTI i,,,h. and 100 ksi for shank diameters offU42 inch or less ..

b. St~lPJc.sare 16 gag;e wire and have a minimum 1.iJofl..,i,nc--hC':lu diaulc.tc.r 1.::.rONn width.
c. Nailsshall be spaced at not more thrill 6 inches on center at all supports where spans are 48 inches orgreater,
d. Four-foot-by-Scfoot or-l-foot-by-a-foot panels shall be applied ·..,.rtically,
e. 5p""II1£ of fasrene ••s not included In this table shall be based on T,JbIe. R602.3(2),
f. For regions having basic wind speed of 1 ~0 mphor gre..nter, 8d deformed (2L}~ft X 0.120) nails shall be used for attaching plywood and wood structural panel roof

sheathing to framing WIthin minimum 48-inch distance from gable end walls. if mean roof height is more than 25 feet, up to 35 feet maximum.
g. For regions havmgbasic wind speed of 100 mph or Jess. nails for uttaching woodstructural panel roof sheathing to gable end wall framing shall be spaced t- inc hes

on center. When basic wind speed is greater than toO mph, nail. for attocl:ring pan::! roofsheathing to intermediate supports shallbe spaced 6 inches Con "enter {OJ'

lH.l11111Uln7148-inc:.h distance from ridges, eaves and gable end walls; and 4 inches on center to gable. end wall framing.
h. Gypsum •.hoathing ."hall conform to AsrM C J 396 and shall be. ;n stalled in accordance wifh Gil. 253. Fibab"ard ,iliellthing "hall c onform to .'\S1M C 211"\.
i. Spacin,g of fastenerson floor eheathing panel edges applies to panel edges supported ~r framing members and required blocking and at lin floor perimeters only.

Spaclug of fasteners on roof sheathing p.::tneledges applies to pane! edges supported by framing members and required blocking. Blocking of roof or floor sbeath-
jng pane lodges perpcndiculurto tile framing member, ueednotbe provided except as required by other provisions.of thi. code , Floor perimeter.shall be supported
by framing members or solid blockmg.

Use of staples in braced wall panels shall be prohiMed in Seismic Design Category DO D1 or D2.

24



SECTION 37. Table R602.3(2) is hereby amended to read as follows:

TABLE R602.3(2)

ALTERNATE ATTACHMENTS

b. Staples shall have a minimum crown width of 7/16-inch on diameter

except as noted. Use of staples in roof. floor. subfloor. and braced wall panels shall be

prohibited in Seismic Design Category DO~1. or D~.:.

SECTION 38. Table R602.1 0.1.2(2) is hereby amended to read as follows:

HOA.684523.11 25



TABLE ROO2.10.1.2(2)··b.<
BRACING REQUIREMENTS BASED ON SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY

(AS A FUNCTION OF BRACED WALL LINE LENGTH)

SUlL CLASS D"
WAlL HEIGHT •• 10 Ff

10 PSF FLOOR DEAD LOAD
15 PSF ROOFK:EIUNG DEAD LOAD MINIMUM TOTAl lENGTH (filet) OF BRACED WAlL PANELS REOUlRED

1-__ ------'00::.:.· .:::.cA:.:.C=ED::,....:.:W:..:AL=L:..:l::.:".:.::iE:...:S::.:.P..:..:A:.:.CI::..:N,G-'C"":..::25:.:.··-=-Ff-'-----__ ---;f-- -,----=-Al.=:.:.O:..;:NG=EA:.::CHBRACED WAll lINE
Seismic Design fll$thods g

C-ategory Braclld Wall DWa SFB, GB. Continuous
(SDC} Story Location Line Length Method UB PBS,PCP. HPS Metnod WSP Sheathlng

SOC A ami B
and Detached Dwellings in C

Exllmpt from SllfEmic Requjmments
Use Table R902.1 O.l.2{l} fur Bmclng Requirements

2.5 2.5 1.6 IA

5.0 5J} 32 2,7

7.5 7.5 4.8 4.1

10.0 10.0 6.4- 5A

n5 12.5 8.0 6.8

NP 4-5 3.0 2.6
NP 9.0 6,1) 5,}

NP 13.5 9.0 7.7

NP 18.0 12.0 10.2

NP 1'25 15.0 12.8

NP 6JJ 4.5 3~S

NP 12.0 9,0 7.7
NP 13.0 13.5 11.5

NP 24.0 18.0 .153

NP 30.0 22.5 19.1

NP ~ 6.0 2J) L7

NP -6;t)- 12.0 4,0 3,4

NP -9:&- 18.0 6.0 5.1

NP -t±&- 24.0 8.0 6.8

NP t5:e- 30.0 10.0 3,5

NP -6:&- NP 4.5 3.8

NP tr.:& NP 9.0 7.7

NP +t1r::l.'r NP 13.5 11.5

NP -2:4:£t- NP 18.0 153

NP -3e::& NP 22.5 19.1

NP --8:5- NP 6.0 5J
NP ~ NP 12,0 10.2

NP -25:5-NP 18,0 15.3

NP ~NP 24.0 2:0.4

NP COS NP 30.0 25.5

(cominued)

6 ., if----:-=------: ~~~~
II IJ C1 40

50

tj eS~:~----+----------~~------'-'-'----
50

6' 20edI ~f----..::..::.-:~ --+--=-=-----+----=-==---+---=~+---=-=---i

50

~8 @I----"-:~, ~~~~
so

e 20
tj § IIf------=-=-:~ --+--=-=---+----=-=------I-------=-=-~+--~-j

50

SDCC

10

10

10

SDC~oc D, tj e 8 f----=-~.::...~--+----=:..:.::-.---+----=-.::..:.::.---+----=-=~--I----=--=~------i

50

HOA.684523.11 26



TABLE R602.10.1.2(2)"· b·<-(:ontinued
BRACING REQUIREMENTS BASED ON SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY

(AS A FUNCTION OF BRACED WALL LINE LENGTH)

SOil CLASS D"
WALL HEIGHT" 10 I'T

10 PSF FLOOR DEAD LOAD
15 PSF ROOFICEILING rntAD LOAD MiNJMUM TOTAL LENGTH {feet} OF BRACED WALL PANELS REQUIRED

f--- -=B:.::R=-A:.::C-=E.;D....:W:..:A::::L=L-=L:.:lN::::E:..:S:.:p..:.A:.:C:.:IN;::Gt-,:.:$:.:2=..5 .:.1'T.:. -f --;-------'AL=:O:.:N:.:G:.:gr.~ •• BRACED WALL LINE

Sgjsmie ~sign METHODS DWB.
Category Bl1lOOdWall SFB. GB. PBS, PCP, Continuous
{SOC} Stwy Lol:lll:km Lina langill Method LIB HI'S Method WSP Sheathing

It 20 NP -&:9-16.0 5.0 4.3~ ~ B I-----'~:..:~:'----II----=-:-=i:---f---::.:~::..:i.:=-.-:-:'-:-+---17.:.:~::::.~---+--....:::::.:;..:.'---I
50 NP 2Q,940.0 12.5 10,tS
10 NP T:'j- NP 5.5 4,7

SDCD2 e S' 20 NP -t5:9- NP 11.0 '9.4

~. ", ',' " 1-- __ 3_O__ -+ N_P_,__ -t-_---"2c.:.Z-C.,5_NP_+-__ J""6c..:,S__ -+__ .:...14;.;:..0'--_-l
IT 40 NP -:ID:fr NP 22.0 18.7

50 NP ~ NP 27.5 23.4

10 NP NP NP NP

t1 §a1---r .....~---1---~-'-: .....---t------'.~c.:::-. --t-----=-:c:..:---1-----':'-'-:p=----I
50 NP NP NP NP

For 51: 1 foot = 304.8 mm, I pound per "'In""". fool = 47.8.91h.
a Wall bnwlngleng:th~arebasedonasoil she dress "D:' lnlerpolatioDofbra<:ing:ieng'lh'bolw<ell IheS.., values asscciated ,,,ithth. seismicdeaigncategoriee shall be

permitted whe'll a she-::'1=<,dfic.S~ value. is. determined in accordance with Section 16J 3,5 of tlx: Ct.1rlomia l1flildin;.~Ced«•.
b. Foundatiea cripple wall pands shall be braced in oocorrlance with Section R602.1 0.9,
c.!'.kihods of bracing shall be as described in Section. R602.1O.2. R602..10A and R602.1 0.5.

d. Methods GB and PCP braced wall panel hiw ratio shall not exceed 1:1 in SDC DO, D1 , or D2. Methods DV\E13,SFB, PBS, and HPS are not permitted
in SDC DO D1, or D2.

HOA.684523.11 27



SECTION 39. Table R602.1 0.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

I.UNIMUId THICKNESS

TABLE R602.10.2 a
INTERMITIENT BRACING METHODS -

FIGUREMETHOD

LIB

MATERIAL

Let-in-bracing
t ~,,:4 worn or approved metal
straps at 45" 10 60'" angles for
Ina ..ximum j 6'" stud spacing

~
~

CONNECTION CRITERIA

Wood: 2-8d nails per stud
including lop and bottom plate

metal: p~r manufacturer

DWB Diagonal wood board,
3l{" ( l'~ nominal)

for maximum 24" stud spacing

WSP Wood structural panel
(see Section R604)

2-8d (21/," X 0.113'') nail,
or 2 staples, .13/." per stud

rm OXted01 $h'.Jlhing ad common (2112" x 0.13'1) nails al 6"
8~@ Table R'60" ..3(3) spacing (panel edge) at 12" spacing
FOI intetiQI sheathing (intermediate supports) 31B" edge
seeT.ele R6()2,30) distance 10 panel edge.

8FB Structural
fiberboard sheathing

Ii," or 15/,," for maximom l e"
- stud spacing

See. Section R602.10.3,2

I Ii;' galvanized roofing nails or
3d common (211'," x{t131) nails
at 3' spacing (pw'ei edgesj at 6"
spacing (intermediate supports)

OB

PBS

PCP

HPS

Gypsum board

Particleboard sheathing
(sec Section R605)

Portland cement
plaster

Hardboard panel
siding

Jl{ or J./,/' for maximum [6'"
stud 'Pacing

See, Section R703.6
For maximum 16" stud spacing

For maximum 16" stud spacing

ABW Alternate braced
wall See Section R602.1 03.2 IIIIIIIIIIIII!

n

Nails or screws at T' spacing at
panel edges including top and

bottom plates; for all braced wall
panel locations for exterior

shearhing imi! or screw size, see
T.blt> :R602.3(l); for interior

gypsum board nail or screw size,
see Table R70235

1 lit galvanized r-oofing nails or
Sd c..ommon(2'!," H0.131) nails
'13' spacing (panel edges'! at 6
spacing (lntermediate supports)

1]/2:", t t gage, Jill,'" head nails at
6"1" spacing or

'is". 1.6gage staples ol6"
spacing Q.

0,092" dia., 0.225' head naits
with len#h to accommodate

I'i," penotratiotl into stud, 314"
spacing (panel edges), at 8"

spacing (intermediate supports)

PPH

PPC

Intermittent portal
frame

See Section.R602.I(U.3

See Section R602. 10.3.4

rot8- "" ~

.•.. - •...... - See Section R602.l0.3.3

See Section R602J03.4Intermiuent portal frame
at garage

a. Methods GB and PCP braced wall panel hiw ralio shall nol exceed 1:1 in SDC DO D1 or D2. Methods LIB DVII8 SFB PBS HPS and PFG are
not permitted in SDC DO D'l and D2.

b. Use of staples in braced wall panels shall be prohibned in SDC DO D1 or D2.

HOA.684523.11 28



Top plates shall be continuous over a braced wallI~
SECTION 40. Figure R602.1 0.3.2 is amended to read as follows:

SECTION 41. Section R602.10.3.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R602.10.3.3 Method PFH: Portal frame with hold-downs.

1. Each panel shall be fabricated in accordance with Figure R602.1 0.3.3.

The wood structural panel sheathing shall extend up over the solid sawn or glued-

laminated header and shall be nailed in accordance with Figure R602.1 0.3.3. A spacer,

if used with a built-up header, shall be placed on the side of the built-up beam opposite

the wood structural panel sheathing. The header shall extend between the inside faces

of the first full-length outer studs of each panel. One anchor bolt not less than 5/8-inch-

diameter (16 mm) and installed in accordance with Section R403.1.6 shall be provided

in the center of each sill plate. The hold-down devices shall be an embedded-strap

type, installed in accordance with the manufacturer's recommendations. The panels

shall be supported directly on a foundation that is continuous across the entire length of

the braced wall line. The foundation shall be reinforced as shown on Figure

R602.10.3.2. This reinforcement shall be lapped not less than 4-624 inches (384610

mm) with the reinforcement required in the continuous foundation located directly under

the braced wall line.

HOA.684523.11 29



SECTION 42. Figure R602.1 0.3.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

DOOR OPENINGS

SECTION 43.

EXTENT OF HEADER
1---------- DOUHLEPORTALfRAME {TVV'OflAACEDWALL PANELS) ----- 1

TABLE R602.10.4.1

CONTINUOUS SHEATHING METHODS

HOA.684523.11 30

EXfEHFOF IIE .•••IlER

FASTEN TOP PLt..TE TO HEADER WITH TWO
ROWS OF 16DSlNKER N,&JLSAT.3"O.C. WP.

/
10'00La STRt..P OPPOSITE SHEATHING

MAX.
HEIGHT

10'

fASTEN SHE/ITHING TO HEADER WlTH roCOMMON eR
e:••••n1';l~flEB BOX NJ.JLS 1N3" GRID PATTERN AS SHOWN AND
3" O.C.INALLFRb.MING {STUDS, BLOCKING, AND SlLLS)TYP. /

24

MIN.W1DTH =WFORONESTORYSTRUCTURE /
HI~l. "',!'I9¥H -:2 4' 'F'G.RUBE IN THE: 1=1R8¥ Gl= T'W4:l !
&FOFN S'fRUCTURES /

~••••.~. MIN.b:4FRAMING I
1~T ~---,_ '_.•MIN. THICKNESS WOOD DOH LE

STRUCTURAL PANEL SHEATHING 2x11 . .. ST

r----tH-~ MI~l. 4200 LB TIE-DOWN DEVICE (EMBEDDED INTO
CONCRETE AND NAILED INTO FRAMING)

FORAPANELSPUCE •
{If NEEDED), PANEL •

EDGES SHALL BE
BLOCKID, AND OCCUR

\MTHIN 24' OFMID- •
HEIGHT. ONE ROW Of •
TYP_SHEATH1NG-TO- I#~+f+l
FRAMING NAIUNG IS •

REQUlRED_ •
IF2x4 BLOCKING 18 •

'\ USED, THE 2x4"S MUST •
BE NAILED TOGETHER

\ WITH :3 160 SINKERS •

\
M~.. 1000LB
11 OWN
DE CE

METHOD PFH: PORTAL FRAME WITH HOLD-DOWNS AT DETACHED GARAGE

SEE SECTION 1".£>;)2.'10.3.3

FIGURE R602.10.3.3

Table R602.10.4.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:



TABLE R602.10.4.1
CONTINUOUS SHEATHING METHODS

METHOD MATERlA!. MINIMUM THICKNESS FiGURE CONNECTION CRITERIA

cs.wsr- Wood structural panel

IIIQ 1
Wood structural panel adjacent

to garage openings and
supponing roof load only'··

CS-G See Method CS- \\,'SP

See Section
Rti02.10A.l.l

See Section
Ro.UJO.4. 1.1CS-PF Continuous portal frame

For 51: I j""h = 25.4 nun. I pound per ""l"""" [<>a; =47 .S\! Po.
a. Applies to one w'On of a garage oilly,
b. Roof covering dead loads shall be 3 psf or less.
c. Use of staples in braced wall panels shall be prohibttecj in Seismic Design Cateqorv DO D'l or D2.

SECTION 44. Figure R602.1 0.4.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

HOA.684523.11 31



OUTSIDE EUIiATlON SID£ £l£\lAl1Qt.1

c..------- lXIfNl 01' HEADER il\'fO Bl?ACfD VIAlL SS:""'ENl'S) ------------>
EXtENt OF HEAOBR {Or4E aR~C-fD WAIL Sffi,\"ENT;

V/OCO STRUCTUP,J\L
I'ANHMUST ill:
C:ONl1NLr(}l".1}; F~X),M
TOP OF WAll TO
llQTTOM OF WAiL
(;4! fROM rO~1Cf
"VALl. ro Fl'RMimO
,SPLICE ""fA

t.t-iOjO~aOLtP~" ~40S.1.'" m
::1A"4C:l+OV. <iOHS PiE¥ "'.100 I ,", ~H~\.llP.~O,

OV£IlCONCJt£l'£ 011 MASONlll'l' alOCK FOUUOATION

f~Afi·trNG ANtHO~,)
~,liJ LSI
570 L8,'

NAll SOILE PLATE
"KlJOiSlPEii:
!A!l&EIUl02,311(

NAil SOLE
1'1At'ftO J{Ylt
Pi •• r'.BLf
Ri,OJ.3!;}

pPPROvt:D
t,{ANLJ .JOiST

BD COMMON NAILS
3' 0 CIOFI\ND lJOTTOM

NAil SOlE l'\.ATE
ro JO!ST PER
rp$lE i\:t<t,'2 ;J( I!

NAil, sou
ru,TE TO JC>!ST
r"SR 'fAU-iLl
RioQ7.3i1;

,Apr~OliF()
!1';NO JUST

NOT TO SCAlE

For SJ, 1 in;..h=2SA nun, I foot = 304.8 mm, I pound force =4.44g N.

FIGURE R60:2.10A.l.1
METHOD CS·PF: CONTINUOUS PORTAL FRAME PANEL CONSTRUCTION

HOA684523.11 32



SECTION 45. Section R602.10.7.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

R602.10.7.1 Braced wall panel support for Seismic Design Category D2. In

one story buildings located in Seismic Design Category D2, braced wall panels shall be

supported on continuous foundations at intervals not exceeding 50 feet (15 240 mm). In

1'...,0 story buildings located in Seismic Design Category D2, all braced \Nall panels shall

be supported on continuous foundations.

Exception: Two story buildings shall be permitted to have interior braced '•..,all

panels supported on continuous foundations at intervals not exceeding 50 feet (15 240

mm) provided that:

1. The height of cripple walls does not exceed 4 feet (1219 mm).

2. First floor braced wall panels are supported on doubled floor joists,

continuous blocking or floor beams.

3. The distance beh..,een bracing lines does not exceed t\..,ice the building

width measured parallel to the braced "..,alliine.

SECTION 46. Section R606.2.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R606.2.4 Parapet walls.

Unreinforced solid masonry parapet walls shall not be less than 8 inches

(203 mm) thick and their height shall not exceed four times their thickness.

Unreinforced hollow unit masonry parapet walls shall be not less than 8 inches

(203 mm) thick, and their height shall not exceed three times their thickness. Masonry

parapet walls in areas subject to wind loads of 30 pounds per square foot (1.44 kPa)..Q[

HOA.684523.11 33



located in Seismic Design Category Do, 01, or O2, or on townhouses in Seismic Design

Category C shall be reinforced in accordance with Section R606.12.

SECTION 47. Section RB02.B is hereby amended to read as follows:

RB02.B Lateral support.

Roof framing members and ceiling joists having a depth-to-thickness ratio

exceeding e~to 1 based on nominal dimensions shall be provided with lateral support

at points of bearing to prevent rotation. For roof rafters with ceiling joists attached per

Table R602.3(1), the depth-thickness ratio for the total assembly shall be determined

using the combined thickness of the rafter plus the attached ceiling joist.

SECTION 4B. Section RB02.1 0.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

RB02.10.2 Design.

Wood trusses shall be designed in accordance with accepted engineering

practice. The design and manufacture of metal-plate-connected wood trusses shall

comply with ANSI/TPI 1. The truss design drawings shall be prepared by a registered

professional where required by the statutes of the jurisdiction in 'Nhich the project is to

be constructed in accordance with Section R106.1.

HOA.684523.11 34



SECTION 49. Table R802.5.1 (9) is hereby amended to read as follows:

TABLE Ra02.5.1(9)
RAFTERiCEILING JOIST HEEL JOINT CONNECTIONS··b .•.•••. I.h J

GROUND SNOW LOAD (pst)
:ro~ 30 50 70

flool span (feet)
RAFTER 12 20 211 36 12 26 28 36 12 20 28 36 12 20 28 36

RAFTER SPACING
SLOPE {incMS} Iiaquirlld number et tsd common nails" b per hGel join! &p1ioes.'Ii., f

12 4- 6 8 10 4- 6 S 11 :5 8 12 15 6 11 15 20
3;12 16 5 8 ro 13 5 8 11 14 6 11 15 20 8 14- 20 26

24 7 11 15 19 7 11 16 21 9 16 23 30 12 21 3D 39

12 3 5 6 8. .3 5 6 8 4- 6 9 11 :5 8 12 15
4;12 16 4- 6 8 10 4- 6 8. 11 :5 8 12 15 6 11 15 20

24 5 8 12 15 5 9 12 16 "1 12 l7 22 9 16 23 29
12 3 4 :5 6 3 4 5 7 3 5 7 9' 4 7 9 12

5:12 16 3 :5 6 8. 3 :5 "1 9 4 7 9 12 5 9 12 16
24 4 1 9 12 4 7 W 13 6 1(} 14- 18 7 13 18 23

12 3 4 4 5 3 3 4 5 3 4 5 7 3 5 "1 9'
7:: 12 16 3 4- 5 6 3 4- :5 6 3 :5 "1 <} 4 6 9 11

24 3 5 7 9 3 :5 7 <} 4 7 10 1" :5 () 13 17-'
12 3 3 4 4 3 3 3 4- 3 3 4 5 3 4 :5 7

9:12 16 3 4 4 5 3 3 4 5 .3 4 :5 7 3 :5 "1 <}

24 3 4 6 "1 3 4 6 7 3 6 8. 10 4 7 io 13

12 3 3 :3 3 3 3 3 3 3 :3 3 4- 3 3 4 5
12:12 16 3 3 4 4- .3 3 3 4- 3 3 4 5 3 4 5 7

24 3 4 4 5 3 :3 4 6 3 4 6 8 3 6 S 10
For Sl; I inch = 25.4 mm, I foot = 304.3 mm, ! pound per square foot = O.0479kP a,
a 40d box nails shall be. permitted 10 b. substituted for 16d common nails.
b. Neilingrequirerneras shall be permiued to be. reduced 25 perceat if nails are clinched,
c. Hcd j-oint c ounectious are not required when the ridge is supported by a load-bearing ''AtIn, header OT ridge beam.
d.. WI""" intermediate support of the rafl<:r is provided by vertical struts or purlins to a loadbearmg walt tho tnbulated heel joim c onnection requ irements sholl beper-

mitted to be reduced proportionally to the, reduction in spa",
c. Eqaivulent nailing parterns are 'required for ceiling jOi5t to c-eilJng joist lap 8plice5..
f. "''hen rafter ties are substituted for ceiling joists, the heel joint connection requirementshall be taken as the tabulated hec] joint connection "'q"'''''''''''l for

[,vo-lhirds of the "ctuol ral\:er-slope.
g. App!i es to roof live load of 20 psf or lese.
h. Tabulated heeljcimccnnection reqairements assume thatc-eilingjoi&t::'IJT rafter ties are located at the bottom ofthe attic space. 'Nhen .::.::jHngjoists orrafterties are

located higher inthe attic, heel joint connection requirements shall be }u".r.awe! by the foll"'Nulg factors:

113

]/4
1.5

1.33

1.25

He~ Jollli COlll1l.>ctioll
Adiustment Factor

llS

li6 1.2

HID or less Lll

where:
He = Height or coiling joists or rafllor ties measured vertically ab••••.., the top of the rafter support walls,
HR = Height of roof ridge measured vertically above the top of the rafter support 'IF.IlS.

i. Edge distances. end distances and spacings for nails shall be sufficient to prevent splitting of the wood.

HOA.684523.11 35



SECTION 50. Section R803.2.4 is hereby added to read as follows:

RS03.2.4 Openings in horizontal diaphragms.

Openings in horizontal diaphragms shall conform with Section R503.2.4.

SECTION 51. Section R1001.3.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R1001.3.1 Vertical reinforcing.

For chimneys up to 40 inches (1016 mm) wide, four NO.4 continuous vertical

bars adequately anchored into the concrete foundation shall be placed between wythes

of solid masonry or within the cells of hollow unit masonry and grouted in accordance

with Section R609. Grout shall be prevented from bonding with the flue liner so that the

flue liner is free to move with thermal expansion. For chimneys more than 40 inches

(1016 mm) wide, two additional NO.4 vertical bars shall be provided for each additional

flue incorporated into the chimney or for each additional 40 inches (1016 mm) in width

or fraction thereof.

SECTION 52. The provisions of this ordinance contain various changes,

modifications, and additions to the 2010 Edition of the California Residential Code.

Some of these changes are administrative in nature in that they do not constitute

changes or modifications to requirements contained in the building standards published

in the California Building Standards Code.

Pursuant to California Health and Safety Code sections 17958.5, 17958.7, and

18941.5, the Board of Supervisors hereby expressly finds that all of the changes and

modifications to requirements contained in the building standards published in the

California Building Standards Code, contained in this ordinance, which are not

HOA.684523.11 36



administrative in nature, are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological,

or topographical conditions in the County of Los Angeles as more particularly described

in the table set forth below.

Code Section Condition Explanation of Amendment

R301.1.3.2 Geological After the 1994 Northridge Earthquake, the Wood Frame
Construction Joint Task Force recommended that the
quality of wood frame construction needs to be greatly
improved. One such recommendation identified by the
Task Force is to improve the quality and organization of
structural plans prepared by the engineer or architect so
that plan examiners, building inspectors, contractors, and
special inspectors may logically follow and construct the
presentation of the seismic force-resisting systems in the
construction documents. For buildings or structures
located in Seismic Design Category Do, 01, O2, or E that
are subject to a greater level of seismic forces, the
requirement to have a California licensed architect or
engineer prepare the construction documents is intended
to minimize or reduce structural deficiencies that may
cause excessive damage or injuries in wood frame
buildings. Structural deficiencies such as plan and vertical
irregularities, improper shear transfer of the seismic force-
resisting system, missed details or connections important
to the structural system, and the improper application of
the prescriptive requirements of the California Residential
Code can be readily addressed by a registered design
professional.

R301.1.4 Geological This technical amendment is for buildings constructed on
Topographical hillsides. Due to the local topographical and geological

conditions of the sites within the greater Los Angeles
region and their susceptibility to earthquakes, this
amendment is required to address and clarify special
needs for buildings constructed on hillside locations. A
joint Structural Engineers Association of Southern
California (SEAOSC), Los Angeles County, and
Los Angeles City Task Force investigated the performance
of hillside building failures after the Northridge earthquake.
Numerous hillside failures resulted in loss of life and

HOA.684523.11 37



Code Section Condition Explanation of Amendment

millions of dollars in damage. These criteria were
developed to minimize the damage to these structures and
have been in use by the City and County of Los Angeles
for several years.

R301.2.2.2.5 Geological Due to the high geologic activities in the Southern
California area and the expected higher level of
performance on buildings and structures, this local
amendment limits the type of irregular conditions as
specified in the 2010 California Residential Code. Such
limitations are recommended to reduce structural damages
in the event of an earthquake. The cities and county of the
Los Angeles region have taken extra measures to maintain
the structural integrity of the framing of the shear walls and
all associated elements when designed for high levels of
seismic loads.

R301.2.2.3.5.1 Geological The term "one" in AISI S230, Section B1 conflicts with
Table B1-1, whereas in the table it states the "thinnest
connected steel sheet." The term "one" in the AISI S230,
Section B1 language can misleadingly be interpreted as .
though one of the sheets can be 33 mils and the other
sheet thicker, but that you still qualify for a reduction factor;
this is not the intent of the tables. For example, in a steel-
to-steel connection consisting of a 33 mils and 44 mils,
and if in any part of the code it is required to provide (4)
NO.8 screws; according to Table B1-1 the factor 1.0 would
apply to the required number of screws and thus a
reduction of screws would not be allowed.

R322.1.4.1 Geological This amendment is intended to clarify who should perform
Topographical studies and analyses for design flood elevations. Based

on our vast experience with drainage and grading sites, we
have concluded that registered civil engineers are highly
equipped to perform such design and analyses.

R327 Climatic States that Chapter R327 requirements are applicable to
all occupancy groups as wildfire exposure impacts all
types of buildings and structures. This amendment is
needed due to the high-fire severity zones caused by low
humidity, stronq winds and dry veuetation.

R327.1.1 Climatic Clarifies the application of Chapter R327 to include
additions, alterations, and/or relocated buildings.
Additions, alterations, and/or relocated buildings have the
same fire risk as new buildings.

HOA.684523.11 38



Code Section Condition Explanation of Amendment

R327.1.3 Climatic Clarifies the application of Chapter R327 to include
additions, alterations, and/or relocated buildings.
Additions, alterations, and/or relocated buildings have the
same fire risk as new buildings.

R327.1.3.1 Climatic Clarifies the application of Chapter R327 to include
additions, alterations, and/or relocated buildings. Additions,
alterations, and/or relocated buildings have the same fire
risk as new buildinqs.

R327.3.5.2 Climatic Due to low humidity, strong winds, and dry vegetation in
high-fire severity zones, the Fire Department could not find
sufficient evidence to allow the use of wood-shingle/wood-
shake roof.

R327.3.5.2.2 Climatic Due to low humidity, strong winds and dry vegetation in
high-fire severity zones, the Fire Department could not find
sufficient evidence to allow the use of wood-shingle/wood-
shake roof.

R327.4.3 Climatic Due to low humidity, strong winds, and dry vegetation in
high-fire severity zones, the Fire Department could not find
sufficient evidence to allow the use of wood-shingle/wood-
shake roof.

R327.5.2 Climatic Due to low humidity, strong winds, and dry vegetation in
high-fire severity zones, the Fire Department could not find
sufficient evidence to allow the use of wood-shingle/wood-
shake roof and would require the use of Class A roof
coverino.

R401.1 Geological Wood foundations, even those that are preservative-
treated, encounter a higher risk of deterioration when
contacting the adjacent ground. The required seismic
anchorage and transfer of lateral forces into the foundation
system necessary for 2-story structures and foundation
walls could become compromised at varying states of
wood decay. In addition, global structure overturning
moment and sliding resistance is reduced when utilizing
wood foundations as opposed to conventional concrete or
masonry systems. However, non-occupied, single-story
storage structures pose significantly less risk to human
safety and should be able to utilize the wood foundation
guidelines specified in this Chapter.

R403.1.2 Climatic This proposed amendment requires minimum
R403.1.3 Geological reinforcement in continuous footings and stepped footings
R403.1.5 to address the problem of poor performance of plain or

under-reinforced footings during a seismic event. This
amendment reflects the recommendations by the

HOA.684523.11 39



Code Section Condition Explanation of Amendment

Structural Engineers Association of Southern California
(SEAOSC) and the Los Angeles City Joint Task Force that
investigated the poor performance observed in the 1994
Northridge Earthquake. This proposed amendment is a
continuation of an amendment adopted during previous
code adoption cycles. Interior walls can easily be called
upon to resist over half of the seismic loading imposed on
simple buildings or structures. Without a continuous
foundation to support the braced wall line, seismic loads
would be transferred through other elements such as non-
structural concrete slab floors, wood floors, etc. Requiring
interior braced walls be supported by continuous
foundations is intended to reduce or eliminate the poor
performance of buildings or structures.

R404.2 Climatic No substantiating data has been provided to show that
Geological wood foundations are effective in supporting structures

and buildings during a seismic event while being subject to
deterioration caused by presence of water in the soil as
well as other materials detrimental to wood foundations.
Wood foundations, when they are not properly treated and
protected against deterioration, have performed very
poorly and have led to slope failures. Most contractors are
typically accustomed to construction in dry weather in the
Southern California region and are not generally familiar
with the necessary precautions and treatment of wood that
makes it suitable for both seismic events and wet
applications. With the higher seismic demand placed on
buildings and structures in this region, coupled with the
dryer weather conditions here as oppose to the northern
and eastern part of the country, it is the intent of this
proposal to take the necessary precautionary steps to
reduce or eliminate potential problems that may result from
the use of wood footings and foundations that does not
take into consideration the conditions of this surrounding
environment.

R501.1 Geological There is no limitation for weight of mechanical and
plumbing fixtures and equipment in the CRC Code.
Requirements of ASCE 7-05 and CSC are necessary that
limits equipment weight up to 400 pounds, mounted at 4
feet or less above the floor or attic level without
engineerinq design.

HOA.684523.11 40



Code Section Condition Explanation of Amendment

R503.2.4 Geological Section R502.1 0 of the Code does not provide any
prescriptive criteria to limit the maximum floor opening size
nor does Section R503 provide any details to address the
issue of shear transfer near larger floor openings. With the
higher seismic demand placed on buildings and structures
in this region, it is important to ensure that a complete load
path is provided to reduce or eliminate potential damages
caused by seismic forces. Requiring blocking with metal
ties around larger floor openings and limiting opening size
is consistent with the requirements of Section
R301.2.2.2.5.

602.3.2 Geological The cities and county of the Los Angeles region have
taken extra measures to maintain the structural integrity of
the framing of the shear walls when designed for high
levels of seismic loads by eliminating single top plate
construction. The performance of modern day braced wall
panel construction is directly related to an adequate load
path extending from the roof diaphragm to the foundation
system.

Table R602.3(1) Geological In September 2007, limited cyclic testing data was
provided to the ICC Los Angeles Chapter Structural Code
Committee showing that stapled wood structural shear
panels do not exhibit the same behavior as the nailed
wood structural shear panels. As a matter of fact, the test
results of the stapled wood structural shear panels
appeared much lower in strength and drift than the nailed
wood structural shear panel test results. Therefore, the
use of staples as fasteners for shear walls sheathed with
other materials shall not be permitted without being
substantiated by cyclic testing. This proposed amendment
is a continuation of an amendment adopted during
previous code adoption cycles for the California Building
Code.

Table R602.3(2) Geological In September 2007, limited cyclic testing data was
provided to the ICC Los Angeles Chapter Structural Code
Committee showing that stapled wood structural shear
panels do not exhibit the same behavior as the nailed
wood structural shear panels. As a matter of fact, the test
results of the stapled wood structural shear panels
appeared much lower in strength and drift than the nailed
wood structural shear panel test results. Therefore, the

HOA.684523.11 41



Code Section Condition Explanation of Amendment

use of staples as fasteners for shear walls sheathed with
other materials shall not be permitted without being
substantiated by cyclic testing. This proposed amendment
is a continuation of an amendment adopted during
previous code adoption cycles for the California Building
Code.

Table Geological Due to the high geologic activities in the Southern
R602.10.1.2(2) California area and the expected higher level of

performance on buildings and structures, this local
amendment continues to reduce/eliminate the allowable
shear values for shear walls sheathed with lath, plaster, or
gypsum board. The poor performance of such shear walls
sheathed with other materials in the 1994 Northridge
Earthquake was investigated by the Structural Engineers
Association of Southern California (SEAOSC) and the
Los Angeles City Task Force. The cities and county of the
Los Angeles region have taken extra measures to maintain
the structural integrity of the framing of the shear walls
when designed for high levels of seismic loads. In
addition, this proposed amendment is consistent with the
conventional framing provisions of the 2010 California
Building Code.

Table Geological 3/8" thick 3 ply-plywood shear walls experienced many
R602.10.2 failures during the Northridge Earthquake. This proposed

amendment specifies minimum WSP sheathing thickness
and nail size and spacing so as to provide a uniform
standard of construction for designers and buildings to
follow. This is intended to improve the performance level
of buildings and structures that are subject to the higher
seismic demands placed on buildings or structure in this
region. This proposed amendment reflects the
recommendations by the Structural Engineers Association
of Southern California (SEAOSC) and the Los Angeles
City Joint Task Force that investigated the poor
performance observed in 1994 Northridge Earthquake.
This proposed amendment is a continuation of an
amendment adopted during previous code adoption cycles
for the California Building Code. In September 2007,
cyclic testing data was provided to the structural code
committee showing that stapled wood structural shear
panels do not exhibit the same behavior as the nailed

HOA.684523.11 42



Code Section Condition Explanation of Amendment

wood structural shear panels. In addition, the test results
of the stapled wood structural shear panels appeared
much lower in strength and drift than the nailed wood
structural shear panel test results.

Figure Geological 3/8" thick 3 ply-plywood shear walls experienced many
R602.10.3.2 failures during the Northridge Earthquake. The poor

performance of such shear walls sheathed in the 1994
Northridge Earthquake was investigated by the Structural
Engineers Association of Southern California (SEAOSC)
and the Los Angeles City Task Force. Box nails were
observed to cause massive and multiple failures of the
typical 3/8" thick 3 ply-plywood during the Northridge
Earthquake. The cities and county of the Los Angeles
region have taken extra measures to maintain the
structural integrity of the framing of the shear walls when
designed for high levels of seismic loads. The proposal for
minimum lap splice requirement is consistent with Section
12.16.1 of ACI 318-05. The performance of modern day
braced wall panel construction is directly related to an
adequate load path extending from the roof diaphragm to
the foundation system. This proposed amendment
continues amendments adopted during the previous code
cycle for the California Building Code.

R602.10.3.3 Geological The proposal to change the minimum lap splice
requirement is consistent with Section 12.16.1 of ACI 318-
05.

Figure Geological 3/8" thick 3 ply-plywood shear walls experienced many
R602.10.3.3 failures during the Northridge Earthquake. The poor

performance of such shear walls sheathed in the 1994
Northridge Earthquake was investigated by the Structural
Engineers Association of Southern California (SEAOSC)
and the Los Angeles City Task Force. The cities and
county of the Los Angeles region have taken extra
measures to maintain the structural integrity of the framing
of the shear walls when designed for high levels of seismic
loads. Box nails were observed to cause massive and
multiple failures of the typical 3/8-inch thick plywood during
the Northridge Earthquake. This proposed amendment
continues amendments adopted during the previous code
cycle for the California Building Code.

HOA.684523.11 43



Code Section Condition Explanation of Amendment

Table Geological 3/8" thick 3 ply-plywood shear walls experienced many
R602.10.4.1 failures during the Northridge Earthquake. The poor

performance of such shear walls sheathed in the 1994
Northridge Earthquake was investigated by the Structural
Engineers Association of Southern California (SEAOSC)
and the Los Angeles City Task Force. The cities and
county of the Los Angeles region have taken extra
measures to maintain the structural integrity of the framing
of the shear walls when designed for high levels of seismic
loads. This proposed amendment continues the previous
amendment adopted during the 2007 code adoption cycle
for the California Building Code. In September 2007,
limited cyclic testing data was provided to the ICC
Los Angeles Chapter Structural Code Committee showing
that stapled wood structural shear panels do not exhibit
the same behavior as the nailed wood structural shear
panels. As a matter of fact, the test results of the stapled
wood structural shear panels appeared much lower in
strength and drift than the nailed wood structural shear
panel test results. Therefore, the use of staples as
fasteners for shear walls sheathed with other materials
shall not be permitted without being substantiated by cyclic
testing. This proposed amendment is a continuation of an
amendment adopted during previous code adoption
cycles.

Figure Geological 3/8" thick 3 ply-plywood shear walls experienced many
R602.10.4.1.1 failures during the Northridge Earthquake. The poor

performance of such shear walls sheathed in the 1994
Northridge Earthquake was investigated by the Structural
Engineers Association of Southern California (SEAOSC)
and the Los Angeles City Task Force. The cities and
county of the Los Angeles region have taken extra
measures to maintain the structural integrity of the framing
of the shear walls when designed for high levels of seismic
loads. This proposed amendment continues the previous
amendment adopted during the 2007 code adoption cycle
for the California Building Code. The proposal in which
"washers shall be a minimum of 0.229 inch by 3 inches by
3 inches in size" is consistent with Section R602.11.1 of
the 2010 California Residential Code and Section
2308.12.8 of the 2010 California Building Code.

HOA.684523.11 44



Code Section Condition Explanation of Amendment

R602.10.7.1 Geological The performance of modern day braced wall panel
construction is directly related to an adequate load path
extending from the roof diaphragm to the foundation
system. Interior braced wall panels, therefore, are also
directly dependent upon the adequacy of the foundation
system. In addition, the proposed amendment for Section
R403.1.2 specifies that all exterior walls and required
interior braced wall panels in buildings shall be supported
with continuous footings.

R606.2.4 Geological The addition of the word "or" will prevent the use of
unreinforced parapets in Seismic Design Category Do, 01,

or O2, or on townhouses in Seismic Design Category C.
Table Geological The number of nails required for the heel joint connection
RB02.5.1 (9) per Table RB02.5.1 (9) can be excessive depending on the

rafter slope, spacing, and roof span. This footnote will
help to prevent splitting of connecting wood members
when large numbers of nail are required as stated in the
National Design Specification for Wood Construction
(NOS).

RB02.B Geological This proposed amendment provides provisions to ensure
that the ends of wood members and the points of bearing
have adequate lateral support to prevent rotation and to
help stabilize the members during construction. This
proposed amendment is consistent with and similar to
requirements contained in the NOS.

RB02.10.2 Geological Wood trusses are engineered structural elements that
require engineered design and calculations. This
amendment provides clarifications that all wood truss
design drawings are to be prepared by a registered
professional.

RB03.2.4 Geological Section RB02 of the Code does not provide any
prescriptive criteria to limit the maximum size of roof
openings, nor does Section RB03 provide any details to
address the issue of shear transfer near larger roof
openings. With the higher seismic demand placed on
buildings and structures in this region, it is important to
ensure that a complete load path is provided to reduce or
eliminate potential damage caused by seismic forces.
Requiring blocking with metal ties around larger roof
openings and limiting the size of openings is consistent
with the requirements of Section R301.2.2.2.5.

HOA.684523.11 45



Code Section Condition Explanation of Amendment

R1001.3.1 Geological The performance of fireplaces/chimneys without
anchorage to the foundation has been observed to be
inadequate during major earthquakes. The lack of
anchorage to the foundation results in overturn or
displacement.

SECTION 53. This ordinance shall become operative on January 1, 2011.

[30RESBLDNGMYCC]

HOA.684523.11 46




