COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS

"To Envich Lhves Throwgh Effective and Cahing Sanica"

900 SOUTH FREMOMT AVEMLUIE
ALHAMBREA, CALIFORMIA 91803-1331

. Telephone: (626) 458-5100
GAIL FARBER, Director http:id e lacounty. gov

P.O.BOX 1460

ADDRESS ALL CORRESPOMDEMCE TO:

ALHAMBRA, CALIFORMIA 91302-1460

November 03, 2010 ADOPTED

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES
The Honorable Board of Supervisors
County of Los Angeles 29  NOVEMBER 3, 2010
383 Kenneth Hahn Hall of Administration <,y
500 West Temple Street R H?%irfw
Los Angeles, California 90012 EXECUTIVE OFFICER

. SET FOR HEARING: NOVEMBER 23, 2010 AT 9:30 AM
Dear Supervisors:

PROPOSED 2011 LOS ANGELES COUNTY
RESIDENTIAL CODE
(ALL SUPERVISORIAL DISTRICTS)
(3 VOTES)

SUBJECT

Proposed ordinance to adopt, update, and set forth provisions and regulations for the enforcement of
the Residential Code to be known as Title 30 of the Los Angeles County Code as required by State

law.
IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOUR BOARD:

Introduce, waive reading, and schedule a public hearing on November 23, 2010, regarding an
ordinance that adopts by reference the 2010 California Residential Code, with amendments.

AFTER THE PUBLIC HEARING, IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOUR BOARD:

1. Find that the proposed changes and modifications to building standards contained in the 2010
California Residential Code are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological, and/or
topographical conditions, as detailed in the ordinance.

2. Find that the proposed ordinances are exempt from the provisions of the California Environmental

Quality Act pursuant to State Guidelines Section 15061 (b)(3).
3. Approve the ordinance and establish its operative date as January 1, 2011.

4. Direct the County of Los Angeles Department of Public Works to file the adopted ordinance


ctalamantes
New Stamp

ctalamantes
Typewritten Text
29	NOVEMBER 3, 2010

ctalamantes
Typewritten Text
SET FOR HEARING: NOVEMBER 23, 2010 AT 9:30 AM


The Honorable Board of Supervisors
11/3/2010
Page 2

containing your Board of Supervisors' findings with the California Building Standards Commission.

PURPOSE/JUSTIFICATION OF RECOMMENDED ACTION

The enclosed ordinance, when adopted, will update and set forth provisions and regulations for the
enforcement of the Residential Code within the unincorporated areas of the County of Los Angeles
(County) and the Contract Cities served by the County that elect to adopt the same ordinance by
reference, as required by State law.

Implementation of Strategic Plan Goals

The Countywide Strategic Plan directs the provision of Operational Effectiveness (Goal 1),
Community and Municipal Services (Goal 3), and Public Safety (Goal 5) as it provides services to the
public that have a wide-reaching positive effect on the entire community. The adoption of the
County's Residential Code provides minimum construction standards that promote the health and
welfare of the general public throughout the unincorporated area of the County. By incorporating the
most up-to-date building and safety standards, the County will be able to ensure that its Strategic
Goals are fully addressed.

FISCAL IMPACT/FINANCING

There will be minimal impact on expenditures for the Department of Public Works (Public Works) for
training its personnel. All associated costs including these training costs and the printing of the new
codes are funded from construction-related plan review and permit revenues from Fiscal Year 2010-
11.

FACTS AND PROVISIONS/LEGAL REQUIREMENTS

The State recently adopted the 2010 Edition of California Building Standards Code, which includes
the 2010 California Residential Code.

The California Health and Safety Code requires that the County adopt an ordinance that imposes the
same building standards as are contained in the 2010 California Residential Code, with the
exception that the County may make amendments to these building standards that are more
restrictive and that are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological, and/or
topographical conditions.

The enclosed ordinance incorporates, by reference, the building standards contained in the 2010
California Residential Code together with critical and necessary County amendments. In accordance
with Sections 17958.5 and 17958.7 of the Health and Safety Code, your Board of Supervisors
(Board) must determine and expressly find that the amendments to the State standards are needed
because of local climatic, geological, and/or topographical conditions.

The applicable finding(s) for each proposed amendment to the State's building standards are clearly
delineated in a chart which is set forth in the proposed ordinance. The ordinance also contains
various administrative changes that do not require special local findings.

In its continued efforts to provide consistency within the Los Angeles Basin and to provide the public



The Honorable Board of Supervisors
11/3/2010
Page 3

with locally applicable and efficient codes, Public Works has, again, joined efforts with a majority of
the cities within the County to undergo thorough examination of previous and proposed amendments
to the building standards published by the State. Many of the proposed local amendments to the
State Code are based on the model language generated by the Los Angeles Regional Uniform Code
Program. This Regional Program has the support of all 88 cities and the County. The goal of these
multijurisdictional groups is to minimize differences in Code language and interpretation within the
region, thereby assisting the local construction industry by unifying and streamlining the permitting
process.

Health and Safety Code Section 17958 and 18941.5 require that all amendments, together with the
unamended portions of the California Residential Code, become effective 180 days after the
publication of the California Building Standards Code. The State has established that date to be
January 1, 2011. Accordingly, it is recommended that your Board establish the operative date of the
amendments, together with the unamended portions of the California Building Standards Code, to be
January 1, 2011. The proposed amendments will then become operative when your Board's findings
are filed with the State of California Building Standards Commission.

In accordance with the requirements of Government Code Section 50022.3, your Board must
schedule a public hearing after the first reading of the title of the adopting ordinances. Notice of the
hearing is required to be published pursuant to Government Code 6066. A copy of the California
Residential Code must be on file with the Executive Office at least 15 days preceding the hearing
and made available for public inspection.

A sample, notice is submitted herewith.

ENVIRONMENTAL DOCUMENTATION

Adoption of this ordinance is exempt from the California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) in that it
can be seen with certainty that there is no possibility that the ordinance may have a significant effect
on the environment pursuant to State CEQA Guidelines Section 15061(b)(3). The adoption of the
proposed ordinance is covered by the general rule that CEQA applies only to projects that have the
potential for causing a significant effect on the environment. The adoption of the proposed
ordinances does not have such potential.

IMPACT ON CURRENT SERVICES (OR PROJECTS)

Other departments embarking on construction projects will be required to comply with the provisions
of these ordinances if applications for permits to begin construction are submitted on or after the
operative date of these ordinances.

Copies of the proposed code changes were circulated to professional associations within the design
and construction communities for review and comments. Public Works has carefully evaluated the
comments received as a result of the review and has incorporated those changes into the
ordinances, where appropriate.

CONCLUSION




The Honorable Board of Supervisors
11/3/2010
Page 4

Upon approval of the enclosed ordinance, please return one adopted copy of this letter and one
adopted copy of the ordinance to the Department of Public Works, Building and Safety Division.

Respectfully submitted,

GAIL FARBER
Director

GF:RP:l

Enclosures

C: Chief Executive Office
County Counsel
Executive Office
Department of Regional Planning
Fire Department



ANALYSIS

This ordinance adds new Title 30 - Residential Code to the Los Angeles County
Code. Title 30 incorporates by reference portions of the 2010 California Residential
Code, published by the California Building Standards Commission, with certain changes
and modifications.

State law requires that the County adopt ordinances that contain the same
requirements as are contained in the building standards published in the California
Residential Code. State law allows the County to change or modify these requirements
only if it determines that such changes or modifications are reasonably necessary
because of local climatic, geological, or topographical conditions.

The changes and modifications to requirements contained in the building
standards published in the 2010 California Residential Code which are contained in this
ordinance are based upon express findings, contained in the ordinance, that such
changes are reasonably necessary due to local climatic, geological, or topographical
conditions.

Title 30 also incorporates by reference certain administrative provisions
contained in Title 26 - Building Code.

ANDREA SHERIDAN ORDIN
County Counsel

il A N ——

By
MARK T. YANAI
Principal Deputy County Counsel
Property Division

MTY:vn

03/10/10 (Requested)

10/18/10 (Revised)

HOA.684523.11



ORDINANCE NO.

An ordinance adding Title 30 — Residential Code to the Los Angeles County
Code, relating to the adoption of the 2010 California Residential Code by reference, with
certain changes and modifications.

The Board of Supervisors of the County of Los Angeles ordains as follows:

SECTION 1. Title 30 is hereby added to read as follows:

TITLE 30
RESIDENTIAL CODE

CHAPTER 1
ADMINISTRATION

R100 ADOPTION BY REFERENCE

Except as hereinafter changed or modified, Sections 102 through 119 of
Chapter 1, Section 1207 of Chapter 12, Chapters 34, 67, 69, 98, 99, and Appendix J of
Title 26 of the Los Angeles County Code are adopted by reference and incorporated
into this Title 30 as if fully set forth below, and shall be known as Sections 102 through
119 of Chapter 1, Section 1207 of Chapter 12, Chapters 34, 67, 69, 98, 99, and
Appendix J of Title 30 of the Los Angeles County Code.

Except as hereinafter changed or modified, Chapters 2 through 10, Chapter 44,
and Appendix H of that certain code known and designated as the 2010 California
Residential Code as published by the California Building Standards Commission are

adopted by reference and incorporated into this Title 30 as if fully set forth below, and

HOA.684523.11



shall be known as Chapters 2 through 10, Chapter 44, and Appendix H of Title 30 of the
Los Angeles County Code.

A copy of the 2010 California Residential Code shall be at all times maintained
by the Building Official for use and examination by the public.

R101 TITLE, PURPOSE, AND INTENT

R101.1 Title. Title 30 of the Los Angeles County Code shall be

known as the "Residential Code For One And Two Family Dwellings," may be cited as
such, and will be referred to herein as "these regulations” or "these building standards"
or "this Code."

R101.2 Purpose and Intent. The purpose of this Code is to provide

minimum standards to preserve the public safety, health, and welfare by regulating the
design, construction, installation, quality of materials, use, occupancy, location, and
maintenance of all buildings, structures, grading, and certain equipment as specifically
set forth herein. Consistent with this purpose, the provisions of this Code are intended
to confer a benefit on the community as a whole and are not intended to establish a
duty of care toward any particular person.

This Code shall not be construed to hold the County of Los Angéles or any
officer, employee, or agent thereof responsible for any damage to persons or property
by reason of any inspection authorized herein or by reason of the issuance or non-
issuance of any permit authorized herein, and/or for any action or omission in
connection with the application and/or enforcement of this Code. By adopting the

provisions of this Code, the County does not intend to impose on itself, its employees,

HOA.684523.11 2



or agents any mandatory duties of care toward persons and property within its
jurisdiction so as to provide a basis of civil liability for damages.

This Section is declaratory of existing law and is not to be construed as
suggesting that such was not the purpose and intent of previous Code adoptions.

R101.3 Scope. The provisions of this Code shall apply to the

construction, alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, use
and occupancy, location, removal, demolition, and grading of detached one- and two-
family dwellings and townhouses not more than three stories above grade plane in
height with a separate means of egress and their accessory structures within the
unincorporated territory of the County of Los Angeles and to such work or use by the
County of Los Angeles in any incorporated city.

Exception: Live/work units complying with the requirements of Section 419 of
Title 26 of the Los Angeles County Building Code shall be permitted to be built as one-
and two-family dwellings or townhouses. Fire suppression otherwise required by
Section 419.5 of Title 26 of the Los Angeles County Building Code for buildings and
structures constructed under this Code shall conform to Section 903.3.1.3 of Title 26 of
the Los Angeles County Building Code.

Additions, alterations, repairs, and changes of use or occupancy in all buildings
and structures to which this Title 30 applies shall comply with the provisions for new
buildings and structures except as otherwise provided in Section 109 and Chapter 34 of

Title 26 of the Los Angeles County Building Code.

HOA.684523.11 3



R101.4 APPLICABILITY

R101.4.1 General.

Where there is a conflict between a general requirement and a specific
requirement, the specific requirement shall be applicable. Where, in any specific case,
different Sections of this Code specify different materials, methods of construction, or
other requirements, the most restrictive shall govern.

R101.4.2 Other laws.

The provisions of this Code shall not be deemed to nullify any provisions of local,
state, or federal law.

R101.4.3 Referenced codes and standards.

The codes and standards referenced in this Code shall be considered part of the
requirements of this Code to the prescribed extent of each such reference. Where
differences occur between provisions of this Code and referenced codes and standards,
the provisions of this Code shall apply.

SECTION 2. Section R301.1.3.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R301.1.3.2 Woodframe structures-greater-than-two-stories.

The bBuilding eOfficial shall require construction documents to be approved and
stamped by a California licensed architect or engineer for all dwellings of woodframe

construction more than two stories and basement in height located in Seismic Design

Category A, B, or C. Notwithstanding other sections, the law establishing these

provisions is found in Business and Professions Code sections 5537 and 6737.1.

HOA.684523.11 4



The Building Official shall require construction documents to be approved and

stamped by a California licensed architect or engineer for all dwellings of wood frame

construction more than one story in height or with a basement located in Seismic

Design Category Do, D4, or D,.

SECTION 3. Section R301.1.4 is hereby added to read as follows:

R301.1.4 Seismic design provisions for buildings constructed on

or into slopes steeper than one unit vertical in three units horizontal (33.3 percent

slope).

The design and construction of new buildings and additions to existing buildings

when constructed on or into slopes steeper than one unit vertical in three units
horizontal (33.3 percent slope) shall comply with Section 1613.9 of the 2011 County of
Los Angeles Building Code.
. SECTION 4. Section R301.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:
R301.2 Climatic and geographic design criteria.

Buildings shall be constructed in accordance with the provisions of this Code as

limited by the provisions of this sSection. Additional-criteria-shall-be-established-by-the-
lecaurisdiction-and-setferthConsult with the Building Official regarding additional
criteria in Table R301.2(1).

HOA.684523.11 5



SECTION 5. Section R301.2.2.2.5 is amended to read as follows:

R301.2.2.2.5 Irregular buildings.

1. When exterior shear wall lines or braced wall panels are not in one plane

vertically from the foundation to the uppermost story in which they are required.

HOA.684523.11 6



2. When a section of floor or roof is not laterally supported by shear walls or
braced wall lines on all edges.

Exception: Portions of floors that do not support shear walls or braced wall
panels above, or roofs, shall be permitted to extend no more than six feet ‘(1829 mm)
beyond a shear wall or braced wall line.

3. When the end of a braced wall panel occurs over an opening in the wall
below and ends at a horizontal distance greater than 1 foot (305 mm) from the edge of
the opening. This provision is applicable to shear walls and braced wall panels offset in
plane and to braced wall panels offset out of plane as permitted by the exception to

item 1 above.

HOA.684523.11 7



4. When an opening in a floor or roof exceeds the lesser of 12 feet
(3658 mm) or 50 percent of the least floor or roof dimension.

5. When portions of a floor level are vertically offset.

SECTION 6. Section R301.2.2.3.5.1 is hereby added to read as follows:

R301.2.2.3.5.1 AlISI S230, Section B1. (Modify AISI S230, Section B1 to

read as follows:)

Where No. 8 screws are specified, the required number of screws in a steel-to-
steel connection shall be permitted to be reduced in accordance with the reduction
factors in Table B1-1 when larger screws are used or when the sheets of steel being
connected are thicker than 33 mils (0.84 mm). When applying the reduction factor, the

resulting number of screws shall be rounded up.

HOA.684523.11 8



SECTION 7. Section R322.1.4.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R322.1.4.1 Determination of design flood elevations.

2. Determine the design flood elevation in accordance with accepted
hydrologic and hydraulic engineering practices used to define special flood hazard
areas. Determinations shall be undertaken by a registered design-professionalcivil
engineer who shall determine that the technical methods used reflect currently accepted
engineering practice. Studies, analyses, and computations shall be submitted in
sufficient detail to allow thorough review and approval.

SECTION 8. Section R322.2.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R322.2.2 _ Enclosed area below design flood elevation. Enclosed

areas for attached and detached building and structures, including crawl spaces, that

are below the design flood elevation shall:

SECTION 9. Section R327 is hereby amended to read as follows:
SECTION R327
MATERIALS AND CONSTRUCTION METHODS FOR EXTERIOR WILDFIRE
EXPOSURE

NOTE: This Chapter has been amended by Los Angeles County and is

applicable to all occupancy groups.

HOA.684523.11 9



SECTION 10. Section R327.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:
R327.1.1 Scope.
This eChapter applies to building materials, systems, and or assemblies used in

the exterior design and construction of new buildings, and to additions, alterations, or

repairs made to existing buildings, erected, constructed, located, or moved within a

Wildland-Urban Interface Fire Area as defined in Section R327.2.
SECTION 11. Section R327.1.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:
R327.1.3. Application.

New buildings, and any additions, alterations, or repairs made to existing

buildings located in or moved within any Fire Hazard Severity Zone within State

Responsibility Areas or any Wildland-Urban Interface Fire Area designated by the

enfereing-ageneyLos Angeles County Fire Department constructed after the application
date shall comply with the provisions of this eChapter.

Exceptions:

SECTION 12. Section R327.1.3.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.1.3.1 Application date and where required.
New buildings for which an application for a building permit is submitted on or

after July 1, 2008, and any additions, alterations, or repairs made to existing buildings

for which an application for a building permit is submitted on or after January 1, 2011,

HOA 684523.11 10



located in any Fire Hazard Severity Zone or Wildland Interface Fire Area shall comply

with all sSections of this eChapter, including all of the following areas:

Exceptions:

1. NewbBuildings located in any Fire Hazard Severity Zone within State
Responsibility Areas, for which an application for a building permit is submitted on or
after January 1, 2008, shall comply with all sSections of this eChapter.

2. . NewbBuildings located in any Fire Hazard Severity Zone within State
Responsibility Areas or any Wildland Interface Fire Area designated by cities and other
local agencies for which an application for a building permit is submitted on or after
December.1, 2005, but prior to July 1, 2008, shall ‘only comply with the following

. sSections of this eghapter:

SECTION 13. Section R327.1.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.1.4 Inspection and certification.

1. Building permit issuance. The leeatbBuilding eQOfficial shall, prior to
construction, provide the owner or applicant a certification that the building as proposed
to be built complies with all applicable state and local building standards, including
those for materials and construction methods for wildfire exposure as described in this
Chapter. Issuance of a building permit by the leealbBuilding eQOfficial for the proposed

building shall be considered as complying with this sSection.

HOA.684523.11 11



2. Building permit final. The leeatbBuilding eQfficial shall, upon completion
of construction, provide the owner or applicant with a copy of the final inspection report
that demonstrates the building was constructed in compliance with all applicable state
and local building standards, including those for materials and construction methods for
wildfire exposure as described in this Chapter. Issuance of a certificate of occupancy
by the leealbBuilding eOfficial for the proposed building shall be considered as
complying with this sSection.

SECTION 14. Section R327.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

SECTION R327.2
DEFINITIONS

FIRE PROTECTION PLAN is a document prepared for a specific project or
development proposed for a Wildland-Urban Interface Fire Area. It describes ways to
minimize and mitigate potential for loss from wildfire exposure. The Fire Protection Plan

shall be in accordance with this eChapter and the CaliferniaLos Angeles County Fire

Code Title 32, Chapter 49. When required by the enforcing agency for the purposes of

granting modifications, a fire protection plan shall be submitted. —Onlylecally-adeopted-

FIRE HAZARD SEVERITY ZONES are geographical areas designated pursuant
to California Public Resources Code Ssections 4201 through 4204 and classified as

HOA.684523.11 12



Very High, High, or Moderate in State Responsibility Areas or as Local Agency Very
High Fire Hazard Severity Zones designated pursuant to California Government Code

sections 51175 through 51189. See CaliferniaLos Angeles County Fire Code, Article-

86Chapter 49.

HEAVY TIMBER. A type of construction classification specified in Section 602 of

the CalifernialLos Angeles County Building Code. For use in this Chapter, heavy timber

shall be sawn lumber or glue laminated wood with the smallest minimum nominal
dimension of 4 inches (102 mm). Heavy Timber walls or floors shall be sawn or glue-

laminated planks splined, tongue-and-grove, or set close together and well spiked.

WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE FIRE AREA is a geographical area identified
by the state as a "Fire Hazard Severity Zone" in accordance with the Public Resources
Code Ssections 4201 through 4204 and Government Code Ssections 51175 through

51189, or other areas designated by the enforeing-ageneyl.os Angeles County Fire

Department to be at a significant risk from wildfires.
SECTION 15. Section R327.3.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:
R327.3.2 Qualification by testing.
Material and material assemblies tested in accordance with the requirements of
Section R327.3 shall be accepted for use when the results and conditions of those tests

are met. Product evaluation testing of material and material assemblies shall be

HOA.684523.11 13



approved or listed by the State Fire Marshal, the Building Official or identified in a

current report issued by an approved agency.
SECTION 16. Section R327.3.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:
R327.3.3 Approved agency.
Product evaluation testing shall be performed by an approved agency as defined

in Section 1702 of the CaliferniaLos Angeles County Building Code. The scope of

accreditation for the approved agéncy shall include building product compliance with
eCode.

SECTION 17. Section R327.3.5.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.3.5.2 Weathering.

Fire-retardant-treated wood-and-Fire-retardant-treated-wood-shingles-and-shakes
shall meet the fire test performance requirements of this Chapter after being subjected
to the weathering conditions contained iﬁ the following standards, as applicable to the
materials and the conditions of use.

SECTION 18. Section R327.3.5.2.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.3.5.2.1 Fire-retardant-treated wood.

Fire-retardant-treated wood shall be tested in accordance with ASTM D2898,
"Standard Practice for Accelerated Weathering of Fire-Retardant Treated Wood for Fire
Testing (Method A)" and the requirements of sSection 2303.2 of the

GaliferniaLos Angeles County Building Code.

HOA.684523.11 14



SECTION 19. Section R327.3.5.2.2 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

SECTION 20. Section R327.3.6 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.3.6 Alternates for materials, design, tests, and methods of
construction.

The enforcing agency is permitted to modify the provisions of this eChapter for
site-specific conditions in accordance with Chapter 1, Section +-44-2.4104.2.7. When

required by the enforeing-ageneyBuilding Official for the purposes of granting

modifications, a fire protection plan shall be submitted in accordance with the

CalifernialLos Angeles County Fire Code, Chapter 49.

SECTION 21. Section R327.4.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.4.3 Alternative methods for determining Ignition-resistant
material.

2. Fire-retardant-treated wood. Fire-retardant-treated wood identified for

exterior use that complies with the requirements of sSection 2303.2 of the

GCaliforniaLos Angeles County Building Code.

HOA.684523.11 15




SECTION 22. Section R327.5.2. is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.5.2 Roof coverings.

Roof coverings shall be Class A as specified in Section 1505.2. Where the roof

profile allows a space between the roof covering and roof decking, the spaces shall be
constructed to prevent the intrusion of flames and embers, be firestopped with approved
materials or have one layer of minimum 72 pounds (32.4 kg) mineral-surfaced non-
perforated cap sheet complying with ASTM D 3909 installed over the combustible

decking._Wood shingles and wood shakes are prohibited in any Fire Hazard Severity

Zones reqgardless of classification.

SECTION 23. Section R327.6.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.6.1 General.

Where provided, ventilation openings for enclosed attics, enclosed eave soffit
spaces, enclosed rafter spaces formed where ceilings are applied directly to the
underside of roof rafters, and underfloor ventilation shall be in accordance with

Section 1203 of the CaliferniaLos Angeles County Building Code and sSections

R327.6.1 through R327.6.3 of this sSection to resist building ignition from the intrusion
of burning embers and flame through the ventilation openings.

SECTION 24. Section R327.6.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Exceptions:

HOA.684523.11 16



1. The enforcing-agencyBuilding Official may accept or approve special eave

and cornice vents that resist the intrusion of flame and burning embers.

2. Vents complying with the requirements of Section R327.6.2 may be
installed on the underside of eaves and cornices in accordance with either one of the
following conditions:

2.1. The attic space being ventilated is fully protected by an automatic
sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 of the

GaliforniaLos Angeles County Building Code or,

SECTION 25. Section R327.10.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:
R327.10.2 Applicability.

Exceptions:

2. Awnings and canopies shall comply with the requirements of Section 3105

of the Galifernial.os Angeles County Building Code.

SECTION 26. Section R327.10.3.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R327.10.3.2 When required by the enfereing-ageneyBuilding Official,

detached accessory structures within 50 feet of an applicable building shall comply with

the requirements of this sSection.

HOA.684523.11 17



SECTION 27. Section R327.10.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:
R327.10.4. Requirements.

When required by the enforeingageneyBuilding Official, accessory structures

shall be constructed of noncombustible or ignition-resistant materials.
SECTION 28. Section R401.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R401.1 Application.

Wood foundations in Seismic Design Category Do, D4, or D, shall be-designed-in-

accordance-with-accepted-engineeringpracticenot be permitted.

Exception: In non-occupied, single-story, detached storage sheds and similar

uses other than carport or garage, provided the gross floor area does not exceed

200 square feet, the plate height does not exceed 12 feet in height above the grade

plane at any point, and the maximum roof projection does not exceed 24 inches.

SECTION 29. Section R403.1.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:
R403.1.2 Continuous footing in Seismic Design Categories Dy, D4,
and D,.

The braced wall panels at exterior walls of buildings located in Seismic Design

Categories Dy, D1, and D, shall be supported by continuous footings. All required

interior braced wall panels in buildings with-plan-dimensions-greaterthan 50-feet (15240
mm)-shall alse-be supported by continuous footings.

HOA.684523.11 18



SECTION 30. Section R403.1.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R403.1.3 Seismic reinforcing.

Exception: In detached one- and two-family dwellings located in Seismic

Design Category A, B, or C which are three stories or less in height and constructed

with stud bearing walls, plain concrete footings without longitudinal reinforcement
supporting walls, and isolated plain concrete footings supporting columns or pedestals
are permitted.

SECTION 31. Section R403.1.5 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R403.1.5 Slope.

The top surface of footings shall be level. The bottom surface of footings shall be
permitted to have a slope not exceeding one unit vertical in 10 units horizontal (10-
percent slope). Footings shall be stepped where it is necessary to change the elevation
of the top surface of the footing or where the surface of the ground slopes more than
one unit vertical in 10 units horizontal (10-percent slope).

For structures located in Seismic Design Categories Dy, D1, or D, stepped

footings shall be reinforced with two No. 4 deformed reinforcing bars located at the top

and bottom of the footings as shown in Figure R403.1.5.

HOA.684523.11 19




RECOMMEND: 4 > b
b 20

] < GRADE

Ml .

STEPPED FOUNDATIONS

FIGURE R403.1.5

STEPPED FOOTING

SECTION 32. Section R404.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R404.2 Wood foundation walls.
Wood foundation walls shall be constructed in accordance with the provisions of

Sections R404.2.1 through R404.2.6 and with the details shown in Figures R403.1(2)

and R403.1(3)._Wood foundation walls shall not be used for structures located in

Seismic Design Category Do, D4, or Do.

SECTION 33. Section R501.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R501.1 Application.

The provision of this eChapter shall control the design and construction of the
floors for all buildings including the floors of attic spaces used to house mechanical or

plumbing fixtures and equipment_weighing less than 400 pounds and maximum height

of 4 feet above the floor or attic level.

HOA.684523.11 20




SECTION 34. Section R503.2.4 is hereby added to read as follows:

R503.2.4 Openings in horizontal diaphragms.

Openings in horizontal diaphragms with a dimension perpendicular to the joist

that is greater than 4 feet (1.2 m) shall be constructed in accordance with Figure

R503.2.4.

/m PLYWOOD SHEATHING
DIAPHRAGM OPENING

DOUBLE JOISTS, TYP.

METAL TIE 1684 x 1 125 408 MINL,, (4 TOTALY , w2 L
W 1816 COMMON NAILG AS SHOWN. - < V"

- r 5 7
. b N
- ~Dige W i ’

METAL TIE 1684 x 1 12" x {OPENING WIDTH « 407 MiN.,
{2 TOTAL) W 24-16d CONMON NAILS

For 8k ¥insch =254 mm. | foot = 304.8 mun.

Figure R503.2.4

a. Blockings shall be provided beyond headers.
b. Metal ties not less than 0.058 inch [1.47 mm (16 galvanized gage)] by
1.5 inches (38 mm) wide with eight 16d common nails on each side of the header-joist

intersection. The metal ties shall have a minimum yield of 33,000 psi (227 MPa).

HOA.684523.11 21



C. Openings in diaphragms shall be further limited in accordance with

Section R301.2.2.2.5,

SECTION 35. Section R602.3.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R602.3.2 Top plate.

Exception: In other than Seismic Design Category Do, D4_or D, aA single top

plate may be installed in stud walls, provided the plate is adequately tied at joints,
corners and intersecting walls by a minimum 3-inch-by-6-inch by a 0.036-inch-thick
(76 mm by 152 mm by 0.914 mm) galvanized steel plate that is nailed to each wall or
segment of wall by six 8d nails on each side, provided the rafters or joists are centered
over the studs with a tolerance of no more than 1 inch (25 mm). The top plate may be
omitted over lintels that are adequately tied to adjacent wall sections with steel plates or
equivalent as previously described.

SECTION 36. Table R602.3(1) is hereby amended to read as follows:

TABLE R602.3(1)

FASTENER SCHEDULE FOR STRUCTURAL MEMBERS

HOA.684523.11 22



TABLE B602.3(1}

FASTENER SCHEDULE FOR STRUCTURAL MEMBERS

HUMBER AND TYFE OF
TEM DESCRIPTION OF BUILDING ELEMENTS FASTENER™S® SPACING OF FASTENERS
Roof
1 Blocking between joists or rafters to top plate, toe nail A-8d (24 x 01137 —
2 Ceiling joists to plate, tos nait 3-8d (24,7 % 0. 113" —
3 Ceiling joists not attached to parallel rafier, laps over partitions, 310
- face nail o -
4 Cotlar tie rafter, face mail or 1%, X 20 gage ridge strap 3-10d (37 = 01128 —
5 Rafter fo plate, toe pail 2-16d (3 < L1387 —
Roof rafters to ridge. valley or hip rafters:
& toe mail (31,7 = 0.133") —
face nail - 37 0135 —
Wall
7 Built-up comer studs 10d (37 > 6.128%) 24" 0.8
3 Built-up header, two pisces with "," spacer 16 (34" % 0.135™) 16" a.c. along each adge
& Comtinued header, two pisces 16d (3157 2 0.13587) 16" 0.c. along each edge
Y Comtinnous header to stud, toe nail A8 (24,7 = 0113 —
£ Boable studs, face nail 10d 3" = (128"} 24" v,
12 Blouble top plates, face uail 1 (3 % 6,128 24" o.c.
i3 Duouble top plates. minkmum 48-inch offset of end Jjoints, 8-16d (34" % 0.1357) .
face nail in lapped aren
14 Sole plate to joist or blocking. face nail 16d (34, % 0.135™) & Q..
t5 Sole plate to joist or blocking at hraced wall panels 3-16d 34, x 0,135 16" v
. 3-8 {3, = 0.113%) —
16 Stud to sole plate, toe il oF
2-16d 3157 % 0. 1355 —
17 Top or sole plate to stud, end nail 2-16d 34,7 w (135" —
I8 Top plates, laps at corners and intersections, face nail 2-HM (37 2 0.128") —
y B (24,7 % 01137 —_
19 1” brace to each stud and plate, face nail 2 sg (“ fa % C;E,i, 4
2 staples 13/, —
o s . . 2-8d 12157 EEAT —
20 17 x 8" sheathing 10 each bearing, face nail Si u 2 * !: E ,E !
b 2 staples 134 —
. . . . 2-8d (24,7 D 1ESY) —
B &g ] R , . v ) p3 -]
21 17 % 8" sheathing 10 each bearing, fuce nuil 3 staples 1%/, B
22 Wider than 17 8" sheathing to each bearing. face nail 3-8d (22U, % 01137 —
- 4 staples 134,” —
Floor
22 Joist tex sitl or girder, toe nail 384724, x0,113%) —
2-8d (2147 % 0.1137 —
24 17 % 8” subfloor or less toeach joist. face nail 8‘; i ¢ a;azl ef ;}3 }1} ! _
25 27 subfloor to joist or girder, blind and face nail 2-1od €314, = UL L35 —
26 Rims joist o top plate, toe pail {roof applications also} R (24,7 = 01137 5 nie.
27 27 plands éplenk & beam — floor & reef) 2-16d 34,7 = 0135y at sach bearing
Nait zach tayer s follows:
. . . . 32" o.e. at top and bottorn and
28 - ders ams. 2-inch lon ayers od (3% 6,128 4 .
25 Built-up girders and beams. 2-inch lymber layers 1 {3 < G.1287) stagsered. Two nuails at ends
and at each splice.
29 Eedger strip supporting joists or rafters 3-16d (314" = .1358") At each joist or rafter

HOA.684523.11

{eontinged)

23




HOA.684523.11

TABLE RB602.3{1}—continued
FASTENEF SCHEDULE FOR STRUCTURAL MEMBERS

SPACING OF FASTENERS
Intermediate
DESCREIPTION OF SUNLDING Edges suppors®®
TEM WMATERIALS DESCRIPTION OF FASTENERR ©» {inches) @inches)
Wood structural panels, subfloor, roof and interior wall sheathing to framing and particlehoard wall sheathing to framing
10 e e Bd comunon (272 8.113") nail {subfloar wall¥ ‘ ™
. R 8d common (2457 % 6.1317) nail (oot ) -
3l T Bd common {27 % 0.1 [3") nail {subfloar, walli s 12
) Hem &d common (21, % 8.15317) nail {roof)f -
32 L 8d common nait {2}, < £.1317} 12 128
13 U 13d commen (3% x 3.148™) mail or & 2
ot L - LE . P
oo 8d (24" % 6.131"} deformed nail
Other wisli sheathing”
2 " structeral cellulosic | Y, galvanized rocfing sail, 7" crown or |7 2 6
- fiberboard sheathing crown staple 16 ga., 19," long -
15 " stwuctural celtubosic | 13, galvanized roofing natl, %" crown or 17 5 5
. fiberbaard sheathing crown staple 16 ga., 11" long - b
‘,i T . th 145" galvanized roofing nail; staple galvanized .
4, sum sheathing? 2 B : £ rall; staple g B 2 .
3 : &P ® 1Y long; 1Y, screws, Type War 8 ’
! g # : 134,% glavanized ronofing nail; staple galvanized
37 5" wypsum sheathing? g & g naul; staple g d 7 7
- s BYP ¥ 155" long: 157 screws, Type Wor § ! ’
Woed structural panels, combination subfloor underlayment to kaming
» 6d deformed (27 < 0,120 pail or
38 %" and less " e s [ 12
4 &d common (24,7 x 8.1317) nail
) qen 8d common (2157 % 0.131"y nail or
39 EARY e " e 2
% s 8d deformed (24, % 0,120 nail & !
1ir - 10d common §37 x 0,148 mail ar
40 LT AGI 2) - ; . ) 12
o0 8d deformed {2Y," % 0.120°) rail -

For 85It 1 inch=25.4 num, | Foot = 304.8 mm, 1 mile per hoar = 0.447 mufs: Thsi = 6.895 MPa.

1. Al pails are smuoth-common, box or deformed shanks except where otherwiss stated. Nails used for framing and sheathing connections shall have minimum
average bending yield strengths as shown: B0 ks For shank dismeter of 6.192 inch 20d common nail), 90 ksi for shank diamerers larger than €.142 inch bt not
larges than £.177 inch, and 100 kei for shank diameters of 00842 inch or less.

1 Staples are 16 gage wire and have & minimum ¥, -inch on dismeter crown width.

. Nails shall 3 spaced at not meoe than & inches on conter at all supports where spans are 48 inches orgreater.

Four-fout-by-S-Foot or 4-fook-by-9-foot pansls shall be applied »wrtizally.

. Spacing of fasteners notinchuded in this table shall be based on Tuble RH02.

I

o

.

. For regions having basic wind speed of L1 0mphor greater, $d defarmed §24,” » (3.1 205 nails shall be used for attaching plywocd and wood structural panel mof
sheathing to framing within minimum 48-inch distance from gable eod walls. if mean roof height is more than 25 feet. up to 35 fest maimum.

2. Forregionshaving basic wind speed of 100 mphor less, nadls for atteching wood strectaral panel rood sheathing 1o gable end wall framing shall be spaced & inches
on center. Whean basic wind speed is greater then 160 mph, nails for attaching panel rrof sheathing to intermediate supparts shall be spaced 6 inches on conter for
miimum 48-inch distance from ridges, saves and gable end walls; and 4 inches on center to gable end wall framing.

h. Gypsum sheathing shell conforn 0 ASTM € 1396 and shall be installed in accordance with GA 253, Biberbourd sheathing shall v onform to ASTM C 2%,

. Spacing of fastenerson floor sheathing panel edges applies 1o panel edges supported by framing members and requized blocking and at all fleor pesimeters only.
Spacing of R onyoof sheathing paned edges applies 1 panel edges supported by framing members and required blocking. Blocking of roof or floar sheath-
ing panel edges perpendicalar to the framing membersnead nothe provided except as required by other provisicns of this code, Floor perimneter shall be supporied
by framing members or solid blocking.

i. Use of staples in braced wall panels shall be prohibited in Seismic Design Cateqory DO, D1, or D2,

ol 3

=1

24



SECTION 37. Table R602.3(2) is hereby amended to read as follows:

TABLE R602.3(2)
ALTERNATE ATTACHMENTS

b. Staples shall have a minimum crown width of 7/16-inch on diameter

except as noted._Use of staples in roof, floor, subfloor, and braced wall panels shall be

prohibited in Seismic Design Category Dy, D1, or Ds.

SECTION 38. Table R602.10.1.2(2) is hereby amended to read as follows:

HOA.684523.11 25



TARLE R602.10.1.2(2)*>*

BRACING REQUIREMENTS BASED ON SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY

{AS A FUNCTION OF BRACED WALL LINE LENGTH}

SOIL CLASS D°
WALL HEIGHY = 10 FT

10 PSF FLOOR DEAD LOAD
15 PSF ROOFICEILING DEAD LUDAD

MMM TOTAL LENGTH toot) OF BRACED WALL PANELS REQUARED

BRACED WALL LINE SPACING = 25 FT ALONG EACH BRACED WALL LINE
Beismic Design Meothods d
Category Bracod Wall DWB, SFB, 5B, Continuous
{3DC} Story Location Lime Length Method LiB PBES, PCR, HPS Method WSP Sheathing
SDC Aand B Exampt from Solamic Roquirements
and Dotached Dwellings in € Use Tahle B502.10.1.2{1} for Bracing Requirements

10 25 2.5 L6 14

20 50 5.0 32 23

0 7.5 7.5 48 41

40 104 10.0 6.4 54

125 125 85 6.8

10 NP 4.3 30 26

20 NP 9.4 6.0 5.1

SDCC 30 NP 13.5 9.0 1.7
44 NP 18.0 120 102

50 NP 225 150 128

10 NP 6.0 45 EK:

20 NP 12.0 2.0 17

30 Np 18.0 13.5 115

40 NP 24.0 184 153

50 NP 0.0 225 19.1

10 NP S8 6.0 2.0 1.7

20 NP &g 120 49 34

30 NP 55 180 6.0 5.1

40 NP 426~ 240 8.0 6.8

50 NP 45— 300 100 8.5

10 NP & WP 45 3.8

20 NP 1248 NP 9.5 13

SDC Dy or I 20 NP +i-g- WP 135 115
40 NP 2 WP 180 153

50 NP - WP 225 19.1

10 NP &5 MP 8.0 5.1
20 NP 474 ME 12,6 192
a0 NP 25:5- NP 180 15.3
ﬁ 40 NP H44- ME 24.0 04
S0 NP LE. 0.0 255

{cantinued )
HOA.684523.11 26




TABLE R$02.10.1.2(2)" b c—<zontinued
BRACING REQUIREMENTS BASED ON SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY
{AS A FUNCTION OF BRACED WALL LINE LENGTH)

SO CLASS D=
WALL HEIGHT = 10 FT
10 PSF FLCOA DEAD LOAD
15 PEF ROOFCEILING DEAD LOAD MUNSEUM TOTAL LENGTH {fent) OF BRACED WALE PANELS BEQUIRED
BEACED WALL LINE SPALING » 25 FT ALONG i\fj"‘” BRACED WALL LINE
Seismic Doslgn METHODS DWS,
Category Braced Wak SFB. GB. PES. PCP, Contingous
{80C) Siory Location Line Length Kothod LIB HPS Mathod WEP Sheathing
10 NP 44 80 25 2.1
20 NP 54 1680 54 43
W0 NP 42 240 75 6.4
46 NP 46 320 10.0 .5
56 NP 260 400 125 10.6
16 NP x5 WP 55 43
20 NP 55 NP 11.3 9.4
SDC Dy 30 NP 225 WP 16.5 140
40 NP 355 WE 220 187
56 NP 335 ME 27.5 234
iy NP NP NP NE
26 NP NP NP NP
; 30 NP NF NP NP
@ 40 NP NP NP NP
56 NP NP NP NP

For SE | foot = 3.8 mm. | pound per square foot= 4788 Pa

2. Wall bracing lengths are based on a soil sits chass “D.” Interpolation of bracinglength beteeen the S values associated with the seisnyic design categorbes shell be
permitted when a site-specific Sy, vatue 1s determined s accordunce with Section 16125 of the Calffomic Building Cade.

b. Foundation cripple wall panels shall be brced fn soccedance with Section RE02.10.9,

c. Methods of braving shall be as described in Sections R60G2.10.2, R6D2. 134 and RG02.10.5.

d. Methods 58 and PCP braced wall panel hiv ratio shall not exceed 1:1 in SDC DO, 01, ot D2, Methods BB, SFB, PBS, and HPS are not permitted
inSbC D3, D1, or D2,

HOA 684523.11 27




SECTION 39. Table R602.10.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

TABLE R602.10.2 a
INTERMITTENT BRACING METHODS ~
METHOD MATERIAL FENIMUM THICKNESS FIGURE COMNECTION CRITERIA
MR
b 4 woed or approved metal 7 Wood: 2-8d nails per stud
LiB Lat-in-bracing straps at 457 10 60° angh?? for including top mnd bottom plate
maxinnmm 167 stod spacing L - — metal: per manafacturer
TN . ool i
o . I o 47 (17 nominal) 2-8d (247 X G.F3Y) nails
Dw3 Diagonal wood boards for maximum 247 stad spacing or 2 staptes, 1%,” per stud
For-exterior-sheatbims-8d common (2 172" x 0.151) nails of 87
" Wood structural paned Mg g rmon 3 4 22435 spacing (panel edne) &t 12" spacing
wSsp ¢see Section Ré(d) 5 1582 ~For-tntertorshreatiring. (intermediste supports), 208" edue
-seeTable RGO distance to panel edge.
N,
T e 114" gaivanized roofing nails or
SFE Structural L ar 2.7 for muxhmum §6° 8d conunon (24,” % €.131) nails
fiberboand sheathing stud spacing at 3" spacing ipanel edges) at 67
] e spacing (imermediate supports}
Nails or screws at 7" spacing at
e panel adges including tap and
i - bottom plates; for ali braced wall
aB Gypsum board L _ pm\?i Jcna!xon.s for exterior
’ : sheathing nail or screw size, see
—— N Tuble R&02.3(1); for interior
gypsunt board nail ar serew size,
see Table R702.3.5
145" palvanized roofing nails or
PES Particleboard sheathing | %" or '4” for maximum (6" 8d common (24, % 6.131) nails
¢{see Section R6QS) stud spacing at 37 spacing {panel odges) at 6
spacing {intermediate supports)
pos R — .
e 2 P47 1Y gage, 7\ head nails at
PCP Portland cement See Section R703 6 6" spaving or
i plaster For maximum 16" stud spacing ty". 16 gage staples at 67
o] ] spaving b
00927 dia., 0.225" head nails
i e with length to accommodate
HFS H‘“dt?;;jgpaml 1Y;" penetration into stads at 47
SRE For maximum 16 stud spacing spacing {panel edges), ar 87
spacing (intermediate supports}
ABW Alternate braced See Section R602,10.3.2 See Section R602.16.3.2
Intermittent portal o oo A 16 - .
PFH frame See Section R602,1(13.3 See Section R602.10.3.3
PFG 1““"““‘:‘:';;‘::;:“ frame|  g.o Section R602.10.3.4 See Section R6G2.16.3.4

2. Methods GB and PCP braced wall panel hivy ratio shall not exceed 1.1 in SDC DG, D1, or D2.

not permitted in SPC DO, D1, and D2,

b. Use of staples in braced wall panels shall be prohibited in SDC DO, D1, or D2,

HOA.684523.11

28

Methods LIB, DWB, SFB, PBS, HPS, and PFG are




SECTION 40. Figure R602.10.3.2 is amended to read as follows:

Top plates shall be continuous over a braced wall

/ panel

SECTION 41. Section R602.10.3.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R602.10.3.3 Method PFH: Portal frame with hold-downs.

1. Each panel shall be fabricated in accordance with Figure R602.10.3.3.
The wood structural panel sheathing shall extend up over the solid sawn or glued-
laminated header and shall be nailed in accordance with Figure R602.10.3.3. A spacer,
if used with a built-up header, shall be placed on the side of the built-up beam opposite
the wood structural panel sheathing. The header shall extend between the inside faces
of the first full-length outer studs of each panel. One anchor bolt not less than 5/8-inch-
diameter (16 mm) and installed in accordance with Section R403.1 .’6 shall be provided
in the center of each sill plate. The hold-down devices shall be an embedded-strap
type, installed in accordance with the manufacturer's recommendations. The panels
shall be supported directly on a foundation that is continuous across the entire length of
the braced wall line. The foundation shall be reinforced as shown on Figure
R602.10.3.2. This reinforcement shall be lapped not less than 4524 inches (384610
mm) with the reinforcement required in the continuous foundation located directly under

the braced wall line.

HOA.684523.11 29




SECTION 42. Figure R602.10.3.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

EXTENT OF HEADER
DOUBLE PORTAL FRAME {TW0 BRAOED WALL PAMELS)
i ]
: : I'IIII . G

= il o
N ) FASTEN TOP PLATE TOHEADER WITH TWO \Sﬁ A Tﬁ""“‘mw‘&%ﬁé‘“ HIN
] ROWS OF 180-SINKER HAILS AT 2 D.C. TYR, oLe~]li construenny N
- b ¥ i i
. -\ B STRAP OFPOSITE SHEATHING R ;
" \ FOR APANEL SPLIGE 11 o
N : WEEIIED), PANEL s o
i | FASTEN SHEATHING TO HEADER WITH 80 COMMON SR {iFaemsss g'_mu_ se B, Il
MaX. N CHARLS IN 3 GRID PATTERN AS SHOWN AND BLOCKED, AND-OCCUR i M
HeEeHT ] ¥ 0.C. N ALL FRAMING {STUDS, BLOCIKING AND SRLZ TYR. ITHIN 542 DF J1D- e 1l
w X N 24 HEIGHT. ONE RDW OF |ds e

: : _ = _ TYP. SHEATHING-TO- jdo 3.
' | -MINWIDTH = 45° FOR ONE STORY STRUCTURE A FRAMING NSILING 15 1 i
o & ] EA=at ; RRT at ."'I REQUIRED. |u» A
5 : IF 224 BLOCKING IS K
i A ,f . USED, THE 2x#'S UST |4 o
I BE NALED TOGETHER | M

R SN FIY

X g B FRANING " WITH 3 160 SINKERS [{s NI
i T smenin. THICKNESS WOOD I iR Wi
i 1 STRUCTURAL PAHEL SHEATHING + \ i N
X 4 = MiN. 4200 LB TIE-DOWH DEVICE {EMBEDDED INTO i n
i 4 CONCRETE AND NAILED INTO FRAMING |y te0018 i i
b o4 -1 ks VN A L “. . afd

(1 aiw AP e b PEE I £
R HH““MBE-E SECTION RBIZ 10.2.3 DEVICE i
fIEH A
! A

FIGURE R602.10.3.3

METHOD PFH: PORTAL FRAME WITH HOLD-DOWNS AT DETACHED GARAGE

DOOR OPENINGS

SECTION 43. Table R602.10.4.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:
TABLE R602.10.4.1

CONTINUOUS SHEATHING METHODS

HOA.684523.11 30



TABLE R602.10.4.3
CONTINUQUS SHEATHING METHODS

METHOD MATERIAL JENIMUM THICKNESS FIGURE l CONMECTION CRITERIA

f .
8d Sdcommon (27 % 0.113") nails

15432" . | 816" spacing (panel edges) and
v at 127 spucing (intermediate
CS-wsp Waod structoral panel 25~ supports) or 16 ga. > 1%, staples
at 3" spacing (panel edges) and
e 67 spacing Vintermediate
suppottsiS
15432

Wood stroctural panel adjscent
C5-0G o garage openings and 25
suppoeting roof load only*®

See Method CS-WSP

See Section

CS-PF Continuous portal frame RE2164 1.1

For81:  1inch =254 nuxn, { pound per sguare foot =47 89 Pa.

a. Applies to one wall of a garage only.

b Roof covering dead londs shall be 3 paf or less.

c. Uze of staples in braced wall panels shall be prohibited in Seismic Design Catedory DO, D1, or DE.

SECTION 44. Figure R602.10.4.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

HOA.684523.11 31




{NJTENE ELEVATION

ENTENT OF HESDER [TWO BRACED Wall SEGMENMTS
G BRTENT OF HEADER JONE BRACED Wil SEGMENT!

b e B0 - TETT
PORY T
WAL BRACE b SO SRR BEOS WA
| HEGHT BRACHT: VAL, SEGIERT 8ER 807 304
g

HESDER SHMALL BE ESSTERED 10O THE KNG STUS Wi
S, 180 BMKER NALS ;
o AN TOOO AR STRAP SHALL BF CEKTESED AT -
HUTTONM OF HENDER aND (MSTALLED DN BACKSIDE

A5 BHORN D ST ELEGATIONT

BT & BRMEL BPLICE JF t&E& PAMEL EDGES SHALL
CICCLR OVER AMDY BE RAUED T COMMOM BLOTKING shEx
LR WITH WDDW 24 GF Wl HEIGHT CINE BOW 0P
304 PRAUING IS REQUIRED el EACH PANEL BOGE, o7

RO STRUCTURAL PANEL STRENGTH A5
- pnE MUIBER F STUDE SHOM

IGH’I .

- LENESTH BASED {Df& Ak HG‘L:HT’%D EENGTH RATI—

i ﬁ4" MIN ".-“-.I'IDTH

M\{kiOR BD;. PER F&Bi 2 e‘; 'Y? bt
: R ANCHOR SOLTS FER RAGE.T & kEQUl*Ei}
e P SRS PLATE WaSHER

PERTABLERGORI0AE  BUIHD I8 oveR CONCRETE OR MASONEY BLOCK FOUNDATION

N OF ALK §TLDS
PER TABLE RGOZ.511&2;

ML SOLE PLATE

- FRAMBG ANCHIZRY W INST RER
570 18 TAILE REG2.3(1}

£30 18-

WO STRUCTURML BApEL SHEATHING OVER APPROVED BAN( 3OETY .o
OVER RAISED WOGD FLOGR OF SECOND FLOOR — FRAMIMG ANCHOR OPRION

HAK SOLE MATE
To ST FER
TABLE REQRKETY

RO COwMpN NALS
Ty OGO AND POTTOR

OVER RAISED WODID FLOGR OR SECOND FIOOR — WODD STRUCTURAL PAREL OVERLAP OPFTION

1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 foor = 304.8 mm, | pound force = 4,448 N.

FIGURE R642.10.4.1.1
METHOD C5-PF: CONTINUGUS PORTAL FRAME PANEL CONSTRUCTION

For SI:

HOA 684523.11 32

SIDE ELENATION

AL 106D LB

TENEION STRAR
%TEAF’ Se1aL BE
FRED AT
EC‘TTOM iF
HEALER.

BHESTHING FILLER

. IF NEEDED

TEO GHREN
AR WIS

LA,

SHEATHING.

IVED

T

To SOALE



SECTION 45. Section R602.10.7.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

SECTION 46. Section R606.2.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:
R606.2.4 Parapet walls.
Unreinforced solid masonry parapet walls shall not be less than 8 inches
(203 mm) thick and their height shall not exceed four times their thickness.
Unreinforced hollow unit masonry parapet walls shall be not less than 8 inches
(203 mm) thick, and their height shall not exceed three times their thickness. Masonry

parapet walls in areas subject to wind loads of 30 pounds per square foot (1.44 kPa)_or

HOA.684523.11 33




located in Seismic Design Category Dg, D1, or D2, or on townhouses in Seismic Design
Category C shall be reinforced in accordance with Section R606.12.

SECTION 47. Section R802.8 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R802.8 Lateral support.

Roof framing members and ceiling joists having a depth-to-thickness ratio
exceeding 52 to 1 based on nominal dimensions shall be provided with lateral support
at points of bearing to prevent rotation. For roof rafters with ceiling joists attached per
Table R602.3(1), the depth-thickness ratio for the total assembly shall be determined

using the combined thickness of the rafter plus the attached ceiling joist.

SECTION 48. Section R802.10.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:
R802.10.2 Design.
Wood trusses shall be designed in accordance with accepted engineering

practice. The design and manufacture of metal-plate-connected wood trusses shall

comply with ANSI/TPI 1. The truss design drawings shall be prepared by a registered

HOA.684523.11 34



SECTION 49. Table R802.5.1(9) is hereby amended to read as follows:

TABLE R802.5.1(9) ,
RAFTERKCEILING JOIST HEEL JOINT CONNECTIONGs b.odath i

GROUMND SNOW LOAD {psf)
20% [ 30 | 56 | 70
Roof apa {fast)
RAFTER
naFTER | spAcHG 12 | 20 | 28 | 36 [ 12 | 20 | 28 | 26 | 12 | 20 | 20 | a6 | 12 | 26 | 2 | 36
SLOPE | {inches) Required number of 16d common nails™ ® per hoe! Joint gplices™ 2ot

12 4 6 8 10 4 6 8 | 1 5 8 iz 15 6 it 15 26

X1z 157 5 8 1 13 3 & I 14 6 il {5 28 8 14 0 26
24 7 11 15 19 7 il 16 21 9 4] 23 20 12 21 30 39

12 3 5 5 & 3 5 £ 8 4 & 9 1 5 8 12 15

$12 1 4 [ & 10 4 6 B 11 b3 B 12 15 6 1 13 20
4 5 § 12 15 3 9 i2 16 7 12 17 3 g 16 23 28

12 3 4 5 & 3 4 5 7 3 5 7 9 4 7 9 2

34z I8 3 5 6 ) 3 3 7 9 4 7 £ 12 5 9 12 18
24 4 7 s 12 4 7 10 13 6 1% 4 1 7 13 18 23

12 3 4 4 5 3 3 4 5 3 4 5 7 3 5 7 9

12 16 3 4 5 6 3 4 5 6 2 5 7 G 4 6 9 i3
24 3 5 7 9 3 5 7 g 4 7 g I3 3 b 13 17

12 3 3 4 4 3 3 3 4 3 3 4 5 3 4 5 7

&12 16 3 4 4 5 3 3 4 5 3 4 5 7 3 5 7 9
24 3 4 5 7 3 4 B 7 3 & ) 14 4 7 10 13

12 3 3 A 3 2 3 3 3 3 3 3 4 3 3 4 5

12:42 16 3 3 4 4 3 3 3 4 3 3 4 5 3 4 5 7
24 3 4 4 5 3 3 4 6 3 4 B 8 3 6 8 11t

For 8k 1inch =254 mm, | foot = 304 8 mm, | pound per sguare foct = G TGkPa.

& 46d box pails shall be permitted to be substituted for 164 common nails.

b. Nailing requirements shall be pemmitted to be reduced 23 percent iF nails are clinched.

. Heel joint connections are not required when the ridge is supported by 4 load-bearing wall, header or vidge: beam.

& When intermaedinte support of the rafter is provided by verticad struts or purding to a loadbearing will, the tabelated hezljoint o onnection requiremaents shall beper-
mitted te be reduced proportionally o the: reductico in span. :

. Equivalent natling patterns are required for celling joist 1o cetling joist lap splices.

. Whon rafter ties arc substitated for celing joists, the heel joint cannection requinsment shall be taken as the tabulated heel joint connection requircment for
tevo-thirds of the sctuat rafter-slope.

. Applizs to roof Hive load of 20 paf ar less.

. Tabulated heal jolnt connection regpirements assume thatceiling Jolstz or rafter des are bocated ot the bottom of the attic space. When velling joists or rafter ties ane
located higher in the attic, heel joint connection requirements shall be increased by the following factors:

a

e

-l el

Haoal Joini Connection
HoMa Adjustovent Factor
13 1.5
14 1.33
155 1.25
1% 1.2
10 or less 111

whete:
He = Height of ceiling joists or rafier ties measuned vertically sbove the top of the rafter support walls.
H, = Height of roof ridge measared vestically above the top of the. rafter suppart walls.

i. Edge distances, end distances and spacings for nails shall be sufficient to prevent slitting of the wwood.

HOA.684523.11 35



SECTION 50. Section R803.2.4 is hereby added to read as follows:

R803.2.4 Openings in horizontal diaphragms.

Openings in horizontal diaphragms shall conform with Section R503.2.4.
SECTION 51. Section R1001.3.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:
R1001.3.1 Vertical reinforcing.

For chimneys up to 40 inches (1016 mm) wide, four No. 4 continuous vertical

bars_adequately anchored into the concrete foundation shall be placed between wythes

of solid masonry or within the cells of hollow unit masonry and grouted in accordance
with Section R609. Grout shall be prevented from bonding with the flue liner so that the
flue liner is free to move with thermal expansion. For chimneys more than 40 inches
(1016 mm) wide, two additional No. 4 vertical bars shall be provided for each additional
flue incorporated into the chimney or for each additional 40 inches (1016 mm) in width
or fraction thereof.

SECTION 52. The provisions of this ordinance contain various changes,
modifications, and additions to the 2010 Edition of the California Residential Code.
Some of these changes are administrative in nature in that they do not constitute
changes or modifications to requirements contained in the building standards published
in the California Building Standards Code.

Pursuant to California Health and Safety Code sections 17958.5, 17958.7, and
18941.5, the Board of Supervisors hereby expressly finds that all of the changes and
modifications to requirements contained in the building standards published in the

California Building Standards Code, contained in this ordinance, which are not

HOA.684523.11 36



administrative in nature, are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological,

or topographical conditions in the County of Los Angeles as more particularly described

in the table set forth below.

Code Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

R301.1.3.2

Geological

After the 1994 Northridge Earthquake, the Wood Frame
Construction Joint Task Force recommended that the
quality of wood frame construction needs to be greatly
improved. One such recommendation identified by the
Task Force is to improve the quality and organization of
structural plans prepared by the engineer or architect so
that plan examiners, building inspectors, contractors, and
special inspectors may logically follow and construct the
presentation of the seismic force-resisting systems in the
construction documents. For buildings or structures
located in Seismic Design Category Do, D4, Do, or E that
are subject to a greater level of seismic forces, the
requirement to have a California licensed architect or
engineer prepare the construction documents is intended
to minimize or reduce structural deficiencies that may
cause excessive damage or injuries in wood frame
buildings. Structural deficiencies such as plan and vertical
irregularities, improper shear transfer of the seismic force-

‘resisting system, missed details or connections important

to the structural system, and the improper application of
the prescriptive requirements of the California Residential
Code can be readily addressed by a registered design
professional.

R301.1.4

Geological
Topographical

This technical amendment is for buildings constructed on
hillsides. Due to the local topographical and geological
conditions of the sites within the greater Los Angeles
region and their susceptibility to earthquakes, this
amendment is required to address and clarify special
needs for buildings constructed on hillside locations. A
joint Structural Engineers Association of Southern
California (SEAOSC), Los Angeles County, and

Los Angeles City Task Force investigated the performance
of hillside building failures after the Northridge earthquake.
Numerous hillside failures resulted in loss of life and

HOA.684523.11

37



Code Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

millions of dollars in damage. These criteria were
developed to minimize the damage to these structures and
have been in use by the City and County of Los Angeles
for several years.

R301.2.2.2.5

Geological

Due to the high geologic activities in the Southern
California area and the expected higher level of
performance on buildings and structures, this local
amendment limits the type of irregular conditions as
specified in the 2010 California Residential Code. Such
limitations are recommended to reduce structural damages
in the event of an earthquake. The cities and county of the
Los Angeles region have taken extra measures to maintain
the structural integrity of the framing of the shear walls and
all associated elements when designed for high levels of
seismic loads.

R301.2.2.3.5.1

Geological

The term "one" in AISI S230, Section B1 conflicts with
Table B1-1, whereas in the table it states the "thinnest
connected steel sheet.”" The term "one" in the AISI S230,
Section B1 language can misleadingly be interpreted as -
though one of the sheets can be 33 mils and the other
sheet thicker, but that you still qualify for a reduction factor;
this is not the intent of the tables. For example, in a steel-
to-steel connection consisting of a 33 mils and 44 mils,
and if in any part of the code it is required to provide (4)
No. 8 screws; according to Table B1-1 the factor 1.0 would
apply to the required number of screws and thus a
reduction of screws would not be allowed.

R322.1.41

Geological
Topographical

This amendment is intended to clarify who should perform
studies and analyses for design flood elevations. Based
on our vast experience with drainage and grading sites, we
have concluded that registered civil engineers are highly
equipped to perform such design and analyses.

R327

Climatic

States that Chapter R327 requirements are applicable to
all occupancy groups as wildfire exposure impacts all
types of buildings and structures. This amendment is
needed due to the high-fire severity zones caused by low
humidity, strong winds and dry vegetation.

R327.1.1

Climatic

Clarifies the application of Chapter R327 to include
additions, alterations, and/or relocated buildings.
Additions, alterations, and/or relocated buildings have the
same fire risk as new buildings.

HOA.684523.11

38




Code Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

R327.1.3

Climatic

Clarifies the application of Chapter R327 to include
additions, alterations, and/or relocated buildings.
Additions, alterations, and/or relocated buildings have the
same fire risk as new buildings.

R327.1.3.1

Climatic

Clarifies the application of Chapter R327 to include
additions, alterations, and/or relocated buildings. Additions,
alterations, and/or relocated buildings have the same fire
risk as new buildings.

R327.3.5.2

Climatic

Due to low humidity, strong winds, and dry vegetation in
high-fire severity zones, the Fire Department could not find
sufficient evidence to allow the use of wood-shingle/wood-
shake roof.

R327.3.5.2.2

Climatic

Due to low humidity, strong winds and dry vegetation in
high-fire severity zones, the Fire Department could not find
sufficient evidence to allow the use of wood-shingle/wood-
shake roof.

R327.4.3

Climatic

Due to low humidity, strong winds, and dry vegetation in
high-fire severity zones, the Fire Department could not find
sufficient evidence to allow the use of wood-shingle/wood-
shake roof.

R327.5.2

Climatic

Due to low humidity, strong winds, and dry vegetation in
high-fire severity zones, the Fire Department could not find
sufficient evidence to allow the use of wood-shingle/wood-
shake roof and would require the use of Class A roof
covering.

R401.1

Geological

Wood foundations, even those that are preservative-
treated, encounter a higher risk of deterioration when
contacting the adjacent ground. The required seismic
anchorage and transfer of lateral forces into the foundation
system necessary for 2-story structures and foundation
walls could become compromised at varying states of
wood decay. In addition, global structure overturning
moment and sliding resistance is reduced when utilizing
wood foundations as opposed to conventional concrete or
masonry systems. However, non-occupied, single-story
storage structures pose significantly less risk to human
safety and should be able to utilize the wood foundation
guidelines specified in this Chapter.

R403.1.2
R403.1.3
R403.1.5

Climatic
Geological

This proposed amendment requires minimum
reinforcement in continuous footings and stepped footings
to address the problem of poor performance of plain or
under-reinforced footings during a seismic event. This
amendment reflects the recommendations by the

HOA.684523.11

39




Code Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

Structural Engineers Association of Southern California
(SEAOSC) and the Los Angeles City Joint Task Force that
investigated the poor performance observed in the 1994
Northridge Earthquake. This proposed amendment is a
continuation of an amendment adopted during previous
code adoption cycles. Interior walls can easily be called
upon to resist over half of the seismic loading imposed on
simple buildings or structures. Without a continuous
foundation to support the braced wall line, seismic loads
would be transferred through other elements such as non-
structural concrete slab floors, wood floors, etc. Requiring
interior braced walls be supported by continuous
foundations is intended to reduce or eliminate the poor
performance of buildings or structures.

R404.2

Climatic
Geological

No substantiating data has been provided to show that
wood foundations are effective in supporting structures
and buildings during a seismic event while being subject to
deterioration caused by presence of water in the soil as
well as other materials detrimental to wood foundations.
Wood foundations, when they are not properly treated and
protected against deterioration, have performed very
poorly and have led to slope failures. Most contractors are
typically accustomed to construction in dry weather in the
Southern California region and are not generally familiar
with the necessary precautions and treatment of wood that
makes it suitable for both seismic events and wet
applications. With the higher seismic demand placed on
buildings and structures in this region, coupled with the
dryer weather conditions here as oppose to the northern
and eastern part of the country, it is the intent of this
proposal to take the necessary precautionary steps to
reduce or eliminate potential problems that may result from
the use of wood footings and foundations that does not
take into consideration the conditions of this surrounding
environment.

R501.1

Geological

There is no limitation for weight of mechanical and
plumbing fixtures and equipment in the CRC Code.
Requirements of ASCE 7-05 and CBC are necessary that
limits equipment weight up to 400 pounds, mounted at 4
feet or less above the floor or attic level without
engineering design.

HOA.684523.11

40




Code Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

R503.2.4

Geological

Section R502.10 of the Code does not provide any
prescriptive criteria to limit the maximum floor opening size
nor does Section R503 provide any details to address the
issue of shear transfer near larger floor openings. With the
higher seismic demand placed on buildings and structures
in this region, it is important to ensure that a complete load
path is provided to reduce or eliminate potential damages
caused by seismic forces. Requiring blocking with metal
ties around larger floor openings and limiting opening size
is consistent with the requirements of Section
R301.2.2.2.5.

602.3.2

Geological

The cities and county of the Los Angeles region have
taken extra measures to maintain the structural integrity of
the framing of the shear walls when designed for high
levels of seismic loads by eliminating single top plate
construction. The performance of modern day braced wall
panel construction is directly related to an adequate load
path extending from the roof diaphragm to the foundation
system.

Table R602.3(1)

Geological

In September 2007, limited cyclic testing data was
provided to the ICC Los Angeles Chapter Structural Code
Committee showing that stapled wood structural shear
panels do not exhibit the same behavior as the nailed
wood structural shear panels. As a matter of fact, the test
results of the stapled wood structural shear panels
appeared much lower in strength and drift than the nailed
wood structural shear panel test results. Therefore, the
use of staples as fasteners for shear walls sheathed with
other materials shall not be permitted without being
substantiated by cyclic testing. This proposed amendment
is a continuation of an amendment adopted during
previous code adoption cycles for the California Building
Code.

Table R602.3(2)

Geological

In September 2007, limited cyclic testing data was
provided to the ICC Los Angeles Chapter Structural Code
Committee showing that stapled wood structural shear
panels do not exhibit the same behavior as the nailed
wood structural shear panels. As a matter of fact, the test
results of the stapled wood structural shear panels
appeared much lower in strength and drift than the nailed
wood structural shear panel test results. Therefore, the

HOA.684523.11

41




Code Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

use of staples as fasteners for shear walls sheathed with
other materials shall not be permitted without being
substantiated by cyclic testing. This proposed amendment
is a continuation of an amendment adopted during
previous code adoption cycles for the California Building
Code.

Table
R602.10.1.2(2)

Geological

Due to the high geologic activities in the Southern
California area and the expected higher level of
performance on buildings and structures, this local
amendment continues to reduce/eliminate the allowable
shear values for shear walls sheathed with lath, plaster, or
gypsum board. The poor performance of such shear walls
sheathed with other materials in the 1994 Northridge
Earthquake was investigated by the Structural Engineers
Association of Southern California (SEAOSC) and the

Los Angeles City Task Force. The cities and county of the
Los Angeles region have taken extra measures to maintain
the structural integrity of the framing of the shear walls
when designed for high levels of seismic loads. In
addition, this proposed amendment is consistent with the
conventional framing provisions of the 2010 California
Building Code.

Table
R602.10.2

Geological

3/8" thick 3 ply-plywood shear walls experienced many
failures during the Northridge Earthquake. This proposed
amendment specifies minimum WSP sheathing thickness
and nail size and spacing so as to provide a uniform
standard of construction for designers and buildings to
follow. This is intended to improve the performance level
of buildings and structures that are subject to the higher
seismic demands placed on buildings or structure in this
region. This proposed amendment reflects the
recommendations by the Structural Engineers Association
of Southern California (SEAOSC) and the Los Angeles
City Joint Task Force that investigated the poor
performance observed in 1994 Northridge Earthquake.
This proposed amendment is a continuation of an
amendment adopted during previous code adoption cycles
for the California Building Code. In September 2007,
cyclic testing data was provided to the structural code
committee showing that stapled wood structural shear
panels do not exhibit the same behavior as the nailed

HOA.684523.11

42




Code Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

wood structural shear panels. In addition, the test results
of the stapled wood structural shear panels appeared
much lower in strength and drift than the nailed wood
structural shear panel test results.

Figure
R602.10.3.2

Geological

3/8" thick 3 ply-plywood shear walls experienced many
failures during the Northridge Earthquake. The poor
performance of such shear walls sheathed in the 1994
Northridge Earthquake was investigated by the Structural
Engineers Association of Southern California (SEAOSC)
and the Los Angeles City Task Force. Box nails were
observed to cause massive and multiple failures of the
typical 3/8" thick 3 ply-plywood during the Northridge
Earthquake. The cities and county of the Los Angeles
region have taken extra measures to maintain the
structural integrity of the framing of the shear walls when
designed for high levels of seismic loads. The proposal for
minimum lap splice requirement is consistent with Section
12.16.1 of ACI 318-05. The performance of modern day
braced wall panel construction is directly related to an
adequate load path extending from the roof diaphragm to
the foundation system. This proposed amendment
continues amendments adopted during the previous code
cycle for the California Building Code.

R602.10.3.3

Geological

The proposal to change the minimum lap splice
requirement is consistent with Section 12.16.1 of ACI 318-
05.

Figure
R602.10.3.3

Geological

3/8" thick 3 ply-plywood shear walls experienced many
failures during the Northridge Earthquake. The poor
performance of such shear walls sheathed in the 1994
Northridge Earthquake was investigated by the Structural
Engineers Association of Southern California (SEAOSC)
and the Los Angeles City Task Force. The cities and
county of the Los Angeles region have taken extra
measures to maintain the structural integrity of the framing
of the shear walls when designed for high levels of seismic
loads. Box nails were observed to cause massive and
multiple failures of the typical 3/8-inch thick plywood during
the Northridge Earthquake. This proposed amendment
continues amendments adopted during the previous code
cycle for the California Building Code.

HOA.684523.11

43




Code Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

Table
R602.10.4.1

Geological

3/8" thick 3 ply-plywood shear walls experienced many
failures during the Northridge Earthquake. The poor
performance of such shear walls sheathed in the 1994
Northridge Earthquake was investigated by the Structural
Engineers Association of Southern California (SEAOSC)
and the Los Angeles City Task Force. The cities and
county of the Los Angeles region have taken extra
measures to maintain the structural integrity of the framing
of the shear walls when designed for high levels of seismic
loads. This proposed amendment continues the previous
amendment adopted during the 2007 code adoption cycle
for the California Building Code. In September 2007,
limited cyclic testing data was provided to the ICC

Los Angeles Chapter Structural Code Committee showing
that stapled wood structural shear panels do not exhibit
the same behavior as the nailed wood structural shear
panels. As a matter of fact, the test results of the stapled
wood structural shear panels appeared much lower in
strength and drift than the nailed wood structural shear
panel test results. Therefore, the use of staples as
fasteners for shear walls sheathed with other materials
shall not be permitted without being substantiated by cyclic
testing. This proposed amendment is a continuation of an
amendment adopted during previous code adoption
cycles.

Figure
R602.10.4.1.1

Geological

3/8" thick 3 ply-plywood shear walls experienced many
failures during the Northridge Earthquake. The poor
performance of such shear walls sheathed in the 1994
Northridge Earthquake was investigated by the Structural
Engineers Association of Southern California (SEAOSC)
and the Los Angeles City Task Force. The cities and
county of the Los Angeles region have taken extra
measures to maintain the structural integrity of the framing
of the shear walls when designed for high levels of seismic
loads. This proposed amendment continues the previous
amendment adopted during the 2007 code adoption cycle
for the California Building Code. The proposal in which
"washers shall be a minimum of 0.229 inch by 3 inches by
3 inches in size" is consistent with Section R602.11.1 of
the 2010 California Residential Code and Section
2308.12.8 of the 2010 California Building Code.

HOA.684523.11

44




Code Section

Condition

Explanation of Amendment

R602.10.7.1

Geological

The performance of modern day braced wall panel
construction is directly related to an adequate load path
extending from the roof diaphragm to the foundation
system. Interior braced wall panels, therefore, are also
directly dependent upon the adequacy of the foundation
system. In addition, the proposed amendment for Section
R403.1.2 specifies that all exterior walls and required
interior braced wall panels in buildings shall be supported
with continuous footings.

R606.2.4

Geological

The addition of the word "or" will prevent the use of
unreinforced parapets in Seismic Design Category Dy, Dy,
or Dy, or on townhouses in Seismic Design Category C.

Table
R802.5.1(9)

Geological

The number of nails required for the heel joint connection
per Table R802.5.1(9) can be excessive depending on the
rafter slope, spacing, and roof span. This footnote will
help to prevent splitting of connecting wood members
when large numbers of nail are required as stated in the
National Design Specification for Wood Construction
(NDS).

R802.8

Geological

This proposed amendment provides provisions to ensure
that the ends of wood members and the points of bearing
have adequate lateral support to prevent rotation and to
help stabilize the members during construction. This
proposed amendment is consistent with and similar to
requirements contained in the NDS.

R802.10.2

Geological

Wood trusses are engineered structural elements that
require engineered design and calculations. This
amendment provides clarifications that all wood truss
design drawings are to be prepared by a registered
professional.

R803.2.4

Geological

Section R802 of the Code does not provide any
prescriptive criteria to limit the maximum size of roof
openings, nor does Section R803 provide any details to
address the issue of shear transfer near larger roof
openings. With the higher seismic demand placed on
buildings and structures in this region, it is important to
ensure that a complete load path is provided to reduce or
eliminate potential damage caused by seismic forces.
Requiring blocking with metal ties around larger roof
openings and limiting the size of openings is consistent
with the requirements of Section R301.2.2.2.5.

HOA.684523.11

45




Code Section Condition Explanation of Amendment
R1001.3.1 Geological The performance of fireplaces/chimneys without

anchorage to the foundation has been observed to be
inadequate during major earthquakes. The lack of
anchorage to the foundation results in overturn or
displacement.

SECTION 53. This ordinance shall become operative on January 1, 2011.

[30RESBLDNGMYCC]

HOA.684523.11

46






